Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 1:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: FWD REF: TBA //LKK REF: CC4/FWD20003027/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SDT67E(FWD) AND SMF2098U ON 20/02/2020] -Part 2/2

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Insured’s GIA is available in Merimen.
Please proceed with DS.

Thank you.

Regards,
Josey

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 12:27 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: FWD REF: TBA //LKK REF: CC4/FWD20003027/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDT67E(FWD)
AND SMF2098U ON 20/02/2020] -Part 2/2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Part 2/2.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 12:25 PM

To: 'josey.loh@fwd.com' <josey.loh@fwd.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FWD REF: TBA //LKK REF: CC4/FWD20003027/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDT67E(FWD) AND SMF2098U
ON 20/02/2020] -Part 1/2




Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
Attached is a copy of third party video footage for your easy reference. (Part 1/2)

Please advise if insured had reported. If so, kindly upload in Merimen for our viewing and advise if we may proceed
DS.

Thank you.

...CLAIM EUBFULDER---IPending for Survey Repori

T R S T
Seek Mandate from Insurer Jli Edit Adjuster Rpt >

7 i Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed
( (Mot Notdfied] | 4 Feb 2020 00:00 Last:IA | 5
T poess B e
feference Claim Detalls
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjus
lrmr! |Lau Tze Ying, 10: 572438448 o
Hm ﬂamnt | WOO JUN JIE, MARVIN (HU J‘UN!‘IE}. 1D: 590047430 i )
Vehicle Fl.ﬂ. No.: SMF2098U | Date of Loss: | 2070272020 00:00 -
v . | PHPY2016-000005380
Cllnn'l'\-p-r i _.":' :Pabcy.l’cwurﬂm i | Coverage: 05/01/20
Vehicle Reg. No. 1 . .
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(insured): ! | il
Repairer; | Advance Auto Garage i,'HQ} 23 KAKI BUKIT i\fEHLIE 4 =04-01 AAS KAKI BUKIT CENTRE, 115&33 Kaki B-uht - Tel:
Handling Insurer: IF'.H'D Salnpup-:re Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5'?'30 - [Handled by Josey Luh]
Clumui's lneu'er | NTUC Incomse Insurance Co-operative I.td I{HQ] Tel:
A.d;m-- | LKK Auto cunsultnnu Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel: 6255- 3561 . .. [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 04/03/2020]
.Thtfe are no mail fur H\ls case.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ATTENTION:
The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the
sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy
or store this email and any attachments.
Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
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attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been
scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



