Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: May 6, 2020 3:59 PM

To: BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBJ4020P - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XE 2118X AND GBJ 4020P

ON 19/02/2020 - LKK REF CC4/LPC20003025/Gha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the matter above.

We have our principal ‘s mandate to offer at 20% in view of no evidence to prove that our Insured reversed or
rolled back.

Hence, we propose a settlement at a global sum of $280.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 March, 2020 3:14 PM

To: Ng Boon Kai

Cc: Admin A; Suhelmi Bin Suharman; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBJ4020P - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XE 2118X AND GBJ 4020P ON
19/02/2020 - LKK REF CC4/LPC20003025/Gha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Boon Kai,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
1



We will get back to you for an update in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FESES

SeERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when recessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ng Boon Kai [mailto:BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com]

Sent: Friday, 6 March, 2020 2:40 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Suhelmi Bin Suharman

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBJ4020P - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XE 2118X AND GBJ 4020P ON
19/02/2020 - LKK REF CC4/LPC20003025/Gha3

Hi Vic,

Please find attached scene photo for your refer.

Thank you,
Regards,

Boon Kai
Executive
Motor Claims Operation

ETHCZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

22 Tampines Street 92 Singapore 528876
DID: 6654 7617 | Fax: 6654 7648
Website: www.ethozgroup.com
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From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, March 6, 2020 2:30 PM

To: Ng Boon Kai <BoonKai.Ng@ethozgroup.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: GBJ4020P - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XE 2118X AND GBJ 4020P ON
19/02/2020 - LKK REF CC4/LPC20003025/Gha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Boon Kai,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XE 2118X AND GBJ 4020P ON 19/02/2020
We refer to the above matter.

Our Insured driver reported that there was no collisiion between botth vehicles. There is no conclusive evidence
yet to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident
report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI
we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance
until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) your client have to support your claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F ESES

SeERER W Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee
named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use,
dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by
mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before
opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has
been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed
in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group.
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