Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg

Sent: April 6, 2020 3:17 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); dd.hashim@dingauto.sg; 'Kelly Ding’; ‘Ding Ding Auto'; 'taxiscs'
Subject: RE: 50112455 / SHA8942D - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:13/02/2020)

- LKK REF CC4/FCI20002948/Eha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Good Day to you
Dear Jasper,

Offer accepted, please send us the DV for the payment process.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Shinah

Motor Claims Officer
Ding Automotive Pte. Ltd.
DID: 9239 4128

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 6 April 2020 9:06 AM

To: Claims@dingautomotive.com.sg; dd.hashim@dingauto.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 50112455 / SHA8942D - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:13/02/2020) - LKK REF
CC4/FCI120002948/Eha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $990.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the

sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,



Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]|

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February, 2020 9:16 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Claims@dingautomotive.com.sg; dd.hashim@dingauto.sg; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: 50112455/ SHA8942D - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:13/02/2020)

Dear Steve,

Noted with thanks.

Thank You
Best Regards,

Guang

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp : 93299929

Office : 62657130

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 8:36 PM

To: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Cec: Claims@dingautomotive.com.sg; dd.hashim@dingauto.sg; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: 50112455 / SHA8942D - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:13/02/2020)

***WARNING! THIS EMAIL ORIGINATES FROM OUTSIDE ST ENGINEERING. ***
Dear Guang,

We confirm the finalize $612.54 (P/P, before GST). 2 repair days.

Thanks.



Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 6:38 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cec: Claims@dingautomotive.com.sg; dd.hashim@dingauto.sg; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); SUR;
CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: 50112455 / SHA8942D - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:13/02/2020)

Dear Steve,
Please see below for the finalize according to our conversion to finalize for SHA8942D

Please refer attachment Estimate & After Paint for SHA8942D

Part By Part

Total Repair — 02 Days
Labour = $400

S/N =§75

Parts = $137.54
L+S+P =$612.54

Total Finalize Amount = $612.54

Thank You

Best Regards,

Guang

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp : 93299929

Office : 62657130



Virus-free. www.avast.com




