Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February, 2020 10:05 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; 'claims'

Subject: FW: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving
SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15 *** LKK REF : CC3/AIG20002917/Kea3

Attachments: REG 31.07.13.pdf

Categories: HMK

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan
Please see the attachment for the supporting docs.

Net Book Value : S 79,800.88

Calculation for net book value of Motor vehicle
EHBOTS3X
Reg on 31,/7/2013

(A} MV Cost 76272500
75 § 95503.00
(B} PAFR Value 12.4598.00
05 § T7498.50

cy Depreciation value=A - B

W Cost % 95,503.00

Less PARF Value % T,.49330 § 85,004.20
(D) Acc depreciate = C*days/2920)

Depreciate value 28,004 20

Days T3 2MI2015 521 2920]

Acc dep*(Value/days) 15,702.12
(E} NBV =A-D

- MW Cost $ 95503.00

Less-Acc Depreciate % 1570212 § 79,800.38

Pv cost

Vehicle price  38,953.40
register fee 140.00
COE 51,810.00
Custom duty 3,999 60
taxi meter 5600.00

95,505.00



Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 February, 2020 12:06 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on
02.01.15 *** LKK REF : CC3/AIG20002917/Kea3

Dear Wai Yin,

Please provide book value and supporting docs.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 February, 2020 2:33 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on
02.01.15

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan
Any updates on the survey report?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308



*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 6 January, 2020 10:43 AM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on
02.01.15

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan

Enclosed is estimate marking for your action.
Kenneth’s survey on 03.02.2015 @ 3.30pm.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 6 January, 2020 9:55 AM

To: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on
02.01.15

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir
Can we check the above case, the survey report had send to AIG Insurance?

Enclosed is the GIA report for your easy reference.



Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash [mailto:Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 3 January, 2020 12:09 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ms. Wai Yin,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE REGISTRATION NUMBER SGJ7933B & SHB9753X ON 2 JANUARY 2015 AT THE JUNCTION OF
LOWER DELTA ROAD & TIONG BAHRU ROAD.

Thanks. Can we have a copy of the survey report.

THE CONTENTS OF THIS LETTER SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED
AND/OR INSURERS. WE MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US.

ANY SETTLEMENT IS SUBJECT TO YOUR CLIENT’S SUBMISSION OF DULY COMPLETED DISCHARGE VOUCHER AND SOLICITOR TO
MEET ALL REGULATORY REQUIREMENTS.

Y.Jegaprakash

AlG

Major Loss Adjuster

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1758
jegaprakash.yogarajah@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more




IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage
arising in any way from its use.

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, January 2, 2020 5:45 PM

To: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash <Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B &
SHB9753X on 02.01.15

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Without Prejudice

Dear Prakash
Please see the below attachment for the photos.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash [mailto:Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 2 January, 2020 11:15 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: #5862208839SG003#015# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ms. Wai Yin,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE REGISTRATION NUMBER SGJ7933B & SHB9753X ON 2 JANUARY 2015 AT THE JUNCTION OF
LOWER DELTA ROAD & TIONG BAHRU ROAD.

| refer to your demand letter of December 27, 2019.

Please let us have the following for our further consideration:
1. Damaged photos of SHB9753X

2. Post repair photos of SHB9753X

3. Survey report (pre and post-repair)

THE CONTENTS OF THIS LETTER SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED
AND/OR INSURERS. WE MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US.



ANY SETTLEMENT IS SUBJECT TO YOUR CLIENT’S SUBMISSION OF DULY COMPLETED DISCHARGE VOUCHER AND SOLICITOR TO
MEET ALL REGULATORY REQUIREMENTS.

Y.Jegaprakash

AlG

Major Loss Adjuster

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1758
jegaprakash.yogarajah@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage
arising in any way from its use.

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, December 31, 2019 4:37 PM

To: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash <Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: #5862208839SG003# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X
on 02.01.15

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Without Prejudice

Dear Prakash

Enclosed is our LOD for your action.

Original hard copy will mailed to you by post.
Hope to receive your offer soon.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department



TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash [mailto:Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 27 December, 2019 10:20 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: #5862208839SG003# [TCS REF: AAD1501-018] -Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ms. Wai Yin,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE REGISTARTION NUMBER SGJ7933B & SHB9753X ON 2 JANUARY 2015 AT THE JUNCTION OF
LOWER DELTA ROAD & TIONG BAHRU ROAD.

Further to our today telecom, we unable to locate the demand letter in connection with your company’s property damage
(SHB9753X) claim.

Please let us have the quantification and all supporting documents for our consideration.

THE CONTENTS OF THIS LETTER SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS AN ADMISSION OF LIABILITY ON THE PART OF OUR INSURED
AND/OR INSURERS. WE MAINTAIN FULL RESERVATION OF RIGHTS AND ALL DEFENCES AVAILABLE TO US.

ANY SETTLEMENT IS SUBJECT TO YOUR CLIENT’S SUBMISSION OF DULY COMPLETED DISCHARGE VOUCHER AND SOLICITOR TO
MEET ALL REGULATORY REQUIREMENTS.

Y.Jegaprakash

AlIG

Major Loss Adjuster

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1758
jegaprakash.yogarajah@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more




IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage
arising in any way from its use.

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2019 4:12 PM

To: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash <Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com>

Cc: Ng, Hai-Chuan <Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com>; Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] BLOCKED ATTACHMENT: FW: #5862208839SG005# BLOCKED ATTACHMENT: FW: TCS REF:
AAD1501-018--Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15 - 5862208839SG

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

This email contained an attachment that is potentially malicious. To protect the AIG network and users, the
attachment named image006.png,image003.wmz.gz,image003.wmz.wmf was removed from the email. If you
believe that this is a legitimate email from a trusted source, please contact either the sender or your helpdesk to
have the message resent in compliance with the corporate electronic messaging standard.

Please be aware that SPAM and other malicious email often have a forged sender to make it appear to be sent from
someone on your contact list or otherwise trust.

Without Prejudice

Dear Prakash
Please refer to the above subject matter, are there any offer making to us?

Enclosed is the police final result for your attention, action had been taken against to your client of causing death by
negligent act.

Hope to receive your offer as soon as possible due to the time-bar period is approaching.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 5:24 PM

To: 'Ng, Hai-Chuan' <Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com>

Cc: 'Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com' <Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com>; 'Tan, Bennie-WZ' <Bennie-
WZ.Tan@aig.com>




Subject: FW: #5862208839SG005# BLOCKED ATTACHMENT: FW: TCS REF: AAD1501-018--Accident involving
SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15 - 5862208839SG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear all
Please refer to the below email, are there any offer making to us?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

xl
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This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash [mailto:Jegaprakash.Yogarajah@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 November, 2018 4:49 PM

To: Ng, Hai-Chuan <Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com>; waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg

Cc: PRDSG.DFILE <PRDSG.DFILE@aig.com>

Subject: #5862208839SG005# BLOCKED ATTACHMENT: FW: TCS REF: AAD1501-018--Accident involving SGJ7933B &
SHB9753X on 02.01.15 - 5862208839SG

Received with thanks.

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan

Sent: Thursday, November 01, 2018 4:11 PM

To: Yogarajah, Jegaprakash

Cc: 'Ng Wai Yin'

Subject: FW: BLOCKED ATTACHMENT: FW: TCS REF: AAD1501-018--Accident involving SG17933B & SHB9753X on
02.01.15 - 5862208839SG

Claim No: 5862208839SG003
Hi Prakash,

FYA.

Regards,

Ng Hai Chuan

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
9



Tel +(65)6419 1994| Fax +68357416

Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies
or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for
any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, November 01, 2018 3:54 PM

To: Ng, Hai-Chuan

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: BLOCKED ATTACHMENT: FW: TCS REF: AAD1501-018--Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on
02.01.15

This email contained an attachment that is potentially malicious. To protect the AIG network and users, the
attachment named image004.wmz.gz,image004.wmz.wmf was removed from the email. If you believe that
this is a legitimate email from a trusted source, please contact either the sender or your helpdesk to have the
message resent in compliance with the corporate electronic messaging standard.

Please be aware that SPAM and other malicious email often have a forged sender to make it appear to be
sent from someone on your contact list or otherwise trust.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hai Chuan

Please refer to the above mention case, may | know any offer to us?
Enclosed the traffic police final result for your attention.

Hope to receive your offer soon.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

/""Cﬂg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

10



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 6:36 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1501-018--Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
No record found in our system.

Please verify.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 5:50 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1501-018--Accident involving SGJ7933B & SHB9753X on 02.01.15

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam
We are making a claim against the owner of SGJ 7933B.
We would like to check are there any offer to us?

Attached the TPR for your investigation, action is being taken against your client SGJ 7933B for causing death by
negligent act.

Hope you can review this matter and let us have your best offer.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

xl
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This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
_ © www.avg.com
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