4/30/2020 Mail - Admin-D (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: OUR REF: SNM20D200862/GBD7379S/ADELINE - FW: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z
& GBD 7379 S on 14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad Ibrahim

Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Fri 17/4/2020 10:28 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Ng Ka Ye' <kaye@huahong.com.sg>

Dear LKK

Kindly assist to arrange for survey on 20/4/2020 Monday afternoon. Vehicle will be in around 2pm (not waiting)

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

i@ ®

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 April 2020 2:52 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Ng Ka Ye' <kaye@huahong.com.sg>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Albert Chua <albert.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D200862/GBD7379S/ADELINE - FW: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z & GBD 7379 S on
14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad lbrahim

Dear Jerleen
Please be informed that liability is in your client’s favor.

Please let us have your estimates for our consideration on direct settlement

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you.

Adeline Chng
Executive
Claims Department
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China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6155 | F: (65) 6225 5879

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: K FJiifi; Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 12:58 AM

To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Ng Ka Ye' <kaye@huahong.com.sg>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jerleen Tang
<jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D200862/GBD7379S/ADELINE - FW: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z & GBD 7379 S on
14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad lbrahim

Without Prejudice
Dear LKK

Please refer to below email and liaise with third party workshop.

Thank you.

Adeline Chng
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6178 | F: (65) 6225 5879

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X-FJifi Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jerleen Tang [mailto:jerleen@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 5:22 PM
To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
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Cc: 'Ng Ka Ye' <kaye@huahong.com.sg>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D200862/GBD7379S/ADELINE - FW: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z & GBD 7379 S on
14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad lbrahim

Dear Adeline,

We choose 1. Adrian Ling as our surveyor for this case.

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

i@ ®

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 February 2020 3:56 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D200862/GBD7379S/ADELINE - FW: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z & GBD 7379 S on
14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad lbrahim

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.
Attached PRS letter for your next action.

Please be infomred that liability is unclear as conflicting version of both party accident report.

Thank you.

Adeline Chng
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6155 | F: (65) 6222 1033
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W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X Vil Taiping SG

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Tuesday, 18 February 2020 3:12 PM

To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM20D200862/GBD7379S/ADELINE - FW: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z & GBD 7379 S on
14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad lbrahim

Dear Adeline,

Please conduct PRS for SLX6665Z.

Note : officer in charge — Adeline 63896155.

*** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.

Thank you,
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X~y Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 9:35 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Ng Ka Ye' <kaye@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: Accident involving SLX 6665 Z & GBD 7379 S on 14/2/2020 along JIn Ahmad Ibrahim

Dear Sir/Mdm
Kindly advise liability for this accident case.
Our insured claiming third party. GIA report as per attached.

Should you have any clarification, please contact us @ 6661 9688.

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

Qe ®
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