Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Anthony Cheong <cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 11:40 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Accident involving SJT5522D & SLW6695S on 13 Feb 2020.
Attachments: CCF_000208.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref-: SLW6695S

Our ref-: 5522/2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence
of the driver of your insured's vehicle SLW6695S.

We hereby quantify our client's claim as follows in respect of property damage.

COR $ 2,150.00 as per your surveyor's recommendation
LOU @ $60/- per day $ 180.00 (3 days)
LTA search fee $ 7.49

Total $ 2,337.49

Enclosed herewith copies of the following in support of our client's claim.

a Final repair bill
b. LTA receipt

Thank you for your kind attention and | appreciate your early reply.

Best Regards
Anthony Cheong
Claims

Lian Her Motors
H/p 91082728



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 9:39 AM

To: HOOSIERDOME@GMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW 6695S AND SJT 5522D ON 13/02/2020

Our Ref: CC4/A1G20002897/Kea3

19 MAR 2020

TAN LAY SEE / TOH SZE CHIN

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW 6695S AND SJT 5522D ON 13/02/2020

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com

c.c. AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT
(AIG Express Third Party Claim)

’\A S MD‘LQ Y P{K L\H, (the third party claimant) of ‘&'} Mﬂ J [a%‘j 5
l ne WQ‘MW] PE2 Y ?p}f(lagdress), owner of ST « D (vehlcle no.) hereby

U N HW Mo }u“fﬁ ' (“the workshop”) to act for me with

authorize

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no.

-
QJ /[ () ) that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on M (date)

along V(”Vk“’\ (of ‘(P 333 I‘)D Uund 12/0‘ (location) involving vehicle no/s
(W b ‘ ({‘{C (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshdp.
I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this 8 (day) of &1“ (month) 2020 (year)

GROR Ay
Vs, o\
(£ (co22959°)
\\ 2018. %
\\ \ :—7 /
Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)

SIGNED WITHOUT PREJUDICE FOR
ONLY PROPERTY CLAIM




SIGNED WITHOUT PRE
JUD
ONLY PROPERTY CLAIM R

RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, LIAN HER MOTORS (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$$2.150.00 (Repair Cost), S$180.00 (Loss of Usesiusies, $$7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SJT 5522D that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 13/02/2020 (date) along
PARKING LOT OF 238 JOO CHIAT RD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLW 6695S.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 19/02/2020 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/I confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner M S MOTOR PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant”™) of vehicle no. SJT 5522D make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. Wel/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SJT 5522D (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 8 (day) of A(I*” , (month) 202_ (year)

m A B %
@ LIAN HER MOTORS
rec W

. \—/. . -
Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the w“rkshop” (with chop)




Lian Her Motors
Blk 5038 #01-405 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Pk 2 Singapore 569541
Tel : 64817221
M S Motor Pte Lid
180 Woodlands Industrial Pk E5
#0717
Singapore 757516

Fax . 64816131

Date : 17.03.2020
invoice No @ 5522/2020
Qty Description Unit Price Amount
§JT 8522 D
1 Lump sum as per surveyor's recommendation $2,150.00
Grand total $2,150.00
Liagn Her Motors
\
i
Authorised Signature

Cheques should be made payable to Lian Her Motors



24170020 Feedback
> Back to OneMotoring

i sl Prasen,
AR 3T ARInN

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 17 Feb 2020/ 17:52:27
Receipt Date/Time : 17 Feb 2020/ 17:52:27

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. | ITNET-00000-200217-003083

Previous Recesipt No. ;

SIN item Description/ Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before
No. GET (8%)

Result of insurance Enquiry - SLW66853

As at 13 Feb 2020/12:00:00

Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enguiry - SLWE695S

Enguiry Fee 7.00
20200217178131311091
Sub-Total 7.00
Total Before Rounding 7.00

Rounding Difference

Total Amount Payable

Paid By

20200217175144180
i {internat Banking)

Total
Cash Change
Tendersd Amount

Excess Refunidable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

GST
Amount

{S$)

Q.49

0.49
0.49

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit

Amount
After GST
{8$%)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45

748
0.00
745
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may appily.

hitpsiivrlita.gov.sgitaivifaction/completePayment? FUNCTION ID=F1301001T7

11



4/7/2020 Merimen e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SJT5522D (3883248110SG)
[SLW6695S]
TP
M S MOTOR PTE LTD
Feb 13 2020 12:00PM
[TAN LAY SEE]
Lian Her Motors

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 03/04/2020 09:10 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2337.49) - SJT5522D - Claim Handler: Chan, Kian-Meng

Approved:2337.49.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=69761109&CFTOKEN=422cbfaec44626a7-34... 1/1



