Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Liannex Corporation <liannexc@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, December 14, 2020 2:44 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Finalize PA 737M

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: Green category

Hi Sun Pin,

Good day to you.

We accepted your final COR at lumpsum $15,000.00 (Before GST) Repair day 9 Days.
Thank you.

Best Regards
Alice Ng
LIANNEX CORPORATION (S) PTE LTD

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 9 December, 2020 11:47 AM

To: Liannex Corporation <liannexc(@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalize PA 737M

Hi Alice,

Good day, regarding your request for L/SUMP repair cost need $16,000. Repair day 9 days. There had too high
for the repair cost.

We had adjust the amount. Can we settle it at COR $15,000(before gst) ? Repair day 9 days under lump sum
repair.

Please confirm the COR by reply email ASAP. Kindly let us hear from you soon.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pill| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
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