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o Conguilants
il BB B Pé Lid Company Registration No 10R0T10ER
51 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA LB INDR GTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 404433 TEL : (651 625AA3R1 FAX @ 1063) 62564315
Your ref: CMTD2000759/SYH
Our ref: CS/SMOZ0002872/Kyd3 DATE: 20/2/2020

The Motor Claims Department

M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.PC 2654U

We thank you for your instruction on 19/2/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle

on_19/2/2020 at the premises of M/s AE AUTO PTELTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 880,559.03
Revised Estimate Amount : §8450.00
"Check" Items Amount : 8%6,619.17
Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value ;5%

MNett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 11:34 AM

To: Teo, Grace; Hwang, Shiang Yi; SUR

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Subject: RE: CMTD2000759/5YH - LKK(KK)/ SKWVB125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20
Attachments: PC 2654U PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Shiang Yi,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle PC 2654U
Date of survey: 19/2/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler ON BEHALF OF YVONNE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4313

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-23 | S(408933

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg=

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 9:14 AM

To: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel(@singnet.com.sg=; Hwang, Shiang Yi
<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; assignments
ﬂassigmne:nts@lkkaum.mm}; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=

Subject: CMTD2000759/SYH - LKK(KK)/ SKV8125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20

Our Reference: CMTD2000759/5YH
Your Reference: PC2654U

Without Prejudice
Date: 18/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S AE AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ryan,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV8125A & PC2654U ON 15.02.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto to conduct the survey.
1



Hi LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for pC2654U on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 205/
shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg .

Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Shiang Yi.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D 6329 5170 | T: 8461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust
Y INSURANCE |

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website; www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Produci Purchase® via Sompo SG

#*

noad on the

& App Store

For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance ! For Travel, Personal Accident. Home & Private Motor Insurance

Download now @

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agenls (acting on our behalf). Please click here far
our Privacy Policy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel @ singnet.com.sg=

Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2020 8:57 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo/@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=

Subject: RE: CMTD2000759/SYH - PRI/ SKV8125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20

Dear Sir,

We wish to appoint Kenneth Kong - LKK Auto Consultants



Thank you

Best Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367

From: Teo, Grace <grace.leod@sompo.com.sg=

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 5:33 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel@singnet.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang i
<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye(@sompo.com.sg=>

Subject: CMTD2000759/SYH - PRI/ SKV8125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20

Our Reference: CMTD2000759/5YH
Your Reference: PC2654U

Without Prejudice
Date: 18/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@s0mpo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S AE AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ryan,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5KV8125A & PC2654U ON 15.02.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 18/02/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 205/
shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Mg
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)




Maohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 8221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvev@sompo.com.sg

, SOMPO
A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

® App Store

| For Travel. Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Download now @

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andlor legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acling on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcelisingnel.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 2:47 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @ sompo.com.sg>
Subject: FW: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR PC 2654U
Importance: High

GIA REPORT ATTACHED

From: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 10:36 AM

To: 'motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg' <motorsurvey @ sompo.com.sg=
Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR PC 2654U

Importance: High

Dear Officer,



Please help us arrange for pre repair survey.
Our vehicle — PC 2654U

Accident date — 15/02/2020

Your insure — SKV 8125A

Location — AE AUTO PTE LTD

160 SIN MING DRIVE # 06-01
SIN MING AUTOCITY (8) 575722

Please let us have the list of surveyor to appoint.

We will forward a copy of GIA report once its ready.

Thank you

Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367



_Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:
Attachments:

Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Wednesday, 19 February 2020 9:14 AM

Autoexcel Engineering ; Hwang, Shiang Yi; ‘admin-d@Ikkauto.com’;
‘assignments@lkkauto.com’; 'SUR’

Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

CMTD2000759/SYH - LKK(KK)/ SKVB125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20
20200218103214535.pdf; 2654-SOMPO.PDF

Qur Reference: CMTD2000759/SYH

Your Reference: PC2654U

Date: 18/02/2020

Attention:
M/S AE AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ryan,

Without Prejudice
EMAIL OMNLY

QUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKVB125A & PC2654U ON 15.02.2020

We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for PC2654U on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 205/

shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg .

Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Shiang Yi.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey(@sompo.com.sg

1



@ SOMPO A century of Trust
P INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook. com!SompeSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase” via Sompo SG

# Drorwrdnd &n the

P> Google Play

For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | = For Travel, Personal Accident. Home & Private Motor Insurance

@ App Store

Download now (a or

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachmenis, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information, Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure o holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel(@singnet.com.sg=

Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2020 8:57 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teof@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye(@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000759/SYH - PRI/ SKV8125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20

Dear Sir,

We wish to appoint Kenneth Kong - LKK Auto Consultants

Thank you

Best Regards
Ryan Soh
93825347

From: Teo, Grace <grace.leo/d sOmpo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 5:33 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel@ singnet.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi
<shiangyi.hwang(asompo.com.sg>

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ve/@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD2000759/SYH - PRI/ SKV8125A(NR) & PC2654U ACC ON 15.02.20

Our Reference: CMTD2000759/SYH
Your Reference: PC2654U

Without Prejudice

2



Date: 18/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S AE AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ryan,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKV8125A & PC2654U ON 15.02.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 18/02/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang ¥i is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 205/
shiangyi.hwang@s0mpo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyars as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvev@sompo.com.sg

L @ SOMPO A century of Trust

INSURAN GE



Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompaSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

i App Store
Download now AppStore or el gle Play

For Travel. Personal Accident & Home Insuranee | For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insuranee

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Netice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the pUrposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcelwsingnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 2:47 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com,sg>
Subject: FW: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR PC 2654U
Importance: High

GIA REPORT ATTACHED

From: Autoexcel Engineering <acexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 10:36 AM

To: 'motorsurvey(@sompo.com.sg' <molorsurvey@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY FOR PC 2654U

Importance: High

Dear Officer,

Please help us arrange for pre repair survey.
Our vehicle — PC 2654U

Accident date — 15/02/2020

Your insure — SKV 8125A

Location — AE AUTO PTELTD

160 SIN MING DRIVE # 06-01
SIN MING AUTOCITY (S) 575722

Please let us have the list of surveyor to appoint.

We will forward a copy of GIA report once its ready.

Thank you



Regards
Ryan Soh
93825367



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cramer [D Type:

Owmer 1D
Vehicle Detzils

Vehicle No.:

ehide to be Exported:;
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Makes

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
DABE ElinikiHbu-

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detafls
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infermation contained herein is correct as at 18 Feb 2020

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Limited Liability Partnership
183)

PC2654U

Yes

18 Feb 2020
MERCEDES BENZ
WVIANO CDI2.2 TREMD EL AUTO ABS DYAB HID
Black

2014
65194032201168
WDF43FR1523888166
£44,401.00

14 Jul 2014

14 Jul 2014

1

$2,221.00

$0.00

13 Jul 2024

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$42,001.00
$18,54200
$18,942.00

OK

hitpsfivrk ita.gov. sgitalvraction/enguireRebateByPublicBeforeDeraginput ?FUNCTION_ID=FO304004TT

1M



Date : 17/02/2020 QUOTATION -THIRD PARTY CLAIM

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD

Attn; Motor Claim Department . Officer In Charge Claim Third Party Claim
Veh. No : PC 2654 U
Accident on ; 18/02/2020 Model MERCEDES VIANO
Insured Ins: SOMPO
QTy PARTICULARS AMOUNT |SURVEYOR
Your Insurer Vehicle No : SKV 8125 A
1|FRONT BUMPER b 2,850.00 i
1|FRONT BUMPER RH BRACKET T $ 180.00 W
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT LS 586.90 x
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 3 55.00 7
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RH K 140.00 X
1|HEADLAMP RH $ 980.60 7
1|FRONT GRILLE $ ° BB570 7
1|SUPPORT PANEL REPAIR
1|FRONT FENDER RH REPAIR
1|FRONT FENDER UNDERSHIELD RH $ h. 24850 J('
TOTAL : $ 5,726.70
LESS 10% $ 5154.03
1|FRONT No.PLATE WITH HOLDER 5 Ji. 60.00 X
TOTAL : $ 60.00
Total Parts : $§ 5154.03
Balance bif $ 5,154.03
EEER CHARGES
Labour charges to replace repair accident damage area % 800.00 zﬂﬁ(
To do spray painting on accident affected area $ 1,000.00 Z2ef
To forcus headlamp, check wiring system $ 120.00 7
Anti rust s | 5 100.00 X
Total Labour : $ 2,020.00
TOTAL PARTS& LABOUR: |$ 7,174.03

AW\q- 03

Page 1



Date : 17/02/2020

AE AUTO PTE LTD
160, 5in Ming Drive. ..
3in Ming Auto City i_."_?‘--l'l

singapore 573742
Teli B4 35-3541645\.&1-.‘:'3"
Fax: 54591698

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

QUOTATION -THIRD PARTY CLAIM
SUPPLEMENTARY PARTS

Altn; Motor Claim Department . Officer In Charge Claim Third Party Claim
Veh. No pPC 2654 U
Accident on 18/022020 Maodel MERCEDES VIANO
. Insured Ins. __ SOMPO
QTyY PARTICULARS AMOUNT  |SURVEYOR
Your Insurer Vehicle Mo : SKV 8125 A
TIERONT SUPPORT PANEL ASSY b 1,485.00
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT $ 680.00
1IFRONT WIPER NOZZLE RH B 485,00
TOTAL : % 2,650.00
LESS 10% $ 2,385.00
Total Parts : $  2,385.00

Page 2
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Date : 17/02/2020 QUOTATION -THIRD PARTY CLAIM

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD

Attn; Motor Claim Departrment . Officer In Charge Claim Third Party Claim
Veh. No PC 2654 U
Accident on : 18/02/2020 Maodel MERCEDES VIANO
Insured Ins: SOMPO
QTY PARTICULARS AMOUNT |SURVEYOR
Your Insurer Vehicle No : SKV 8125 A
- ] ol
1|FRONT BUMPER 7272 MHe |5 2.850.00 e
1|FRONT BUMPER RH BRACKET T 13 180.00 Ve
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 7,5 586.90 s
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NNE 55.00 ——
1I[FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RH Al S 140.00 X i
1|HEADLAMP RH Mt ot S 980.60 =
1|FRONT GRILLE “I.l$ ° 68570 x
1|SUPPORT PANEL REPAIR
1|FRONT FENDER RH REPAIR
1|FRONT FENDER UNDERSHIELD RH § A 24850 X
TOTAL : $ 5726.70
LESS 10% $§ 5154.03
SINETT
1|FRONT No.PLATE WITH HOLDER $ /o 60.00 X
TOTAL : $ 60.00
Total Parts : $ 5,154.03
Balance bif $ 5,154.03
LABOUR CHARGES
Labour charges to replace repair accident damage area 5 800.00 z:ﬁf ¢
To do spray painting on accident affected area $ 1,000.00 / o
To forcus headlamp, check wiring system 5 120.00 2Ll
Anti rust s | 5 100.00 o
Total Labour : $  2,020.00
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR: [§  7,174.03
qb\4.0%

Page 1



Date : 17/02/2020 UOTATION -THIRD PA LAIM
SUPPLEMENTARY PARTS

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Attn; Motor Claim Department . icer In Charge Claim Third Party Claim
Veh. No : PC 2654 U
Accident on : 18/02/2020 Model MERCEDES VIANO
Insured Ins; SOMPO
QTyY PARTICULARS AMDUNT |SURVEYOR
Your Insurer Vehicle No ; SKV 8125 A
1[FRONT SUPPORT PANELASSY T #7 CIL]S 148500 —
7|FRONT REINFORCEMENT Pncntd $  680.00 a1l
1|FRONT WIPER NOZZLE RH 202 | § 48500 —
TOTAL : $  2,650.00
LESS 10% $ 2,385.00
Total Parts : $  2,385.00

Page 2



y IZL LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408923

- - ar
d.m mE B
TEL: G258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SM0O20002872/Kyd3n2
soraTe e AR
#05-01/08 Date: 13-03-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
15 Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKV 81254 Veh. Inspected PC 2654U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD2000759/5YH Excess () 0.00
Assign From GRACE TED Assign Date 19/02/2020
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES VIANO (A) c.c 2143
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WDFE3981523688166 Colour BLACK
Odometer 178815 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/60 R1B NEXEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/60 R16 NEXEN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/80 R16 NEXEN 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/60 R18 NEXEN B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  15/02/2020 |Inspection Date 19/02/2020
Survey held at AE AUTOPTELTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #06-01
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 190607188R GST Reg. Mo 18-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC 2654U
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER MTG CRACKED 2,850.00 1,210.00
1|FRONT BUMPER RH BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 180.00 -
LABOUR
1|FROMT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 586.90 586.90
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RH SERVICEABLE 140,00 -
1|HEADLAMP RH MTG CRACKED 980.60 980,60
1|FRONT GRILLE SERVICEABLE B85.70 -
1|SUPPORT PANEL (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE -
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE . .
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER UNDERSHIELD RH SERVICEABLE 248.50 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL ASSY (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 1,485.00 770.00
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT (ADDITIONAL) REPEATED 680.00 -
1|FRONT WIPER NOZZLE RH (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 485.00 262.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -837.67 -386.45
7.539.03 3,478.05
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NO PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN} SERVICEABLE £0.00
£0.00 -
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REPLACE REPAIR ACCIDENT 800.00 500.00
DAMAGE AREA.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
BUMPER RH BRACKET.SUPPORT PAMEL AND FRONT
FENDER RH.
TO DO SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED 1,000.00 450.00
AREA.
TO FORCUS HEADLAMP,CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 120.00 20,00
ANTI RUST. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
2,020.00 a970.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,619.03 4,448.05

Report Ref No, CS/SM0O20002872/Kyd3n2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/SMO20002872/Kyd3n2

Page No.2 of 2
3,500.00

Y/ 4%a

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repert is made sololy for the uss snd bensfit af the Cliont named on the frant page of this Report.

er in pant, Any third party acting o replying on this




