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summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 17 February, 2020 3:21 PM

To: ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)’; 'Admin A"; 'SUR'

Ce: 'Claims’

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SLP 7960 G ON 16/2/2020
Attachments: SLP 7960 G - 16022020.pdf

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.

Kindly arrange survey on 18/2/2020.

Vehicle is in our compound.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd iregno 15000227190

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408659

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is cenfidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system,

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLP7960G (71139680225G)
oD
Feb 16 2020 5:50PM
[BOO JIA-WEN JOY]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

I'Reply I Reply All i Mark as Unread | Print Message | Delete Message [ Forward E

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), senton 27/02/2020 15:21 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject

Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$10749.00) - SLP7960G - Claim Handler: Gan, Hunchung

X %€ «
Approved:10749,00:Authorise repair. D pillar trim upper, rear shelf parcel trim - clear damage photos required. Why rear bumper need to respray and
4.5 panels? Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour with clear ph

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY e —
There are no documents.
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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 3:33 PM

To: ‘claims@premiumauto.com.sg'; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A; SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SLP 7960 G ON 16/2/2020

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLP 7960G (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 12:39 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SLP 7960 G ON 16/2/2020

Dear all,
Approval please ? Owner chasing liao.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9902

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.reg.No:199607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 19 Feb 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SLP7960G Accident Date : 16/02/2020
Make :AUDI A3 Policy No. : 1700016877-02
Assignment Date 1 19/02/2020 Excess : §%$0.00
Date of Inspection 1 18/02/2020 Est. Duration of Repair : 8.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 19,830.00
Revised Amount :S$ 10,749.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 6,593.00
Total :S% 17,342.00
Lump Sum Repair :S%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S$
Pre-Accident Value :S$ 83,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S$ 46,272.00
Salvage Value :S%
Margin for Repair :S$ 36,728.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us have
your authorisation.

( )  The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck,

( )}  Other comments :



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 028E
Vehicle No.: SLP7960G
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 19 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSI S TRONIC (LED)
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: CHZ374903
Chassis No.: WAUZZZ8V4H1074591
Maximum Power Output: 85.0kW (113 bhp)
Open Market Value: $24,463.00
Original Registration Date: 19 Jun 2017
First Registration Date: 19 Jun 2017
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $16,249.00
e e e e e
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 18 Jun 2027
PARF Rebate Amount; $12,186.00
3 it )l Y DR s i R L s B S|
COE Expiry Date: 18 Jun 2027
COE Category: A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $46,489.00
COE Rebate Amount: $34,086.00
Total Rebate Amount: $46,272.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Feb 2020

OK
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Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just | - B% P A, 0 Admin, 0 ann,

$58 until it's SOLD! L | Manthly $488, 2 Years Warrani

gine And Gearbox,
StarAd

[smbyDatePwted v =2[Iresultsfpage

Search Selection * Available

[] Audi A3 Sportback 1.0A TFSI $81,000 ©  $10,570/yr | 24-Jan-2017 999 cc 66,000 km | Hatchback Available
S-tronic : H i i :
1 Careful Owner Competitively Priced Audi A3 On Sale! With 5-year Premium Auto Agent Warranty Till 2022 So Buy With Confidence! Fully =
Agent Serviced With No Repairs Needed. Delivered In Glacial White, The Smart A3 SB Is A Fantastic Fun Car That Is Perfect For Zipping... LorEcT oumer ]
Hostied L6-Fel $01 i A3, 2017 el 3, audi al a L5 iatll
[7] Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI 5- ~ $B7,800  $11,3%0/yr © 26-Jan-2017 |  999cc  29,000km Luxury . Available
tronic : 3 ! t ; : :

Only Unit Tn The Market With Audi's Factory Fitted Virtual Cockpit System Worth A Whopping $11k+! Premium Auto Agent Warranty Valid
Till 2022 For A Worry Free Purchase! Recently Agent Serviced This Month, Extremely Low Mileage. Shelter Parked With No Dinks And De...

Car BWBN Automative Pte Ltd

3, audiad, Audi, A3, a3, Used Audl

m Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI 5- . $83,800 $10,900 fyr  ©  26-Jan-2017 999 cc ¢ 44300 km Luxury Available
tronic ; i i i i

1 Owner, Accident Free, Fully Maintained And Warranty By Agent. Original Condition, Exclusive Interest Rates At 2,28%, Please Call For
Viewing And Enquiry.

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

m Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI 5- . $B81,800 $10,310 By 1 13-Apr-2017 999 cc | 24031 km Luxury Available
tronic i i

Comes With Agent Warranty Til April 2022, Suave And Sophlshcated A3 Sedan Powered By A Responsive And Frugal 1.0 TFSI Engine And
Mated To A 7-Speed DSG Ensuring You A Powerful Daily Drive, Yet Returning Excellent Fuel Efficiency! Spacious Cabin For Couples/Smal...

Seie:ct By Performance Premium Selection

& Posted: Tags: 20017 Augi A, 20T R acd al, Audl A3, audiad, Audl A3, a3, Used Aud

Lip Design Rotary Forging TSW Variante Rim
Fitments are exclusive for 5x112 wheels, 5x114.3 wheels, and 5x120 wheels.
Mare info about this product

mnudiMSportback 1.0ATFSI  $85,000 | $10,680 fyr ¢ 18-May-2017 999 cc © 13,000 km = Hatchback Available
S-tronic i 3 ; i :

Look No Further! Best Value For Your Money. Direct Owner's Beautiful Grey, May 2017 Audi A3 Sportback 1.0 TFSI S Tronic (LED). Selling
Due To Upgrading To New Car. Low Fuel Consumiption/Low Maintenance. Original Paintwork Condition And Well Taken Care By Owner....

e 0D 3019 Tags: 2017 AudiAG; 2017 audl a3 AudiAS, audt 33, Audll, A3 23, Used Aud

[7] Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $84,000 = 410,420 /yr | 29-May-2017 999 cc 40,000km = luxury = Available
tronic { |

Price Dropped To $84,000 On 21/12/19! Car Perpetually Parked Under Shelter! Nano Coating For Paintwork Done. Excellent Fuel Economy
Giving 700km For $85 Full Tank Of Gas. Unit Within 5 Years Warranty And Free Servicing With Audi To Go With Car. Reluctant Sale Due...

i a3, Audi, A% a

[7] Audi A3 Sedan 1.OATFSIS-  $76,500 $9,330/yr  19-Jun-2017 = 999cc  59,500km = Luwxury | Available
tronic : ! : ; :




Under Agent Warranty! Changed Front Bumper. Well Maintained Unit! Lowest Depreciation. High Loans Up To 75% Of The Car Price \With
Interest Rates From 2.28% Available. Trade In Welcome. Call Now To Book An Appointment To View This Beauty, Viewing Strictly Appol...

/_"'11 Posted: 10-Eah-2020  Tags: (2017 Audi A3, 2017 audl &, ..'\uci A3y 'a-.ed.'i'n'_i_, Aol A3, a3 Used Audi

[7] Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $87,800 $10,670 fyr | 08-Aug-2017 999 ¢c 41,000 km Luxury
tronic : : I

Fully Agent Maintained With 3 Years Warranty Remaining! Immaculate Condition, Regularly Polished And Maintained By 1 Owner! Low
Maintenance 1.0L Packed With Super High Torgue! Full Loan Available! Trade-In Welcomed, Call For Appointment,

audt 23, Audi 83, audi a3, Audl, A3, a3, Usad Aud:

A

[7] Audi A3 Cabriolet 1.4A TFSI S- | $135,000  $15,520 fyr . 26-ep-2017 | 1395¢cc | 14000km :  Sports
tronic - : : ; :

Only Used As Recreation Car, Rarely Used, Very Low Mileage, Never Driven Outside Singapore, Under Warranty (Expiring Sept 2022) And
Serviced Done By Audi Premium Automobiles, Perfect Car To Enjoy Breezing Wind!

i 3 : o

Posted: Af-Fen-2028 - Tagsn IDET Audi A3, 2017 atidi a3, Audi AS-aldiad, Aldl A%, 23, Used Audh

E] Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI 5- . $90,999 410,850 fyr  ©  10-Oct-2017 999 cc . 22,000 km Luxury
tronic i

Audi Management Unit! 5 Years Audi Warranty Till Oct 2022 Unlimited Mileage! 24 Hours Audi Road Side Assist! Certified Multipoint
Check! Showroom Superb Tip Top Condition! Trade In Welcome! Call Now To Arrange For A Viewing!

Premium Automobile:

s Pocted! 16-Fel-2020  Tags: 2017 Audi A3, 2017 audi a3, Audl A3, auc 3, Ussd Al
1 i ID
[] Audi A3 Sedan 1.0ATFSIS- = $84800 = $10010/yr 1702017 | 999« | 38418km & Lluay
tronic : : : ; i

5 Years Warranty Till Oct 2022, Fully Maintained By Premium Automobile, Best Looking Gun Metal Grey Colour! Lowest Depreciation For
2017 A3 In Pristine Condition! Very Economical And Low Depreciation! Excellent Fuel Efficiency! No Gimmicks! High Loan And High Trad...

Mayfair Motoring
b 17-Feb=d020. Tz

Posted

2017 Audi A3, 2037 cudi a3, Audi A3, audi a2, Audi, A3, a3, Used Audi

Available

Available

Available

Available

Home | New Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products i Insurance | Article | Forum |Resources
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4,362.48
0.00
4,362.48

Nett

s/N LABOUR
600
400
300
1800
750
2475
192

0.00

6,517.00

Checkltem = TOTAL

10,879.48
0.00

lump sum
0.00

Part by Part
10,879.48

0.00



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 WIP : 29703
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No 68411183

Reference £ PA/OD/0178/2020/NS
Date : 17-Feb-20

Vehicle IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name 1 MsBoo Jia-Wen Joy

Address : 57 Sennett Lane
Singapore 466951

Telephone :  HP+6596369125

Type of Claim :  Own Damage Claims

Policy No. :

Vehicle No : SLP7960G

Model Code :  Audi A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSI 8V

Model / Year : Jun-17

Engine No : CHZ 374903

Chassis No i WAUZZZ8V4H1074591

Mileage : 33903

Date In :  17-Feb-20

Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu

Accident Date 1 16-Feb-20

Place of Accident + 57 Sennett Lane

B s



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel 16366 2323 Fax: 68411182

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLP 7960 G

Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation
p To tow and recover vehicle from scene of SN S 280.00 X ./
. accident.
2 Torenewrhs 1/4 glass and rear windscreen. S/N S 600.00 " \/
3 Toinstall rear windscreen solar film. SIN $ 400.00 /V
To carry out vacuum and clean up for interior

N 80-0 J

4 and carpet. w 5 4 030 L

To remove and reinstall rear seat, back rest,

hat tray, abcd pillar trims, luggage .
5 compartment trims. Dislodge roof linerand S/N  §$ 1,80000 /€00

disengage curtain airbag. To renew speaker
tray and etc.

To repair rhs rear fender. Re-organise rear <
6 crash management compeonents. Reinstall S 1,058700 75

all parts removed.
/ / 4.5 pane /

To respray rooftop panel, rear lid and rhs 3 106700 2 "
¥ reayender. Ru.s W ‘ S : pg/ v g
. #
8 To carry out diagnostic check. S/IN S 192.00 e

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : _$ 7,902.00




Premium Automobiles

55 UbiRoad 1, Singapore 40B69%
Tel 16366 2323 Fax:6B4]1 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLP 7960 G

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 REAR WINDOW wdtbe—d $ 766.00 «~  (6\23D
2 PRIMER A S 19.00 = W30
3 SIDEWINDOW-RH & | 5 s37.00 = HA W
4 ADDITIONAL BRAKE LIGHT (! $ 22100 ~ G M
5 MOULDED HEADLINER (1 $ 1,666.00~" 133230
6  D-PILLARTRIM-LH/RHUPPER FH et 2 s 218.00~ 10 9. 32670
7 A-PILLARTRIM - LH A\ e 5 151.00 &%
8  APILLAR TRIM - RH UPPER ° $ 151.00 & x
9 B-PILLARTRIM-LH/RH [ y[s¢ st 2 3 408.00 ¥ //%
C-PILLAR TRIM - I.H . stained (2 ¢ 284.00 '~ ﬁﬂ( Ading Waebn
11  REAR SHELF PANELTRIM it $ 614.00 — 40,030
Q REAR SHELF PANELTRIMCOVER =7 /(4 s s0.00 7 14\2
@ HEAD RESTRAINT %~ TN Z( s 1,338.00 ° X Store 23920
14  HEAD RESTRAINT-CENTRE 7 “nn $ 669.00 7 65/19 LN
15  BACKRESTCOVER-RH 7 Nn $ 2,232.00 [ ffﬁﬁ
16  BACKREST COVER-LH 7 nn $ 1,904.00
17 REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT SIN'$ 200.00 — V
18 1/4 GLASS SEALANT E”w" S/IN $ 100.00 «~ v
19  SUNDRIES . pn $ 400.00 7 X a
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES $ 11,928.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES S 7,902.00
GRAND TOTAL S 19,830.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

s i el




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name 2 HCJ/?&»- L—7

Surveyed Date DM /’.}’L /.10
Authorised Date

Excess Cost s

Liability 4

Remarks . : ke 08 b.
Ao ton ) 70

Please Note 1 This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel:6366 2323 Fax:68411183
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No . 63662323

Fax No . 68411183
Reference : PA/OD/0178/2020/NS
Date :  17-Feb-20

Vehicle IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Ms Boo Jia-Wen Joy
57 Sennett Lane
Singapore 466951
HP +65 96369125
Own Damage Claims

SLP 7960 G

Audi A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSI 8V
Jun-17

CHZ 374903
WAUZZZ8V4H1074591
33903

17-Feb-20

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
16-Feb-20

57 Sennett Lane

WIP: 29703



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLP 7960 G

Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendation

1 To Fow and recover vehicle from scene of SN S 280.00 X

accident.
2 Torenew rhs 1/4 glass and rear windscreen. S/N  $ 600.00 __—
3 Toinstall rear windscreen solar film. S/N S 400.00 /

To carry out vacuum and clean up for interior 80 q0 .
4 and carpet. S 4 00 30

To remove and reinstall rear seat, back rest,

hat tray, abcd pillar trims, luggage .
5 compartment trims. Dislodge roof linerand S/N $ 1,80000 [800

disengage curtain airbag. To renew speaker -

tray and etc.

To repair rhs rear fender. Re-organise rear -~
6 crash management components. Reinstall S 1,050700 /5 ¢

all parts removed. /

P ; 4.5 ?ﬁﬂ{/

v To respray roof'top panel, rear l.ld and rhs s 3,19{:60 2D

rear/ﬁender. Roes W .
8 Tocarry out diagnostic check. S/IN § 192.00 t-/

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

$ 7,902.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLP 7960 G

Damage Parts & Prices
S/N Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 REARWINDOW chutte—c $ 766.00
2 PRIMER  a~ $ 19.00 =
3 SIDEWINDOW-RH & $ 537.00 ©
4 ADDITIONAL BRAKE LIGHT (ecl—e! 3 221.00 ~
5  MOULDED HEADLINER (it $ 1,666.00 =
6  D-PILLARTRIM-LH/RHUPPER Et «d 5 ¢ 218.60~ /0 9.
7 APILLARTRIM-LH  ai¢ e s 151.00 &
8  APILLAR TRIM - RH UPPER $ 151.00 \
9 B-PILLARTRIM-LH/RH [ yf>¢ st ¥ 3 408.00 +
10 C-PILLAR TRIM - LH / RH z % 284.00 * -
11  REAR SHELF PANEL TRIM (<t $ 614.00
12 REAR SHELF PANEL TRIM COVER 7 $ 50.00
13 HEAD RESTRAINT % 2 8 1,338.00
14  HEAD RESTRAINT - CENTRE 7 $ 669.00 7
15  BACKREST COVER-RH 7 3 223200 °
16  BACKREST COVER-LH * $ 1,904.00
17 = REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT 7 S/IN $ 200.00 —
18  1/4 GLASS SEALANT 5 - S/IN $ 100.00
19  SUNDRIES $ 400.00 ~
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES S 11,928.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES S 7,902.00
GRAND TOTAL S 19,830.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

) ﬂdr)};_._.h ( ;

- P&/m/-;c

)

: A Aok |

08 b.
/ 70

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

r
ng resurvey
arts | ; confirmation

e Third part, survey "Without Prejudice” basis
e No illega! moc lication(s) is allowed
LI ) be resurveyed and

i | from Insurance Company
Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

Allan Wu

Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699

Tel: (65) 6366 2323 Fax:(65) 68411183

Supplementary Estimate 1
GST Reg No. 18-9802271-W

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd Estimate No. PA/QD/0178/2020/NS

78 Shenton Way Date 10-Mar-20

#07-16 AIG Building Service Advisor Glory Tan

Singapore 079120 Pages lofl

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept Regn No SLP7960G

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315 Model No Audi A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSI 8Y

Quantity Description Unit Price  Amount
Parts

1 Rear lid packing adhesive A4 - S 18.00 4.
2 Audi emblem A&/ $ 11700 QA%
3 A3 emblem #+ $ 90.00 Ak
4 TFSI emblem we ~~ $ 90.00 2\ X

Authorised Signature



