Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 9:06 AM

To: Soon Kiat Soh

Cc: Reports (LKKAuto); QA (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Vehicle E71

Attachments: LKKInvoice1 (26).pdf; Full page photo.pdf; LKKAdjustmentla (21).pdf; LKKInspection
(32).pdf

Dear Mr Soh,

Enclosed our survey report and invoice

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 March 2020 10:03 AM

To: 'Soon Kiat Soh' <soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Vehicle E71

Dear Soon Kiat,
Wearnes is check if insurer will be paying for the estimate fee and cost ?

As we have assigned manpower and time to check the vehicle for damages.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Soon Kiat Soh <soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 1:10 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Vehicle E71

Denise

Can assist to check the value of these vehicles?



1) Ferrari 360 - SFX4S

2) Ferrari 430 Spider - SJB8928S
3) Porsche Panamera - SKC838D
4) Porsche 911 SC - SDY777M

5) Volkswagen GTi - SMS661M
6) Porsche 993 C4S - SCM6993R
7) Ferrari 430 Spider - SJL222U
8) Land Rover - E71T

Please do not hestiate to contact me should you have any queries.

Regards

Soh Soon Kiat  Manager, Loss Adjusting Services e Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd ¢ 8 Shenton Way, #03-01 AXA Tower, 068811, Singapore

Direct: +65 6632 8638 e Mobile: +65 9634 0429 e Office: +65 6632 8600 e Fax: +65 6632 8040 ¢ Email:
soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg ¢ Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com

LD ._
Crawford

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 11:28 AM

To: Soon Kiat Soh <soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Vehicle E71

CAUTION: Email originated outside the organization. Do not open attachments or click links unless you are certain
the sender and content are safe.

Dear Mr Soh,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle E 71T

Please be inform after serveral negotition with the repairer on the labour chargers, they disagree on our surveyor’s adjusted labour
charges.

Kindy review and advise

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 8:32 AM

To: Soon Kiat Soh <soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Vehicle E71

Dear Soh,

Still checking with repairer and our surveyor, will update you later.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Soon Kiat Soh <soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 7:38 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Vehicle E71

Hi Denise

How is the assessment of the revised quote?

Regards

Soh Soon Kiat ® Manager, Loss Adjusting Services e Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd ¢ 8 Shenton Way, #03-01 AXA Tower, 068811, Singapore
Direct: +65 6632 8638 » Mobile: +65 9634 0429 e Office: +65 6632 8600 ¢ Fax: +65 6632 8040 ¢ Email:
soonkiat.soh@crawford.com.sg ® Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com




