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UU Auto

- Consullants
A s Ba = B Lbed

&1 UBL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 625363561 FAX : (065] 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD2000539/5YH
Our Ref: CS/SM0O20002692/Aqf3

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn: Grace
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,

Date: 17" March 2020

Without Prejudice

SLA 2476A .

We thank you for the instruction on _17/02/2020.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 17/02/2020 at the premises of M/s YAP LEE MOTOR and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 338733 .

Revised Estimate Amount :Sh 1.500.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check™ Items Amount : S8 - g

Market Value 53 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -

Nett Value 155 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

n/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.

Recommendation Days of Repair: 4 days.
We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAL PING
B Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#

From: Teo, Grace <graceteo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 4:00 PM

To: Ruby Ong; Hwang, Shiang Yi; 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com’; ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com’;
'SUR'

Cc Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Yap Lee Motor

Subject: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBM8106) & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.

TCL.GCN.RQ.50075.20.YLM]

Our Reference: CMTD2000539/5YH
Your Reference: TCL.GCM.ro.50075.20.ylm

Without Prejudice
Date: 17/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.Ccom. 5§

Attention:
M/S HIN TAT AUGUSTINE & PARTNERS

Dear Ruby,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM8106) & SLA2476A ON 02.02.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SLA2476A on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 205/
shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg .

Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Shiang Yi.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division
D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6355 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg




@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSGE

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

swnigad on the

', D
Download now (@ AppStare or

| For Travel, Personal Aceident & Home Insurance | # For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insuranes

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this massage.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Paolicy

From: Ruby Ong <ruby@htapartners.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 3:24 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg=; Hwang, Shiang Y1 <shiangyi.hwang(@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Yap Lee Motor
<yap_lee_motor{@singnet.com.sg=

Subjeet: RE: CMTD2000539/SYH - PRI/ FBM8106] & SL.A2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.RO.50075.20.YLM]

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Grace
We refer to your email of 11 February 2020 and the reminder on 13 February 2020.

Our client is agreeable to appoint LKK Auto Consultants from your list to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert for our client’s vehicle no. SLA 2476A.

Please make the necessary arrangements with the contact person on the survey of our client’s vehicle. The
details are as follows :

Venue - Yap Lee Motor
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#01-26 Autobay@Kaki Bukit (417883)

Contact Person : Mrs Chua / Shirley : 6844 1555

In the event that the pre-repair survey was not conducted during the prescribed time or already conducted at
your end previously, we reserve our client’s right to claim for compensation for loss of use for your current
request for re-survey.

Best regards,
Ruby Ong
Secretary



M/s Hin Tat Augustine & Partners
20 Upper Circular Road
#02-10/12 The Riverwalk
Singapore 058416

Tel : 6533 0212 ext 254

Fax : 6338 3536 /6533 0313

www_ htapartners,com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information is contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or
responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you
should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email.

From: Teo, Grace <grace.leo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 12:34 PM

To: Ruby Ong <rubyvia htapartners.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangvi.hwang/@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye/asompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD2000539/SYH - PRI/ FBM8106J & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.R0.50075.20.YLM]

Hi Ruby.

1% reminder

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D- 8329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvevi@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SomposSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

¢ Drownlosd o the GETMON
& App Store Il P> Google Play

Download now or

For Travel. Personal Accident & Home Insurance | £ For Travel. Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/ar legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may caollect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents facting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Teo, Grace
Sent: Tuesday, February 11, 2020 6:13 PM
To: 'Ruby Ong' <ruby(htapartners.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang (SOMpo.com.sp>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.vel@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD2000539/SYH - PRI/ FBM8106J & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
3




TCL.GCN.R0.50075.20.YLM]
Importance: High

Our Reference: CMTD2000539/5YH
Your Reference: TCL.GCN.ro.50075.20.ylm

Without Prejudice
Date: 11/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey(@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S HIN TAT AUGUSTINE & PARTMNERS

Dear Ruby,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM8106) & SLA2476A ON 02.02.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 11/02/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 205/
shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F; 6221 3147



For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@/ SOM PO A Century of Trust

ENEU

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook. com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

& Download on the CETITON
L] E-\' Google Play

or

App Store

Download now @
UFar Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ruby Ong <ruby(@htapartners.com.sg>
Sent; Tuesday, February 11, 2020 3:01 PM
To: Claims - Motor Survey <MaotorSurvey @ sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Yap Lee Motor <yvap_lee_motor@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR SURVEY PROTOCOL FOR SLA 2476A [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.RO.50075.20.YLM]

Importance: High

Your ref: FBM 8106] WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref : TCL.GCN.r0.50075.20.ylm

11 February 2020

Sompo Insurance Pte Ltd By Email Only
Motor Claims Department
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06
Singapore Land Tower
Singapore 048623
VERY URGENT

Dear Sir,

CLAIMANT: AC CAR RENTAL PTE. LTD.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 2476A & FMB 8106J ALONG CANBERRA WAY INTO
CANBERRA STREET ON 2 FEBRUARY 2020 @ 1955RS

We are instructed by AC Car Rental Pte. Ltd. to notify you of a road traffic accident on 2 February 2020 at
about 19555hrs along Canberra Way into Canberra Street involving our clients’ vehicle registration number
SLA 2476A and vehicle registration number FMB 8106] driven by your insured’s driver at the material
time.



" As i result of the accident, our clients’ vehicle has been damaged. Before our clients proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or
your insurers would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from
you within the stipulated timeline, our clients shall proceed to repair the vehicle without reference to you.

Best regards,

Ruby Ong

Secretary

M/s Hin Tat Augustine & Partners
20 Upper Circular Road
#02-10/12 The Riverwalk
Singapore 058416

Tel : 6533 0212 ext 254

Fax : 6338 3536 /6533 0313

www. htapartners. con.sg

Privileged/Confidential information is contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or
responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you
should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 2:09 PM

To: Teo, Grace’; ‘Hwang, Shiang Yi'; assignments; SUR

Cc 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’

Subject: RE: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBM8106) & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.RO.50075.20.YLM]

Attachments: C5SMO020002692Aqf3.pdf

Dear Shiang Y1,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLA 2476A.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 3:59 PM

To: 'Teo. Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Y1' <shiangyi.hwang(@sompo.com.sg=;
assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur(@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBMS1 06J] & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.RO.50075.20.YLM]

Dear Shiang Y1,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLA 2476A on 17/02/2020.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-di@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 5:27 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi' <shiangyi.hwang(@sompo.com.sg=>,
assignments <assignmentsi@lkkauto.com=: SUR <sur(@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=

Subject: RE: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBM8106J & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.RO.50075.20.YLM]

Dear Grace,

Thank vou for the assignment.



Shiau Chan !LI{I{Autu)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 3:59 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi'; assignments; SUR

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'

Subject: RE: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBM8106) & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.

TCL.GCN.RO.50075.20.YLM]

Dear Shiang Y1,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLA 2476A on 17/02/2020.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{g408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 5:27 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo(@S0ompo.COM.SE=; 'Hwang. Shiang Y1' <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg=;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur(@lkkauto.com=

Ce: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBM8106J & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.R0.50075.20.YLM]

Dear Grace,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

Celine Fong

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo/@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 4:00 PM

To: Ruby Ong; Hwang, Shiang Y1, 'admin-d@]lkkauto.com’; 'assignments(@lkkauto.com'; 'SUR'
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Yap Lee Motor

Subject: CMTD2000539/SYH - LKK/ FBMS8106J & SLA2476A ACC ON 02.02.20 [OUR REF.
TCL.GCN.R0O.50075.20.YLM]

Our Reference; CMTD2000539/5YH
Your Reference: TCL.GCN.ro.50075.20.ylm
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Resources

Find your perfect drwg
save up to $22,500.
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r Used Car Comparisan

Toyota Corolla Altis 1

P o

Companng 4 Yehickes —- Toyota Coralla Altis 1.64

Toyota Coralla Altis 1.68 Toyota Corolla Altis 164

i*'

] Clear 24

Back to seanch resul i N =3 ;
Price 515,800 $16,800 517,500 $17,B00
Instalment N.A $5.909 §4,114 §2,523
Ragistration Date 05-Mar-2010 28-Apr-2010 05-Jun-2010 27-Jul-2010
Manufactured 010 2010 2010 W00
Mileage 154,800 km 147,000 km
Transmisshon Buto Aute Auta Auite
Engine Cap 1,568 oc 1,508 cc 1,598 cc 1,558 ec
Road Tax 742 fyr $742 fyr §742 fyr 742 fyr
Power 80,0 KW (107 bhp) BO.D kW (107 bhp) BO.D KW {107 bhp) 80,0 KW (107 bhp)
Curb Weight 1,195 kg 1,195 kg 1,195 kg 1,195 kg
Features Qriginal Features, - Good Engine, Smoath Drive, Seats Are -
Still Very Well Maintained, Feels Like
Fh:w. Good For COE Ranewal. Whalshpp
Accessories Off White Paint, Most Reliable And Fuel
Efficient Car,
Description Viery Well Maintained Wikh very el Przase Call For Viewing, Trade In Welcome, Ba
Care Interics, Optional For 5 Years/10 Losan Al Ayailabds, Intd
Years COE Renewal, For Wiawing, Viewing £
Dy,
COE §20,340 $30,000 526,102 $29,501
oMV 16,716 $16,716 $16,716 §16,680
ARF $16,716 $16,716 516,716 416,680
Dapraciation A, MN.A, MLA, MA,
No. of Dwners 2 1 2 |
Typa of Vehicle Sadan Sedan Sedan Sadan
Category PARF Car, Direct Owner Sala PARF Car PARF Car, Direct Owaer Sabk PARF Car
Avallability Available Avnilable Availabla Avallable

SELLER INFORMATION

Seller Direct Owner 5B Motoring Pre Lid Dérect Owinar Boeki Ao P Lid
Address - 3 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 #06-06 49 Sungel Kadut Loop
Office Number . Gr4TE02E . GTEE5005

Contact Persan Jeff Andy N [ Margaret Yeo Rezam Boeki



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owiner 1D Type:
Owener 1D

Company
070D

Wehicle Nao.:

Yehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

SLAZ4ATEA

Yes

19 Feb 2020

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Beige

2010

37724994395
MROS3ZEE1DA174152
0.0 kW (107 bhp)
$16,714.00

25 Mar 2010

25 Mar 2010

5

$16,714.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Yes
24 Mar 2020
$8.358.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:
COCE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The information centained hereinis correct as at 19 Feb 2020

OK

24 Mar 2020

& - Car (1600¢c & below]
10

$20.B02.00

$201.00

28 559.00



YAP LEE MOTOR

Reg. No. 52910085A
| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-26 Autobay(@Kaki Bukit Singapore 41 7883
Tel - 6844 1555 Fax. 6844 1311 Email : yap_lee_motor@singnet.com.sg

Date; 18th February 2020
Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.

50 Raffles Place Your Reference: FBWV 8106}
#05-01/06 T

Singapore Land Tower

Singapore 048623

Owner Name: AC Car Rental Pte Ltd

Accident Date: 2nd February 2020

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS FOR Togatq: Altis 1.6 SLA 2476A

No. Description Unit | Unit Price Amount
Spare Parts - List Items
1 |Rear Taillamps ¢ (~c 1 |$ 38000[$  380.00|
2 |Rear Bumper fora 1 |$ 600.00]|S 60000 75
3 |Rear Bumper side brackets Ak« <L~ - 1SE £ 97.00 | $ 97.00 | |
4 |Rear Bumper side retainers pu v+ 12 |$ 131005 131.001 “3
5 |Rearn/sfender ¥ 1 |$ 981605 981.60 |
" Q1 $ 2,189.60
R less25% |$  987.27
O Total $  1,202.33
Special Nett Items
1 |Rear bumperclip (1set) <4 1 |$ 3500]|5 35.007| »©
2 |Rear Reverse sensor ( 1 set ) f’::' 1 |$ 350.00|5 350.00 |-
3 Ror Wlreak Rian W T% Total S 385.00

4 g

Page 10of 2



YAP LEE MOTOR

Reg. No. 529100835A

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-26 Autobay@Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel : 6844 1555 Fax. 6844 1311 Email : yap_lee_motor@singnet.com.sg

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.

50

Raffles Place

#05-01/06
Singapore Land Tower
Singapore 048623

Owner Name:
Accident Date:

AC Car Rental Pte Ltd
2nd February 2020

Date: 18th February 2020

Your Reference: FEM 8106

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS FOR Toyota Altis 1.6 SLA 2476A

No. Description Unit Price Amount
Labour
To remove, refit, replaced damaged lamps |
0.00 80,00
L and check rear electrical wiring. » " ?
To e and refit inner garnishes, inner
5, |[EmaNEEnAiEiRINRCResis ¢ 15000|s  150.00 [*
trim to assist repair.
3 |To remove and refit reverse sensor. $  120.00 |S 120.001 4C
To apply undercoating on repaired and T
150.0 150001 A<
9 replaced panel 2 015 - -
To provide labour charges, workmanship to
dismantle above damaged parts, repair »
5 lincluding cut and weld; re-align body $  600.00 | S EW’ 0
structure and damaged consistent to the ,
accident.
To respray painting include polishing and ¥
6 |waxing on the changed body parts, repaired S  700.0015S TG}O@” Y
portions where consistent to the accident. :
Total $ 1,800.00 | /()
I /gSe50 Spare Parts - List Items Total S 1,202.33
L '~ |Special Nett items Total S 385.00
, | V_|Labour Total $  1,800.00
Grand Total | $  3,387,33 | 457120
ﬁ\-i Oea L
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref © CS/SMO20002692/Agf3n2
sosouma " T
#05-01/08 Date: 19-03-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, FBM B106. Veh. Inspected SLA 24T6A
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD200053%/5YH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  GRACE TEO Assign Date 17/02/2020
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1508
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. MROS3ZEE106174152 Colour GOLD
Odometer 243500 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85 R15 BRIDGESTOME & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/02/2020 |'Impuctinn Date 17/02/2020
Survey held at YAP LEE MOTOR
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-26 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uhi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: §256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLA 2476A
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i T Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition S=RETTNAY.
Qty pY Workshop (§)| _($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILLAMPS CRACKED 380.00 380.00
1|REAR BUMPER TORN 600.00 485.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKETS NOT MECESSARY 97.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS OIS NECESSARY 131.00 45.00
1|REAR N/S FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 981.60 I
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT =547 .40 -227.50
1,642.20 682.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 35.00 30.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 350.00 2
1|REAR WHEEL RIM (SN) cuT 700.00 400.00
1,085.00 430.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE, REFIT,REPLACED DAMAGED LAMPS AND 80.00 30.00
CHECK REAR ELECTRICAL WIRING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INMER GARMISHES,INNER TRIM [NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO ASSIST REPAIR.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 60.00
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING ON REPAIRED AND 150.00 50.00
REPLACED PANEL.
TO PROVIDE LABOUR CHARGES,WORKMANSHIP TO 600.00 300.00
DISMANTLE ABOVE DAMAGED PARTS,REPAIR
INCLUDING CUT AND WELD;RE-ALIGN BODY
STRUCTURE AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR N/S
FENDER.
TO RESPRAY PAINTING INCLUDE POLISHING AND 700.00 400.00
WAXING ON THE CHANGED BODY PARTS,REPAIRED
PORTIONS WHERE COMSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.
1,800.00 B40.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,527.20 1,952.50

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O20002692/Aqf3n2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20002692/Agf3n2

J % \f 2‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRT E,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sclely for the use v benafi of the Client 1 on tha frant page of this Report.




