Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 August 2020 1:16 pm
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SMG 7385 C.pdf
Attachments: SMG 7385 C.pdf; ATT00001.htm

Hi Kenneth,

Estimate is coming, please update me once your finalize is done.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Heng Yap Seng Auto Services <hysauto1122@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 13 August 2020 12:26 pm

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: SMG 7385 C.pdf

Begin forwarded message:

From: hysauto1122 @hotmail.com

Date: 13 August 2020 at 11:11:07 AM MYT

To: Kenneth Kong <kennethkong@|kkauto.com>
Subject: SMG 7385 C.pdf

Hi,

Kindly check for the estimate.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Heng Yap Seng Auto Services



