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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKB8523P AND SKQ7188B ON 09/02/2020

From: Chin, Lee-Ying

To: assignments, Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong

Sent: Thursday, 13 February, 2020 10:31:46 AM
Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey, vehicle in workshop.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Lee Ying, Chin

AIG

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1947
Lee-Ying.Chin@aig.com |www.aig.sg

From: Rachel Ling [mailto:jin@tcmg.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 February, 2020 9:36 AM

To: 'Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com' <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>; 'Hor, Yinrul' <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>
Cc: 'lhling@tcmg.com.sg' <lhling@tcmg.com.sg>; 'Jenny' <jenny@tcmg.com.sg>; 'zoomautowerks@gmail.com'
<zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Subject: PRE REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE FOR SKQ 7188 B | YOUR REF: SKB 8523 P OUR REF:
TCMG/SKQ7188B/0220/ZAW

Our Ref: TCMG/SKQ 7188 B/0220/ZAW
Your Ref: SKB 8523 P

PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION NOTICE
Dear Sirs,

We act forLeow Joon Ngee, the owner and/or driver of motor vehicle no. SKQ 7188 B, which was involved in an accident along Paya
Lebar towards Eunos Avenue 5 on 9" February 2020 at 19:20 hours.

We hereby give you NOTICE that we are claiming against your insured motor vehicle no.SKB 8523 P for damages and/or injuries, costs
and disbursements as a result of your insured’s negligence.

Kindly let us know if you wish to conduct a pre-repair inspection on our client’s motor vehicle at M/s Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd, (Block
15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-53, Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808), Elin Cai @ 9450 7920).

If we do not hear from you within the next two (2) working days, we shall deem that you have waived the requirement for the pre-
repair inspection.

Regards,
Rachel Ling

TOMMY CHOO, MARK GO LLC
151 Chin Swee Road
#14-15/16 Manhattan House
Singapore 169876

Tel: 6532 2455
Fax: 6538 9850
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