Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 April, 2020 5:18 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin

Cc: Admin A; 'claims’; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014
*** | KK REF: CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2

Attachments: STATEMENT jpg; AAD1405-282-LOD.PDF

Without Prejudice
Dear Wai Yin,
We refer further to your below email.

Please advise if there is any PIR, video footage or scene photos taken as our Insured reported that he was not aware
of this accident.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

B 7 74

P

" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 26 March, 2020 1:24 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; 'claims'

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** KK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

Importance: High

URGENT!

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Are there any offer making to us?



Our driver’s was making a stop due to in front of the vehicle applied brake, your client unable to stop in-time and hit
onto our taxi rear portion.

Hope can receive your offer as soon due to the time-bar period is approaching.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 March, 2020 2:54 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

Importance: High

URGENT!

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic
Are there any offer making to us?

Our driver’s was making a stop due to in front of the vehicle applied brake, your client unable to stop in-time and hit
onto our taxi rear portion.

Hope can receive your offer as soon due to the time-bar period is approaching.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764



From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 27 February, 2020 2:44 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2

Importance: High

URGENT!

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic
Are there any offer making to us?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 February, 2020 2:13 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

Importance: High

URGENT!

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Are there any offer making to us?

Hope can receive your offer as soon due to the time-bar period is approaching.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
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TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 14 February, 2020 3:42 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

Importance: High

URGENT!

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Are there any offer making to us?

Hope can receive your offer as soon due to the time-bar period is approaching.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 23 December, 2019 3:07 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'claims@transcab.com.sg' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Vic
Are there any offer making to us?

Enclosed is our LOD and our driver statement report for your easy reference.



Our driver’s was making a stop due to in front of the vehicle applied brake, your client unable to stop in-time and hit
onto our taxi rear portion.

Hope you can review this matter and let us have your best offer.

Circumstances of Accident

ON 25.05.2014 AT ABOUT 2055HRS, | WAS DRIVING AT THE EXTREME LEFT LANE OF BUANGKOK GREEN HEADIN
TOWARDS SENGKANG. WHILE TRAVELLING, THE VEHICLES IN FRONT OF ME HAD STOPPED. SO, | ALSC BRAKEL
AND STOPPED. WHILE STATIONARY, | SUDDEMLY FELT AN IMPACT FROM BEHIND AND REALIZED THAT A
MOTORCYCLE - FBED3311Z HAD HIT THE REAR PORTION OF MY TAXI. VEHICLE A - 2 CHILDREN 2 ADULTS VEHICL
- NQ PILLION
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Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 2 August, 2019 5:16 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'jasminetan’
<jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Please refer to the preceding email.
Any offer given to us for this case?
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er
Finance Department



TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"Cﬁg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 28 May, 2019 11:11 AM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'jasminetan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2

WITHOUT Prejudice

Dear Vic

Please refer to the above mention case.

May we have an update on the lasts claim settlement for this case?
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"Cﬁg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 14 March, 2019 11:30 AM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'jasminetan@transcab.com.sg' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'claims@transcab.com.sg'
<claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

WITHOUT Prejudice

Dear Vic



Please refer to the above mention case.

Are there any offer given to us for this case?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
ﬁcag e 69 “

Website: www.transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 7 January, 2019 1:14 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Any updates for this case?

Attached LOD and GIA report for your reference.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

L= Cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www .transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.



From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 2:40 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2

Without Prejudice

Dear VIC

We are making a claim against the owner of FBD9311Z

Enclose is our GIA report and LOD for your perusal and action.
Original hardcopy to be mailed to you by post.

We hope you can review this case and let us have your best offer.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"""Cﬁg |

Website: www .transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened

for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 10:13 AM

To: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG14010364/Kha3s2

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge

8



| CC3/A1G14010364/Kha3s2 Vic - 6841 2096

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 9:25 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1405-282-Accident involving FBD9311Z & SHD235Z on 25/5/2014

Dear Sir/Mdm

We are making a claim against the owner of FBD9311Z

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/..-—-‘cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www .transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
, T Www.avg.com
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