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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 10:01 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Yvonne Ng; Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLC5709Z

Attachments: SLC5709Z DV.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam 
Attached signed DV for your further action 
Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 
Singapore 737869 
H/P: 65- 69559351 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the  
Internet.

 
 
 

 

On Tue, Dec 15, 2020 at 2:02 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Thank you for acceptance. 

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 1:26 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLC5709Z 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

Without Prejudice 

We agreed to your proposed settlement of $12,600.00 dated on 11/12/2020 

Please let us have your DV the soonest 

Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 

#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

H/P: 65- 69559351 

 

  

  

  

On Fri, Dec 11, 2020 at 5:40 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SLC 5709Z 

LKK Ref: CC4/AIG20002540/Qrs3                                               Without Prejudice 
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Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 4359J AND SLC5 709Z ON 11/02/2020 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement at a global sum of $12,600.00(all-in). 

Please confirm acceptance. 

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 10 December 2020 2:10 PM 

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLC5709Z 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

Attached LOD/Invoice for SLC5709Z for your approval and early settlement 
Thanks & Best Regards 

S.T.Sim 

Manager  

Accident Reporting Center 

60 Jalan Lam Huat 
#04-35/36 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 

H/P: 65- 69559351 

 
  


