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Denise Tay !LKKAutu)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 January 2020 929 AM

To: Mor Ariar Binte Noordin

Cc Admin-D (LEKAuto)

Subject: RE: Urgent: MV for SLV2412Z (DOA:21/01/2020)
Dear Azian,

The market value for SV 24122 s 574K(est) asat Jan 2020

Hest Ragards,

Cenise Tay | Case Handler

L4K Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: sur@lidauto.com | fax: 62564315
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 2:01 PM

Subject: Urgent: MV for SLV2412Z (DOA:21/01/2020)

Importance: High

Dear all,

Flease let us have the market value for the above veh urgently. Details of the veh make and model is as per below.

Thanks.

Eest Regards

Mor Azian Binte Noordin
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian_MNoordin(@se.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
Sh44 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg, No. 200412212G | msig.com.sq o @ G

a viamve of [[EERERRNE] INSURANCE GROUP

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 2:01 PM

Subject: Urgent: MV for SLV2412Z (DOA:21/01/2020)

Importance: High

Cearall,

Please let us have the market value for the above veh urgently. Detalis of the veh make and model |s as per below.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Nor Azian Binte Moordin
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Bullding, Singapare 048581 | T: «65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. Mo, 200412212G | msig.com.sg o @ @

WRRWYEY INSURAMOE GROUP

A Membed of

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

\/ehicle Owner Particulars

Cwner |D Type

Company
Owner |D

469G

\/ehicle Details

\ehicle No.

SLV24127

Vehicle to be Exported

MNe

Intended Deregistration Date
31 Jan 2020

Vihitle Make

MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Mode|

ASX20CVT
Frimary Colour
Blue



fanufacturing Year

2017

Engine No.
4B11XK4497

Chassis No.
IMFXTGA2ZWIZ008110
Maximum Power Output
110.0 kW (147 bhp)
Cpen Market Value
$16,989.00

Ciriginal Registration Date
27 Dec 2017

First Registration Date

27 Dee 2017

Transfer Count

b

Actual ARF Paid
$16.989.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility

Yes

FARF Eligibility Expiry Date
26 Dec 2027

FARF Rebate Amount
$12,741.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date

26 Dec 2027

COE Category

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)

COE Period(Years)

10

QP Paid

$57,390.00 fAv- 7[}(
(OE Rebate Amount

$45,356.00

Total Rebate Amount

£58,097.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 28 Jan 2020
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