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Veron Chen !LKKAutu} HEE ﬂnn

From: Veran Chen (LKKAutD)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 10:56 AM

To: Loganathan Agoram; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Cc SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value for SLESB73X

Dear Logan,

The market value of SLE 5873X is $61K (Estimated) as at Jan 2020

Bes! Regards,

Vieron Chen | Case Handier ON BEHALF OF SHIRLEY
L{K Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ub| Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, 802-25 | S{408933)

From: Loganathan Agoram <lpganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent; Monday, 3 February 2020 10:50 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com?>

Ce: SUR ssur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value for SLES873X

Hi Team,

Flease assist to provide Market Value for vehicle SLESB73X.



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle e A

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Onwreer 10;

Viehicle No:
Vehicle to be Exported
intended Dereglstration Date:
Vehiche Make:

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Yes::

Engine No.

Chassis Nou
Maxdmum Power Output:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibllity:

PARF Elfglbfity Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
intended COE Rebate Details
COE Explry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perlod(Years):

QP Paid:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contaired hereln Is comect as 2t 31 Jin 2020

Thank you
Hegards,

LLagan
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2186
F +65 6725 0853

E loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg

Budiee: B

**‘*"ﬁ.'ﬂ

insurance . o

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

552H

SLESBTIX

Yaos

31 Jan 2020

MAZDA

MAZDAS 5-DOOR WAGON 204, SPAEAT SUNRCOF
Grey

2016

PELOA5D4T3I
IMECWI07 160124123
1110 kW (148 bhp)
$20.747.00

27 Jul 2016

27 il 2016

o

$21.04400

Yes
24 Jul 2026
$15784.00

26 Jul 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or $7KW (130bhg)
10

$57.01000

$36.57%.00

£52783.00



190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Sipgapore Shopping Centre
Slngapore

239924

autoégeneral

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
far the intended addresses. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged, If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
tasy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect
views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject ta copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the
intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure
cf this email Is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then
delete the emall. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.



\feron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Loganathan Agoram <leganathan.a@budgetdirect.comsg>
Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 10:50 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Ce: SUR

Subject: L/ Market Value for SLESB73X

Hi Team,

Please assist to provide Market Value for vehicle SLESB73X.

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

The Information contained herein s correct as 2t 31 Jan 2020

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 10 Type:

Owner 1D;

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo,
Vihicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Malke:

Vehicks Model:

Orimary Colour
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.

Chassis No:
Mandrmum Power Output:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Trarsfer Count:
Actusl ARF Paid:
intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Ellgibilty Expiry Date:
SARF Rebate Amount:
intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount

L

Thank you

Regards,

Logan

|-y N
Cloco5368 /LA
Singupcre NitiC Don : 4-0i.20%0

552H

SLESETIX

Yes

31 Jon 2020

MAZDA

MAZDAS S-DOOKR WAGON 200 SP SEAT SUNROOF
Grey

2014

PE10359473
IMACWID7 160124123
1110 kW (128 bbp)
$20.747.00

27 i 2056

27 il 2016

4]

$21.04400
- a5

Yes
26 Jul 2026
$15.784.00

26 Jul 2024

B - Car above 1500w ar #7kW (130bhp)
10

357.010.00

$34,979.00

§52.76300



Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2186
F +65 6725 0853

E loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg

-

P ect B

insurance . oo

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

180 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

438924

auto& general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General {SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore| Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pre. Limited,
fasy Compare {Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this emall and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect
views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the
intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waved and any use, interference with, or disclosure
cf this email s unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then
celete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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