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Yeron Chen !LKKAutu) ﬁuﬂﬂ!

From: Veron Chen (LKkKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2020 10:56 AM

To: Nor Azian Binte Noordin; SUR

Subject: RE: Urgent: MV for 5J59253T (DOA: 18/01/2020)
Dear Azian,

The market value of SJS 92597 is $26-28K (Estimated) as at Jan 2020

Hest Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phione: 6256-3561 | emall ssur@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Nor Azlan Binte Noordin <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2020 9:38 AM

Subject; Urgent: MV for 5159259T (DOA: 18/01/2020)

importance: High

Dear all,

Please let us have the market value for the above veh urgently. Details of the veh make and model is as per below.

Thanks.

Best Regards
Haor Azian Binte Noordin

Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian_Noordin@sg. msig-asia.com

MSIG

IASIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffies Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singgre 048581 | T: +65 6220
9544 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

¢ meener ot [[EETENRE] INSURANCE GROUP

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle



Owner ID Type
Singapore NRIC
Owner 1D

530Z

Vehicle No.

RIS9250T

Wehicle to be Exported

No

intended Deregistration Date
24 Jan 2020

Vehicle Make

HYUNDAI

\ehicle Model

130 (FD) 1.6 DOHC AUTO
Primary Colour

Black

Ianufacturing Year

2009

Engine No.
GAFCOLI666TTS

Chassis No.
KMHDC51DROU 184974
Maximum Power Qutput
#9.7 kW (120 bhp)

Open Market Value
$13.575.00

Original Registration Date
16 Sep 2009

First Registration Date

16 Sep 2009

Transfer Count

Actual ARF Paid
$13,575.00

PARF Eligibility
Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

PPARF Rebate Amount
$0.00

COE Expiry Date

31 Aug 2024

(.OE Category

A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years)



3
PQP Paid

$14,664.00

iZ0OE Rebate Amount
$13,497.00

Total Rebate Amount
$13,497.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The velicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is
earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Jan 2020

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e<mail {including amy attachments) may conizin Information that s privileged or corfidential. The sending of this e-ma|| to any
frerian other than the intended recipient (5 ndt & waiver of tho privilege or caofidentality, that attectes o0t 17 you ére ool bhe nlended
recipient, please notify the sender immodiately, dejete te emafl and do not copy, detrbute or dissiose its conlems



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin <NorAzian_Noordin@sg msig-asia.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 lanuary 2020 9:38 AM

Subject: Urgent: MV for 5J59259T (DCA: 18/01,/2020)

Impaortance: High

Dear all,

Please let us have the market value for the above veh urgently, Detalls of the veh make and model 15 as per below,

Thanks.

dest Regards

Nor Azian Binte Noordin
Zxecutive, Claims Services (Motor)
Jirect line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian_MNoordin@se. msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6210
3644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sq @

A memver ot [[EETERREY INSURANCE GROUP

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Dwner ID Type
Singapore NRIC
Dwner ID

3302

Yehicle No.

11892597

YYehicle to be Exported

No

intended Deregistration Date
24 Jan 2020

Vehicle Make

HYUNDAI

Vehicle Model

130 (FD) 1.6 DOHC AUTO
Primary Colour




Black

Manufacturing Year

2009

Engine No.
UAFCILI6667T8

Zhassis No.
KMHDCS1DROU 184974
Maximum Power Output
89.7 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value
$13,575.00

Original Registration Date
16 Sep 2009

=irst Registration Date

16 Sep 2009

Transfer Count

i

Actual ARF Paid
$13,575.00

PARF Eligibility

Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount
$0.00

COE Expiry Dat ;
;ilﬁug;E:E 426~ qu-;',K

COE Category

A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period{Years)

3

PaP Paid

$14,664.00

COE Rebate Amount
%13,497.00

Total Rebate Amount
$13,497.00

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is

earlier.
The information contained herein is correct asat 22 Jan 2020
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