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Veron Chen (LKKAuto) mag{us

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 8:36 AM

To: Jocelyn Mg: SUR

Subject: RE: MV - SGK2848S ; DOA: 17/01/2020
Dear Jocelyn,

The market value of SGK 28488 is $38K-$40K (Estimated) as at Jan 2020

Eest Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkautd.com | fax: 6256-4315

Hik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, HO2-25 | 5|408933)

From: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn_ng@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 4:16 PM

Subject: MV - SGK2848S ; DOA: 17/01/2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please help ta advise on the Market Value of the above mentioned vehicle.

Thank you

“ave a areat week ahead)

Jocelyn Ng

Executive, Claims Services

- +65 6594 2539 | F: +65 6225 7402 | jocelyn_ng@se.msig-asia.com

‘ MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F; +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 20041 2212G | msig.com.sq @ G

amemver of [[EERRE] NSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY MOTICE

Thes =mal {inchiding any altachments) may conlain inforiation that Is priviieged or confidential, The sending of this e-mal to any
pireion othor than the intended recipient, i nol a waivar of the prvilgas o confidentiality that attathes to it I you are nog the miteiided
recjpient, please nolify the sandear immedistaly, deleie the emall and de nall copy, distnbuts ar disclose its coptents.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
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Sther

2006

K20Z215007 16
JHMFD 264065200715
1140 kW (152 bhp)
$22 38600

03 Aug 2006

03 Auig .'.EI:ID&
A
$25,175.00

Fn:i"l_'li'tud

50,00

a- Car (1601 ¢x & above)
$51,630,00
$33,71200
$33,712.00
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Vehicle Details

SGK28485

Land ] rnnapm't&’hn hority

LY. El
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HONDA / CIVIC 2.0L A

P10 - Passenger Motor Car

Mormal

Propellant

Petrol

Motor No

Power Rating

Masimum Laden W i:._'ll.l|

1760 kg

w O Manufacture

2006

Enad Tax L.\,_li- U Dats
02 Aug 2020

Irspection Due Date

02 Aupg 2020

I"' L|||l I

Mo Attachmant

P

JHMFD 264065200715

K20Z21500718

1998 cc

114.0kW (152 bhp)

03 Aug 2006

B - Car (15801cc & abovel

Xy Lats

31 Jul 2026

20 Jan 2020
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Fees To Be Paid For Transfer

Transfer Fees $25.00
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