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22120 Merimen a-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)
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CLAIM 5UBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]
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CAI GUOYUAN, 1D SEEZ67EIG

Claimant:

| pomcleRed sMR1419X Date of Loss: (4/02/2020 18:00 - 5%
— e} = 'E
l Claim Type: TP/ SNM20D200670/GEI22962/CECILLA PANCHISEVET | DMCVYSNL90J061900 (Comarenansiva)
f lehicle Reqg Balicy M
| o GBIZZ96Z iClaimant). 3415009058 {PRE)
L (Impared)
Excens: S50.00
i Repaires: BW Workshop Sarvices Pro Ltd (HGQ) 291 Kaki Bukil Averue L, Shun L Ingustrial Park, 416080 aki Bukit - Tel: 6745 B300

F'r:;l?'&?“ China Talping Insurance {Singapore] Poe. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel; 638% 6111 .. [Handd by Cacllla Low - 63896530]

CIEMATES NTUC Income Insurance Co-oparative Ltd (HQ) - Tel
| Adjustor; LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 21/02/2020]
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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)
e

From: Cocilia Low <cecilialow@sg.cntaiping.com:

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February, 2020 1:30 PM

Te: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: lana@bw.com.sg; derek@bw.com.sg; Justin Ee

Subject: CTPIS rel: SNMZDD200670,/C02, Accident involving SMRL419X & GBJ2296Z Along

KPE Tunnel Towards Tampines O 04022020,

Dear Sirs

Please conduct survey on Direct Settlement basis, subject to TP workshop acceptance of the number of days of
LOU/LOR as recommended by you,
Thank vau.

Cecilia Low [Ms)
Senior Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance [Singapore] Pte. Ltd.
% Anson Road #15-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079905
DID; 165) 63826530 | F {B5) 6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A ¥ 5 Taiping 56

Digclavmer. This dermmi ang anp Sed banstitad with @ 5 mlesded anly for the ramed rcplants and may corlvn canfidaniial informetion. Any
UnAuionzed iScioewe, Ui o GREEanhahon af ifue MeSS e, AifNET ¥ whoda ar pulvival dmﬂﬂ'ﬁ' I'I"_Mu'&r'ﬂ Al e ilanded I‘ﬂf.;pl'mf. ,u.'am;u-
nohfy te sandor srmediately. Piease dolie he g-mad and any copes of @ hemeafior

From: lustin Ee [mailto:justin_se@bw com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2020 10:55 AM

To: Cecilia Low <cecilia.low@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: lama@bw . com.sg; derek@ bw.com.sg

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM2DD200670/GBI2296Z/CECILIA - Accident involving SMR1419X & GBI2296Z Along KPE
Tunnel Towards Tampines On 04022020,

Hi Cecilia,

Giood day,

Thank vou for vour email,

We would like to choose following the list: LKK - Adrian Ling.

Kindly assist as well let us know who officer in charge we would like to inquire about our liability
clearance,

I'hank vou so much. =)

Best regards,
Justin Ee
Waorkshop & Claims Advisor




- BW Workshop Services Pre Lid - www. bw.com.sg
Venture Cars Pte Ltd - www.venturecars.com.sg

291 Kaki Bukit Avenue 1
Shun Li Industrial Park, Singapore 416080

Main: 6745 8800 / Dial : 105 /
Fax: 6741 4140 7 HP : B435 3642
Email justin_ee@bw.com.sg

ARC - Accident Reporting Centre :

On Tue. 11 Feb 2020 at 1o:38, Cecilia Low <ececilia lowilsg cntaiping. com:=> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear =irs



We reter to vour email of even date.

We intend to conduct a Pre-Repair Survey of your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor
workshop.

We propose (o use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the survey as a single joint expert.

LEK /LBS/STA

Adrian Ling

kelvin Ang

See Chew Senp

Mohd Fadhilah Bin Csman
Xing Quo (lang

Kenneth Kong

=imon Ho

Chua Weijie

Marcus Chua

Henry Ng

You may select one of the listed motor survevors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey camied
out by the single joint expert,

If we do not hear from vou within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that the
surveyor appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

Thank vou.

Cecilia Low (Ms)
Senior Executive

Claims

China Taiping Ilnsurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Apson Road #15-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65} 6389 6530 | F:{65)6222 1033



Wi wwwsgentaiping.com | FB: www facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: 30T 8 Taiping 5G

Disclaimer: This s-mi and any fas ensmitied with it is infanded enly for the named recipients and may confain confidential informalion. Any
imButhoizey ECiosIVe, Use or disseminalion of s messags, eiher in whals or partial, is prohibited. ¥ you are nol the infended reciplant, plsase
ralfy he seader imunedislely, Plaase deeta the e-mai and any copdes of i theneaftar,

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Tuesday. 11 February 2020 4:54 PM

To: Cecilia Low <cecilia Jowwsg.entaiping.com™; Chee 50 Chow <socho alse cntaiping. com=;
Justin . eelabw com, s

Ce: Claims Dept of CTI <glaimsdeptialsg cntaiping. com=

Subject: OUR REF: SNM20D200670/GBI2296Z/CECILIA - Accident involving SMR1419X &
GBJ22967 Along KPE Tunnel Towards Tampines On 04/02/2020.

Dear Cecilia,

Please conduct PRS for SMR1419X.

Nate : officer in charge — Cecilia 63896330,

mA% K indly quote oue reference pumber when replying.

Thank you.

lgims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Towar Singapore Q79803

DID: (65) 63806116 | F: [65)6224T175

W: www sg.cntaiping com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsa! | WeGhat: AT ¥ Taiping $G



Dizclaimsr. This a-mai and any fles ransmifled with &5 infended only for the named mcipiants and may cantain confidenfial informabion. Any
anduiborized dEciosve, L0 or iEsemiaanon af [his message, aither i whok ar paviial, & prakibifed f pou are nol the inderdad recipren, pleaze
iy ihe sander iasmmadiataly. Fesse dalefe te e-mail and any coes af d Meresmar

From: Justin Ee <justin_colabw.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, Februwary 11,2020 ID 'DH AM
To: Chee 5o Chow <sochow,.cheeir
<glaimadeptaisg cntaiping.com>

Ce: Lana <l bw.com.sg>; Derek Low <derckirbw.com.se>

Subject: Fwd: Accident involving SMR1419X & GBI22967 Along KPE Tunnel Towards Tampines On
04/02/2020.

=; Claims Dept of CT1

Hi Ms. Chow,

Good day 1o you,

Much appreciated which you can help us to arrange for survey and officer in charge.

Thank vou so much. =)

Best repards,
Justin Le

Workshop & Claims Advisor

BW Workshop Services Pre Ltd - www.bw.com.sg

Venture Cars Pte Ltd - www.venturecars.com.sg

291 Kaki Bukit Avenue 1

Shun Li Industrial Park, Singapore 416080
5



Main: 6745 8800 / Dial : 105 /
Fax: 6741 g1q0 f HP : B438 4642

Email justin _ee@bw.com.sg

ARC - Accident Reporting Centre ¢

weeemeeeee FOrWERCD Messape —---—-

From: Justin Ee <justin_ceia bw.com sp>

Date: Mon, 10 Feb 2020 at 16:38

Subject: Accident mvolving SMR1419X & GBJ22962 Along KPE Tunnel Towards Tampines On
04022020

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdeptiaisg.cntaiping.com=>

Ce: Lapa <lanag bw. com.sp™>, Derek Low <derekiabw.com.sp>




Dear AllL

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above-mentioned case,

We herein attached the GIA Report & Estimate for direct settlement for your perusal.

Vehicle in the workshop waiting for survey and repair.

Kindly assist

Thank youw. =)

Best rigurnls,

Justin Ee

Workshop & Claims Advisor

BW Workshop Services Ple Lid = waow b com. sg

Venture Cars Pte Ltd - www.oventurecars,com.sg

291 Kaki Bukit Avenue 1

Shun Li Industrial Park, Singapore 416080

Main: 6745 8800 / Dial : 105 /
Fax: 6741 4140 f HP 1 8438 4642

Email justin _ee@bw.com.sg

ARC - Accident Reporting Centre :







20222 PARFICOE Rabate Erguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 790G
L vebice Details on o T e
Vehicle No.: SMR1419X
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 12 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: ESQUIRE HYBRID 7-3EATER 1.8 Gl
VT
Primary Colour; Black
Manufacturing Year: 2019
Engine No.: 2ZROE4A5678
Chassis Mo.: ZWRB00407680
Maxirum Power Output: 100.0 kW (134 bhp)
Open Market Value: $37.592.00
Original Registration Date: 20 Dec 2019
First Registration Date: 20 Dec 201%
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $34.629.00
L tenderd PARE Rebate Detalls o e sl
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 19 Dec 2029
PARF Rebate Amount; $25,971.00
[ seded COE REfate Deta)| S e S R
COE Expiry Date: 19 Dec 2029
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW
(130bhp)
COE Period({Years): 10
QP Paid: $40,009.00
COE Rebate Amount: £39.417.00
Total Rebate Amount: 465,388.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Feb 2020

OK

nbips:ier Lo goy sgitasvliacion'engquireRegateByPubicBeioreDereginpul FFUNCTICN _ID=FO304004T T



08022020 PARFICOE Rebate Enquery

* Back to OneMotaring
Enquire PARFACOE Rebate for Registered Viehicle

ehlcle Crwner Particudecs

remer 10 Tapes Siegapar: MAIC
Crwvner i TOo

Wighichs Detadis

Witk b Mo SERIA0TH
abirle i ke Eapartod L]

i Dieregitration Date; O Feh 200
ehicie Make v

‘el Pebunadid ESQUIRE HYERID T-5EATER 185 CNT
Primary Cotnwr: Elech
Manpcsuriing Yeah e

Ergire: lin ITROEASETE
Craritas P TR B0 B0
Pellam i Posver Dhipan 1O0AEW (134 Bhpd
Cigairin b o bt Wl S37.5%200
Original R gstragicon Dute ) D 2015
First Begatration Dulic 20Dz 2017
Transber Court: o

Actual ARF Paks £3as29 040
Interded PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligitil gy T

PARE Eligitilny Expiry Dape: 17 Dec 2039
PARF Rebans Amour S5 ATL00
Intendod COE Rebabe Detads

C0E Expiiy Datee 1% Dt 20ZF
COE Catepory: - Car abown 180008 & TR {1300 s
COE Parasdviears] 10

6P Prird Fo 00700
COE Rebate sumpuni: $32.007 00
Total Hebats fument $57, 570,00

Thee iniprnation corfaneil hirsn 15 comect 2y a1 06 Feb 2020

DK
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BW WORKSHOP SERVICES PTE LTD ; E; 2 )
291 KAKI BUKIT AVE 1 SHUN LI W

INDUSTRIAL PARK : é ] 17@75

Singapore 418080
6289 BADO gf{" {1] ]«91_
GST Registration Mo, - 201504834 E F flﬁ"l‘ &

workshop admin@bw com.sg
Company Regalration Mo, 201504B34E

e _ §146 o242
Estimates (gonf =
ADDRESS pr . ESTIMATES NO. 1178
CHINA TAIPING INSURANGE ﬁ"/ Ly / o DATE 10/02/2020
(SINGAPORE) FTE LTD
VIN NUMBER MAKE & MODEL MILEAGE
SMA1418X | ZWRB00407680 TOYOTA ESQUIRE HYBRID 1.8 -

CvT

ACTIVITY aTy e
REAR TAILGATE .~ fare 1 1,660.00
REAR TAILGATE Lock T 1 350.00
AEAR TAILGATE TRIM QUTER CHROME (1SET} ac/ $40.00
LOGO "ESQUIRE" ,.f* ‘:) e 1 75.00
LOGO "HYBRID" 1 65,00
REAR BUMPER _— (22 . L~ BE 1.970.00
REAR BLMPER SIDE RETAINER - LH & RH < HH % AA 170.00
REAR {-‘;UMF‘ ER SIDE SUPPORT BRACKET - LM & 2 175.00
RH 7
REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR -LH * ! 1 70.00
REAR BUMPER TOWING CAP .~ (& - 31 45.00
REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (1SET) P17 1 450.00
SIDE BUMPER - LH -~ 1 390,00
SIDE BUMPER REVERSE SEMEDH LH ~—¢pl 1 380,00
REAR END PANEL 1 810,00
TAILLAMF PANEL - LM/ 1 350.00
REAR ENC PANEL INNER GAANISH ~ 1 190,00
REAR CASGO COMPARTMENT BOX - CENTER 1 490.00
REAR SPARE TYRE BOX - CENTER 1 410.00
REAR TAILGATE INNER GARMISH 77 1 560,00
REARFENDER - LH o~ fte ' 1,400.00
REAR FENDER INNER GARNISH - LH 1 790.00
AEAR FENDER SLIDE DOOR CENTERRAL .~ M1G - 450,00
METS & Caahoaly
Cur Bank Dotaits:

Mame of Bank ; UO8

Accourt Neme - BW Workshop Senvices Pte Lid
Account Mumber A56-205-177-7

ARDILINT

1,860.00
850.00
640,00

75.00
65.00

1.970.00
240,00
350,00

T0.00
45.00
450.00
S380.00
380.00
210.00
360.00
190.00
450,00
410,00
580,00
0000
F30.00
450.00

—



AGTIVI

COVER - LH

REAR FENDER QUARTER VENT DUCT ASSY - LH -r?

REAR FENDER LAMP -LH o~ 7

AEAR WINJSCHEEN MOULDING - SN~ #E&

SEALANT SN~ 4,@: _

REAR BUMPERA CLIPS -3~

TQO REMOLVE CUT QUT DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL
BEATIMG, WEL LING, ALKGH, BEFIT AND TO
REMNEW AFFECTED DARTS.

TQ PUTTY AND RESPRAY ON AFFECTED
PORTIOMS

TO FOCUS TAILLAMPS. TO CHECK WIRING AND
LIGHTING OPERATION,

TOREMTVE ANT REFIT PEAR WINDSCREEN,
TO REMOVE ~NL HEFIT REAR FENOER (GLASS -
LH.

TO REMOVE ANL REFIT HEAAR UPHOLSTERY
TRIMMING, ROCF LINING, SEATS. SPEAKER
BOARD IN CRDER TO FACILITATE REPAIRING
WORKE

TO APPLY UINOEREFALING

TO CHECE ALD REALISHMENT ON CHASSIS
MEMBER

TO TRANSIFER TALGATES FTTINGS

TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR

TO REMOVE AnD REFIT PETROL TANK IN ORADER
TO FACILITATE REPAIRING WORKS.

TO TOW ALCIOLINT VEHICLE TO WORKSHOP BY
FLATRED T ks

LXK Auto Conulanty
the Repsirer of the ioliowing:
| = To rewrvey betors/sfier spray plnieg

o To diaplay damaged par(s) during My
# Pirts proe e sabyact I confimaion
# Third party Sufviy i on 8 “Withoul Prajudion”
# Mo Bogal modheabon|s| § slowsld -
* Suppler Ay Bemia) must be resurveped
NETS Eamumm-mm—ﬂ-

I 110.00
1 670.00

B5.00

2 45.00
10 &8.50

L 200.00

) 200,00

1 a0.00

1 120.00

1 120.00

1 100,00
1 200.00

1 G000
1 BO.00
1 150.00

1 150,00

SUBTOTAL
GET TOTAL
TOTAL

AMOLINT

110.00
670.00

Subtotal: 13,755.00

85.00
20.00
55.00

Subtotal: 230,00
St%ﬂv—flﬂﬂ 1.800.00

[ e 1,800.00

Z2a  aom
120,00
" B0.00
" 12000
9 & 1000
? 200,00
6& 100.00
For 8000
Lo 150.00

7 15000

Subtodal: 4,780.00

18,765.00
0.00

SGD 18,765.00



Accepted By

METS & Cash only,

Qur Bank Detaijls:-

Nama of Bank - LOB

Account Name : BW Workshop Sarvices Pte Lid
Acoount Mumbar :356-305-177-T

Accapted Date



