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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 5:18 pm

To: Shukhaizi Misbah

Cc: Cresendo Llurca Lagman; SUR

Subject: RE: SKP6553S-OD CLAIM/D.O.A-09.02.2020

Attachments: OD Template.zip

Dear Shukhaizi, 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKP 6553S Not Exceeding Repair 
Cost $16,000/- or which ever lower, (Excess $750/-). 
 

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 

8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before 

completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Shukhaizi Misbah <shukhaizi.misbah@simedarby.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 2:56 pm 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SKP6553S-OD CLAIM/D.O.A-09.02.2020 

 

Dear Shirley, 
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We able to repair within the limit and accept this offer. 

 

 

Thank you 
 
Shukhaizi 
Motor Claim Advisor I Body and Paint 
Performance Motors Limited 
303 Alexandra Road 
Sime Darby Performance Centre 
Singapore 159941 
Mobile (+65) 91165600 - Fax (+65) 64764601 
 

 

 

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 13 February, 2020 2:49 PM 

To: Shukhaizi Misbah <shukhaizi.misbah@simedarby.com.sg> 

Cc: Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SKP6553S-OD CLAIM/D.O.A-09.02.2020 

 
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
Dear Shukhaizi, 

 

According to our surveyor, the economical repair limit is at $16,000/-(subjected to insurance’s approval), Please 

check if able to repair within the amount. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 


