
1

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February, 2020 5:52 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP Claim SGS982H & SME4006C (AIG) *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20002402/ha3

Dear Vic 

 

We refer to your email. 

 

Regret that our client did not manage to record the incident. But our client mentioned that at that time the traffic 

was congestion he stopped and wait for the vehicle in front to clear and he noticed your insured vehicle, he stay put 

and let him pass, but your insured only look on his left and did not check the right side traffic and he just turn to the 

right and thus hitting our client car front portion and still continue scratched through the way. 

 

Our client is not at fault. 

 

Regards, 

Grace Chin 

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd 
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61 

Singapore 408717 

Tel: 6748 4422 

Fax: 6747 6720 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Saturday, February 22, 2020 1:25 PM 

To: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP Claim SGS982H & SME4006C (AIG) *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20002402/ha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Ms Chin, 

 

We refer further to our below email. 

 

Please be informed that our Insured had strongly denied liability for this accident. 

 

As such, we are currently looking into the matter and we would like to request for any evidence your client may have 

for our further action. 

 

Thank you.  
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 13 February, 2020 4:13 PM 

To: 'Chin' 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: TP Claim SGS982H & SME4006C (AIG) *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20002402/ha3 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ms Chin, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear subject to 

the BOLA guideline settlement. 

 

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 

your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 

consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 

number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: Chin [mailto:chin@modernautomotive.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 13 February, 2020 3:23 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: TP Claim SGS982H & SME4006C (AIG) *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20002402/ha3 

 

Dear Vic 

 

As spoke this morning, please revert the liability asap. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards, 

Grace Chin 

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd 
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61 

Singapore 408717 

Tel: 6748 4422 

Fax: 6747 6720 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2020 10:07 AM 

To: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP Claim SGS982H & SME4006C (AIG) *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20002402/ha3 

 

Dear Sirs / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Chin <chin@modernautomotive.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 February, 2020 11:40 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: TP Claim SGS982H & SME4006C (AIG) 

 

Dear Mei Kuan 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Kindly advise liability of the above accident as follow: 

 

Your Insured: SME4006C 

Our Insured: SGS982H 

DOA: 08.02.2020 

 

We enclosed herewith our client report for your perusal and please reply asap. 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards, 

Grace Chin 

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd 
Blk 3023-A, Ubi Road 1 #01-61 

Singapore 408717 

Tel: 6748 4422 

Fax: 6747 6720 

 


