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Re: FW: SLE 8365B finalization// LKK Ref: CC4/III20002380/Qps3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Wed 9/6/2021 3:58 PM
To:  Jerleen <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

1 attachments (580 KB)
DV_SLE8365B.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Jerleen,

We refer to the above matter.

We confirm settlement at $2,943.60(all-in) as per your LOD.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jerleen <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 May 2021 1:12 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Hi Hsiao Tong
 
Attached LOD
 
Thank you

Jerleen Tang

Claims Department
 

  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 

8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #06-31
PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT S(415875) 

T. 6661 9687 | F. 6661 9699 | W.huahong.com.sg

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
http://www.huahong.com.sg/
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 19 May 2021 5:00 PM

To: James <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FW: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.
 
Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: James <james@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 11:41 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
We confirm COR P/O $2451.03 before GST.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department

  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-31
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg
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From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: 03 May 2021 10:42

To: James

Cc: Jerleen Tang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FW: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Dear James,
 
Kindly refer the finalize amount $2,451.03. Repair day 3 days. (P/P, before gst).
 
Please confirm the COR by reply email.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: James [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg] 

Sent: Monday, 3 May, 2021 10:16 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jerleen Tang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FW: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please find the amended final audatex.
 
Kindly assist.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department

  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-31
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                  
 
 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: 03 May 2021 09:05

To: James

Cc: Jerleen Tang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: FW: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Dear James,
 
Please refer attachment.
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Please amend in audatex and email to me the final audatex.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: James [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg] 

Sent: Friday, 30 April, 2021 5:59 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jerleen Tang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FW: SLE 8365B finalization - 1st reminder
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Kindly assist.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department

  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-31
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                  
 
 
From: James Tan

Sent: 30 April 2021 09:45

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jerleen Tang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: FW: SLE 8365B finalization - 1st reminder
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Base on your marked calculation, the figure should be $2419.25.
 
Can you confirm? Or the figure should be $2559.79?
 
Please advise.
 
Thanks.
 
On Thu, 29 Apr 2021 at 18:36, James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg> wrote:

Dear sun pin,
 
We confirm COR P/P $2559.79 before GST
 
Thanks
 
On Thu, 29 Apr 2021, 6:03 pm Sun Pin (LKK Auto), <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Dear James,
 
2nd reminder
 
Please kindly assist to finalize at the soonest.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Tuesday, 27 April, 2021 5:45 PM

To: James Tan

Cc: adele@huahong.com.sg; Jerleen Tang; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLE 8365B finalization - 1st reminder
 
Dear James,
 
1st reminder
 
Please kindly assist to finalize at the soonest.
 
Thank you.
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Monday, 19 April, 2021 6:02 PM

To: James Tan; Admin A

Cc: Jerleen Tang; adele@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B finalization - Last reminder
 
Dear James,
 
Please find above attachment and re-adjust.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
 

LKK Auto Consultants
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
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From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg] 

Sent: Monday, 19 April, 2021 5:17 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto); Admin A

Cc: Jerleen Tang; adele@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B finalization - Last reminder
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Last reminder.
 
Please re-finalize at the soonest.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                

 
 
From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 2:35 pm

To: 'Sun Pin (LKK Auto)' <sunpin@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jerleen Tang' <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; 'adele@huahong.com.sg'
<adele@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B finalization
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please re-finalize at the soonest.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                

 
 
 
 
From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 9 April 2021 3:47 pm

To: 'Sun Pin (LKK Auto)' <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; 'adele@huahong.com.sg'
<adele@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
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Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please re-finalize the above mention case.
 
I have send you the dented rea end panel photo previously.
 
Kindly assist to re-finalize at the soonest, otherwise, we will have to hand this case to our
solicitor to process the claims.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                

 
 
 
 
From: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 9:36 am

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please find above attached for the rear end panel dented.
 
Kindly re-adjust.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                

 
 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 8:56 am

To: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
 
Dear James,
 
Please find above attached for adjust audatex and refinalize.
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Rear panel there have no photo to show any dented.
.
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
 

LKK Auto Consultants
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
 
 
 
 
From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg] 

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 1:57 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please find above attached for the adjusted audatex and finalize.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                

 
 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 10:34 am

To: James <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: SLE 8365B
 
Dear James,
 
Please send me the updated Audatex for this case ASAP. Insurance chasing.
 
Please refer attachment.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
 

LKK Auto Consultants
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Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
 
 
 
 






---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: "Sun Pin (LKK Auto)" <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

To: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Bcc: 

Date: Fri, 22 Jan 2021 02:16:08 +0000
Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
Dear James,
 
Please find above attachment and re-adjust.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
 

LKK Auto Consultants
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
 
 
 
From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg] 

Sent: Friday, January 22, 2021 9:36 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please find above attached for the rear end panel dented.
 
Kindly re-adjust.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg
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From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 8:56 am

To: James Tan <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
 
Dear James,
 
Please find above attached for adjust audatex and refinalize.
 
Rear panel there have no photo to show any dented.
.
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
 

LKK Auto Consultants
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
 
 
 
 
From: James Tan [mailto:james@huahong.com.sg] 

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 1:57 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SLE 8365B
 
Dear Sun Pin,
 
Please find above attached for the adjusted audatex and finalize.
 
Thanks.
 
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department
  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED 


25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332 

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

                

 
 
From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 16 November 2020 10:34 am

To: James <james@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Subject: SLE 8365B
 
Dear James,
 
Please send me the updated Audatex for this case ASAP. Insurance chasing.
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Please refer attachment.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor
 

LKK Auto Consultants
 

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933
 
 
 
 


 
--
Regards
James Tan
Claims Department

  HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

10 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

T. 6661 9693 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg
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