Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 10:00 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'Jason Tan'; lalita@mcclegalfirm.com

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 22221 (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L ON 02/02/2020 ***

Hi Mdm,

My customer do not have so many spare time to entertain hit and run fellow,
He will pass the claim to lawyer , meantime , he will follow up with the traffic police 10, make sure
Traffic Police side give an reply regarding the investigation result for hit and run

Thank you

Regards
Ryan

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 9:36 AM

To: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jason Tan' <jason@jadia.com.sg>; lalita@mcclegalfirm.com

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 2222L (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L
ON 02/02/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ryan,

This case has to be on hold for the time being.

As Ol has yet to approved to proceed DS.

As they are getting the evidence.

Thus, we will revert back to you once we have receive Ol evidence.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”



Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 March 2020 8:56 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jason Tan' <jason@jadia.com.sg>; lalita@mcclegalfirm.com

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 2222L (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L
ON 02/02/2020 ***

Hi Cecilia,
| feel no point keep email again.

We already provide the photo, please ask EQ insure to compare,
Since EQ insure to not admit liability, we shall just pass the claim to lawyer, same time to traffic Police department
to make the decision .

My customer willing to attend any court trial if need to do so,
The traffic police also contacting the witness.

Thank you & Regards

Ryan Soh ( Manager )

Handphone : 93825367 / 90030857 .
DirectLine : 64535654

Fax : 64591698

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 March 2020 5:26 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jason Tan' <jason@jadia.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 2222L (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L
ON 02/02/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ryan,



Attached as per your request.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 2 March 2020 5:15 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jason Tan' <jason@jadia.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 2222L (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L
ON 02/02/2020 ***

Hi Mdm,

Can provide me the reporting photos of rear view, so | can show my customer, not the same car?

Thank you & Regards

Ryan Soh ( Manager )

Handphone : 93825367 / 90030857 .
DirectLine : 64535654

Fax : 64591698

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 March 2020 5:06 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 2222L (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L
ON 02/02/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Ryan,

Only one photo? As this photo not able to see the vehicle plate number.
Not concrete enough to show Ol.

Kindly let us have a video footage.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd [mailto:aeexcel@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 2 March 2020 5:03 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SJK 2222L (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L
ON 02/02/2020 ***

Hi Cecilia,
Attach photo send by the witness
Thank you

Regards
Ryan Soh 93825367

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 March 2020 4:55 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF: SJK 22221 (OUR REF: CC6/EQI20002365/Kga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE 9936J & SJK 2222L ON
02/02/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

The liability is unclear.

Kindly let us have a copy of Video Footage / PIR to review the liability.
Attached is a copy of Ol’s report.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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