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»Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 February 2020 3:01 PM

To: ‘assignments’

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM20D200598/YP2735U/BEN & YOUR REF- SKF7833E - REQUEST

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKF7833E & YP2735U ON 31/01/2020

Dear Sirs
We refer to above matter.
Please assist to arrange for PRS survey of TP vehicle SKF7833E.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6175 | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: KEHi3 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and ma y contain confidential information. Any
) ssemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delste the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.5g>

Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2020 3:10 PM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM20D200598/YP2735U/BEN & YOUR REF: SKF7833E - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT -
SKF7833E & YP2735U ON 31/01/2020

Dear Sirs
We are agreeable to use a common surveyor below as the SJE.

LKK

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 8319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601



“ From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 6:12 PM

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D200598/YP2735U/BEN & YOUR REF: SKF7833E - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT -
SKF7833E & YP2735U ON 31/01/2020

[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear 3Sir,

We refer to your email dated 05 February 2020.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair

survey as a single joint expert.

LKK / LBS / STA

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WEIJIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried
out by the single joint expert.

If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that the
surveyor appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A0 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



From: Claims Dept of CTI

“Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2020 2:24 PM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>; pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg

Subject: OUR REF: SNM20D200598/YP2735U/BEN & YOUR REF: SKF7833E - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT -
SKF7833E & YP2735U ON 31/01/2020

Dear Ben,

Please conduct PRS -SKF7833E & revert liability soonest possible.
Officer in charge-Ben Tang-DID: 6389 6175.

Dear Caroline,

*** kindly quote our reference number when replying.***
Thank you.

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel: 6389 6116

Fax (65) 6224 7175 /6224 7478

Email : claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Website:www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, February 4, 2020 4:06 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKF7833E & YP2735U ON 31/01/2020

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct
Settlement.

Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.



Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 469E
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SKF7833E
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 19 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: B.MW.

Vehicle Model:

6501 GRAN COUPE SR LED NAV HUD M SPORT

Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2013

Engine No.: 20050518N63B44B
Chassis No.: WBA6B22010D28%330
Maximum Power Output: 330.0kW (442 bhp)
Open Market Value: $97,621.00

Original Registration Date: 25Jul 2013

First Registration Date: 25 Jul 2013
Transfer Count: 4

Actual ARF Paid: $147,718.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 24 Jul 2023

PARF Rebate Amount: $96,016.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 24 Jul 2023

COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $76,389.00

COE Rebate Amount: $26,202.00

Total Rebate Amount: $122,218.00

The information contained hereinis correct as at 19 Feb 2020

OK



2/19/2620 Used BMW 6 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SGCARMART.COM

New Cars Used Car Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory

Sell by Consignment

Login  Sign up

Products Insurance Articles Forum Reso

Consign your car to sell direct at the price you want without hassle.

No sale = no charges!

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Trust Motoring

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling
| Browse by étegory o
5 vehicles BMW 6
Model Price Depreciation
Search Selection BMW 6 Any Any

BMW 6 Series 640i Gran $105,800 $21,550 fyr
Coupe M-Sport

PRIME MOTOR & LEASING

[CHENG YONG CREDIT ENTERPRISES PTELTD GROUP OF COMPANIES]

With over 200 units of vehicles
to choose from, ranging from priTe=s =
all European to Japanese Makes. Lo S

Sort by Date Posted ¥ | |40 results/page

)
Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
2013 Any Any Any Availabl
27-Feb-2013 2,979 cc - Luxury Availabl

Consignment Unit! Rare Unit On Sales! Owner Letting Go Due To Upgrading! Flexible Financing At Lowest Interest In Town! 101%
Accident Free With No Modifications On! Free 6 Months Servicing From Our Reputable Workshop For Peace Of Mind! High Trade-in Avail...

Posted: 24-Jan-2020  Tags: 2013 BMW 640i, 2013 bmw 640i, BMW 640i, bmw 640i, BMW, 640i, Used BMW

GS Automobiles Pte Ltd

BMW 6 Series 640i Gran $153,000 $31,480 fyr
Coupe

Global Carz Pte Ltd

BMW 6 Series 640i Gran $140,800 $24,370 /yr
Coupe M-Sport

Prem Roy Motoring

More info about this shop

BMW 6 Series 640i Coupe M- $129,000 $19,040 fyr
Sport

BMW 6 Series 650i Coupe $134,800 $28,940 [yr / 27-Feb-2013 4,395 cc 76,000 km Sports Availabl

Owner Consignment Unit, Viewing By Appointment Only. All In Original And Stock Condition! Underutilized Unit, View To Believe! Loan
Facilities And Insurance Available! Trade In Most Welcomed! Call Our Sales Now To Arrange For A Viewing!

Posted: 25-Dec-2019  Tags: 2013 BMW 650i, 2013 bmw 650i, BMW 650i, bmw 650i, BMW, 6501, Used BMW

06-Jun-2013 2,979 cc 94,000 km Luxury Availabl

Excellent Condition, Accident Free, Trade In Are Welcome, Powerful Engine And Smooth Transmission. Perfect Condition! Call Us Today
To Book Appointment Before It's Gone. 100% Approval! Don't Miss Out This Golden Opportunity And Bring It Home Today! © FREMAIN

Posted: 09-Jan-2020  Tags: 2013 BMW 640i, 2013 bmw 6401, BMW 640i, bmw 640i, BMW, 640i, Used BMW

07-Jun-2013 2,979 cc 99,000 km Luxury Availab!

Rare BMW Individual Moonstone Color. Factory Spec M-Sport Performance Motors Unit! Serviced With PML! Careful Lady Owner. Most
Attractive M-Sport Model In The Market! This Unit Is Not To Be Missed. Owner Selling Has She Is Upgrading To Another Car. Consignme... (ConainmE

Posted: 21-Jan-2020  Tags: 2013 BMW 640i, 2013 bmw 640i, BMW 640i, bmw 640i, BMW, 640i, Used BMW

Godspeed AutoTechnik - Specialist for Bmw Car repair, servicing & maintenance

Godspeed AutoTechnik was established in 2014 to cater to the needs of their growing client base.

13-Dec-2013 2,979 cc 103,500 km Sports Availabl

Low Interest Rate Financing Available. All Trade In Welcome. 100% Accident Free, Well Maintained, View To Believe. Powerful And Quiet,
Don't Miss This Sporty Yet Elegant White Beauty, Call/SMS To Arrange A Viewing Now. Viewing Strictly By Appointment Only. L FAEHIUM |

Posted: 05-Feb-2020 Tags: 2013 BMW 640i, 2013 bmw 640, BMW 640i, bmw 640i, BMW, 6401, Used BMW

https:/iwww.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?ORD=RGD_ASC&MOD=BMW 6&RPG=40&VEH=0&RGD=20138AVL=2 112



MN1120014343 / NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd - HQ
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 01/02/2020 10:20
SUBMITTED BY: Ganesh Sinathambi

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctlx the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

01/02/2020 10:20
31/01/2020 13:00
NEW BRIDGE ROAD
SINGAFPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SKF7833E

NAH YONG KANG STEVEN (LAN YONGKANG)
S8014469E

STVNAH@GMAIL.COM

(LOCAL) +65-97319569

OFFICE-97319569

BMW
6501

LEISURE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

5114864626

DRIVO CLASSIC

NAH YONG KANG STEVEN (LAN YONGKANG)
S8014469E

14/05/1980

INDOOR

14/04/2000

19 YEARS AND 9 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-97319569

OFFICE-97319569
STVNAH@GMAIL.COM
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Address 968 DUNEARN ROAD #09-23 JARDIN
Postcode 589489

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| he_w_e_ been approacr_\ed by ur_1known _person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TQO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES
Remarks/ Reasans: FILE SIZE TOO BIG
Was there any audio recorded? NO
Vehicle Registration Number YP2735U

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver UNKNOWN
NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number UNKNOWN

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 0f 13



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

INCOME MOTOR SERVICE CENTRE Report Date & Start Time:  01.0272020/ 10:38

Report No: MT . D.O.A: 31/01/2020 Vehicle No SKF7833E

Reporting Type: o
Time: 13:00 hrs

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

S. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Assaciation of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties,

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapere (“GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer {collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shali be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the

- Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v} complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b) allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(¢} my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d) my Personal Informaticn will alse be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e) theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i) toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{ii} for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

as

01/02/20 / 10:38 01/02/20/ 10:38
Policyholder's Signature / Date & Time Driver's Signature (If driver is not the policyholder) / Date & Time

‘

Ganesh (8993561)
Customer Care Executive
Motor Service Centre

Witnessed by Reporting Centre Peronne!

Page 3 of 13



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

T
titititielpe

New Bridge Road

Vehicle A: SKF7833E Vehicle B: YP2735U

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

I was driving along New Bridge Road aproaching traffic light. As the traffic is red [ stationary my vehicle A. Suddenly vehicle B
went over the stop line and reverse. Moment after | saw his reversing, I did reverse to max as there was Bus behind me,
Unfortunately, vehicle B keep on reverse even though 1 keep horn and warn him. End up vehicle B collided to my vehicle A front
|part. No one was injured in this accident and T have video footage as a proof.

Declaration
- /
. e
I/'We decjare the foregoing particuiars are true in every respect. i /g ,"
P ‘/;f{l A ){( ;
A

Ganesh (8993561)
Customer Care Executive

01/02/20 / 10:38 01/02/20/ 10:38 Motor Service Centre

Policyholder’s Signature / Date & Time Driver's Signature (If driver is not the policyholder) / Dale & Time Witnessed by Reporting Centre Personnel

Page 4 of 13



-1 Auto Consultants hencee notify
the Repairer of thefellowing:
= LRE] resurvg /3fter Soray inting
‘_\' Wk v ¢ "l-' ispiagAamaged part(s) during resurvey
. L ices\are subjact to confirmation
BMW Dealer Performance Motors Limited IﬁQun{e‘ey 15 0n a*Without Prej
i ¢ - :
DA -21el 2: ;‘:g?a;? Tgizgfssﬁgﬁ Reg. No M2-0020081-x £5 ‘o “IEQW'C*'O allowed
o o TOll-Free Number (1800-2255263) 'Supplementaw item(s) must be resurve
0.¢ R o1rv2 s subject to final approval from Insurance ¥
0 Yo ol .o 303, Alexandra Road 280, Kampong Arang Road 315, Alexandra R
Wy - L \ Sime Darby Performance Centre East Coast Centre Sime Darby Busin Ceﬂtéﬁe .
~ singapore 159941 Singapore 438180 Singapore 159944 nowledged by Repairer
&N 'NT“‘L Fax. 64747770 Fax. 63449773 Fax. g:;;gggi agw:
Lrd- - Chinag Taiping Date:
GST REG. NO M2 - 0020081 - X
OCADLINE 13 027 2LdC ESTIMATE 04 FEB 7070
r A
Estimate No. : bl 54340 Page No. 1l of 4
Date Estimated 04/02/2020
| Prepared By Shukhaizi Bin Misbah )
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 135

Steven Nah

968 Dunearn Road
#09-23 Jardin Condo
Singapore

Singapore 589489

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 07990

.

REGN. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SKF7833E WBA6B22010D289330 25/07/2013 650iA GC 0

. 7
r A

DESCRIPTION VALUE

To replace front bumper including attachment and g g 9 2,550.00

repair front bonnet h
L |

Painting front bumper and front bonnet. 6/74 2,336.00

To replace both left and right headlights. § Sl ? 1,062.00

sundries 7 80.00

Total Labour 1: 6,028.00

DESCRIPTION QTY PRIC VALUE

GRILLE AIR INTAKE CENTER (M) >< 1 110.85 110.85

GRILLE AIR INTAKE LH (M) X 1 95.05 95.05

GRILLE AIR INTAKE RH (M) X 1 95.05 95.05

COVERING LH (M) X 1 28.70 28.70

PRIMED FRONT BUMPER TRIM (M) / [f 1 1,879.10 1,879.10

FRTLHGRILLE ~ (/] 1 199.35 199.35

FRTRHGRILLE 1 199.35 199.35

¥ BMWEMBLEM ~ ¢ 9 1 7160 71.60

"A LH ADAPTIVE HEADLIGHT (LED) . 1 4,502.25 4,502.25

RH ADAPTIVE HEADLIGHT (LED) 1 1 4,502.25 4,502.25

Sfm (L (K) wil Total Parts 11,683.55
:— >
9 / 1039 [0.99 on Labour 1 6,028.00 |

P ! Parts 11,683.55

p Labour 2 0.00

/2_7 &’/« Excess 0.00

W Total GST @ 7% 1,239.81

T days
J Grand Total 18,951.36

** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY**
** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **




