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Re: Letter of Claim for SGV 9134 P

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Thu 8/13/2020 10:57 AM
To:  Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

‘WITHOUT	PREJUDICE’
		SAVE	AS	TO	COSTS

Hi Elin,

We refer to our tele-conversa�on.

We have inform AIG that you would like to purchase our survey report to claim against the last
vehicle.

Please kindly prepare $473.00 cheque for the report fee in order for us to release the report.

Kindly advise if you accept so�copy of the report.

Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim
related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, July 11, 2020 12:24 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Le�er of Claim for SGV 9134 P
 
Dear Asher,

Kindly update us on the claim status.

Warmest Regards,
Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road 
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
)9450 7920

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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8zoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st
July 2018 -

On Thu, Feb 27, 2020 at 12:22 AM Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Asher,

- Without Prejudice - 

Enclosed please find Letter of Claim for your kind attention.
 
Look forward to your favorable reply.

Warmest Regards,
Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road 
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
)9450 7920
8zoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st
July 2018 -
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