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[MANDATE GIVEN] Re: Agree on liability RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident
Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on
08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH

Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Tue 9/29/2020 11:32 AM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Dear Asher,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
We agree to your recommenda�on to se�le the ma�er @ $6,980.50 (all in).
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
 
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 17 September 2020 7:32 pm
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Re: Agree on liability RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI :
FCI - TBA) and SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH
 

Your ref :D200000943MFSH

Our ref : CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3q2

 

Dear Sirs,

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8249E (OI) AND SJS 1530L (TP) ON 08/02/2020

 

We refer to the above matter.

 

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle.

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100%
liability.

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer "FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD "at$ 6,980.50 (all-in).

 

The summary is as follows: -

 

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised  

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $   16,144.27 $ 6,580.50  

2. Loss of Rental (4days x $180) $        720.00 $    400.00 (4days x $100)

Total $   16,864.27 $ 6,980.50  

 

Surveyor recommended 5days for repair.

 

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

 

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
 

From: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 12:47 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Agree on liability RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJS1530L
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH
 
Dear Asher,  
 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
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Please proceed with Express se�lement.(meaning that we agree to express se�lement)
 
Once the Preliminary report/Survey report in, please let us have a copy together with your email seeking for mandate. In
your email please also indicate your view on liability in the email , if there is any thing out of the ordinary, please indicate
also
 
A�er that we need to inform our Insured Driver about this claim( please wait for about 1 to 2 weeks a�er your send email
asking for mandate for us to give mandate).
 
If I did not response to you a�er 2 weeks, please call me or send me another email.
 
Jason Tea
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3860| 
Fax No. : 6507 3849|Email: JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
 
From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: 03 March 2020 17:42
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: [LIABILITY] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJS1530L (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH
 
Dear Jason
 
FYA, please follow up.
 
Thank.
 
 
Thanks and Regards,
 
SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept
 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-

mail.

 

 
 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 3, 2020 5:23 PM
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [LIABILITY] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI
- TBA) and SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF:
D200000943MFSH
 
Claim No: D200000943MFSH
LKK Ref: CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3
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Dear Sir/Madam,
 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8249E AND SJS 1530L ON 08/02/2020
 

We refer to the above matter.
 

Liability: 100%
 

Remark: B:27 OID REAR ENDED TP
 

Kindly let us have your approval on liability.
 

Thank You.
 

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 12:56 PM
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [LIABILITY] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI
- TBA) and SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF:
D200000943MFSH
 
Hi Jason,
 
We refer to the email below.
 
We have yet to received the third party estimate from the repairer.
 

Thank You.
 

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 

From: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 12:54 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [LIABILITY] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI
- TBA) and SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF:
D200000943MFSH
 
Dear Asher,
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IS the estimate given by the workshop, we need to know the amount first as we need to input reserves.
 
Jason Tea
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3860| 
Fax No. : 6507 3849|Email: JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer
to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee
or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this
message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately
by return e-mail
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: 27 February 2020 12:34
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: [LIABILITY] RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI -
TBA) and SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH
 
Claim No: D200000943MFSH
LKK Ref: CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8249E AND SJS 1530L ON 08/02/2020
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Liability: 100%
 
Remark: B:27 OID REAR ENDED TP
 
Kindly let us have your approval on liability.
 

Thank You.
 

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 

From: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 11:56 AM
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and
SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH
 
Dear Asher,
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Please refer to attached for our Insured SAS Report.
 
Please advise on the preliminary report and liability so that we can give you the instructions.
 
 
 
Jason Tea
Motor Claims Department
Working from another office
Temporary contact number : 68545087
 
*Dear All I will slow in responding to your email today as I am not in my office today. Sorry for the
inconvenience
 
From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 11:25 AM
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Asher Sng
(LKKAuto)' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJS1530L
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020 OUR REF: D200000943MFSH
 
Dear Jason
 
FYA, please follow up with LKK & refer to D20000943MFSH as per below email request.
 
 
To: Mai Kwan
 
Please refer to Mr. Jason Tea as the OIC of D20000943MFSH.
 
 
Thanks and Regards,
 
SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept
 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-

mail.

 

 
 

From: Aini Binte <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 10:57 AM
To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and
SJS1530L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020
 
PRI - D20000943MFSH (EXPRESS SETTLEMENT)
 
Thanks & Regards
 
Aini
Motor Claims Department
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849| Company Reg. No. 195000106C
 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.
If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately
by return e-mail.
 
 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Saturday, February 15, 2020 7:40 PM
To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK - Accident Involving SH8249E (OI : FCI - TBA) and SJS1530L
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/FCI20002245/Uea3) on 08/02/2020
 
Dear	Sirs	/	Madam,
	
We	refer	to	the	above	matter.
	
We	have	inspected	third	party	vehicle	SJS	1530L	at	M/s	Fastech	Auto	Pte	Ltd	-	Kaki	Bukit	on	a	WP	basis	and	TP
repairer	proposed	for	a	direct	settlement.
	
Enclosed	for	your	perusal	is:

-																TP	GIA	report
	
Please	be	informed	that	the	estimated	cost	of	repair	is	not	ready	yet.
	
We	will	revert	to	you	on	preliminary	advice	in	due	course.
	
Meanwhile,	kindly	provide	us	the	claim	reference	number	and	a	copy	of	your	insured’s	GIA	report	for	our	necessary
action.
	
Please	take	note	that	the	case	handler	in-charge	Asher	and	she	can	be	contacted	at	DID:	6841	6051.
	
To	check	availability	of	the	case	handler,	you	may	contact	the	undersigned.
	
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
 

http://www.msfirst-insurance.com.sg/
mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com
mailto:MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

