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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 29 June 2020 8:38 AM
To: Vincent Chua
Cc: AccReport
Subject: RE: Your ref: SHC6978D [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SH6500S AND 

SHC6978D ON 01/02/2020]
Attachments: SH6500S 01-02-2020.mp4

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6500S & SHC 6978D ON 01/02/2020 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Based on our insured’s video footage, your taxi suddenly moving out from stationary position and resulted 
accident.  
                                                                                                                                            
In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client’s 
claim. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Vincent Chua [mailto:vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 2:42 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: AccReport 
Subject: RE: Your ref: SHB6978D [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SH6500S AND SHB6978D ON 01/02/2020] 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
Hereby attached accident footage.  
 
We look forward to your offer.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Regards 
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Vincent Chua 
Claims Settlement Assistant 
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
 
Ad dre ss :  23  Chan g i  So u t h  Av e 2 ,  #0 1 - 02  S in gap ore  4 86 4 43  
Te l :  6 2 1 4 8 8 8 0 Ext  0 66  | D I D:   6 544  66 89  |  F ax :  6 21 4 1 51 1  
V is i t  u s  at :  w ww .p r e m i er t ax i .co m . sg  
 
 
NOTE: Please be informed that we have changed our email from Vincent.chua@premiertaxi.com to Vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg 

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 
 
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 


 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 16 March, 2020 10:45 AM 
To: Shafawati <shafawati.rabu@premierauto.com.sg> 
Cc: AccReport <AccReport@premierauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your ref: SHB6978D [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SH6500S AND SHB6978D ON 01/02/2020] 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Shafawati, 

Kindly let us have a copy of video footage for our viewing. 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 11 February 2020 5:43 PM 
To: Shafawati 
Subject: Your ref: SHB6978D [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SH6500S AND SHB6978D ON 01/02/2020] 
 
                                                Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6500S AND SHB 6978D ON 01/02/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's 
accident report for your perusal. 
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We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI we will 
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you 
heard further from us. 
 
Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us 
to look into the matter. 
 
We shall revert upon hearing from you. 
 
Thank You. 

 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 
 


