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ETHCZ

PLEASE ARRANGE TO SURVEY
VEHICLE AT 30 BUKIT BATOK
CRESCENT (5 658075)

()

Selamatshahh
CLAIM DEPARTMENT
DID : 66547519

Date : 29/01/2020 FAX
To : QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
ESTIMATION
Attn $ Motor Claim Department FAX
COhwner ] ETHOZ Group Lid
: SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
Certificate No . DITMTHCVEQDDDA3 Accident Date . | R/01/2020
Vehicle No . GBD4384-X Make & Model . NISSAN CABSTAR 3.0 G (M) EURO §
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS Excess © o 0.00 Add Excess 0,00
QTY  DESCRIPTION | REPAIRER AMT (5)  SURVEYOR APP.
Special Neti [tem - - [ .
| REAR ALUMINUM DOOR FRAME R b} #7 w Gov
| REAR ALUMINUM DOOR PANEL RH {47 T3040 §ov
| REAR DOOR WOODEN PANEL (+h #~ ety 2oV
| REAR ALUMINUM DOOR HINGE UPPER b4 7 25060 |SD
| REAR ALUMINUM DOOR HINGE LOwER 3 77 :‘;M.\ﬁ jsv
10 REAR DOOR RIVET agx /~ 50.00,
| REAR CABIN SIDE FRMAE PILLAR RH l,.r-ev RESTORE

PAGE I

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 Bukit Batok Crescent. Smngapore £58075 | Tel £319 8000 | Fax 6654 7547 | www ethazgioup.com



ETHCZ

Diate i 29/01/2020
To QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
ESTIMATION
Attn 2 Motor Claim Department FAX
Crwmer r ETHU;Gmup Lid R - R
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE, LTD
Centificate No . D17MTHCVEO00063 Accident Date . 18/01/2020
Vehicle No . GBD-4384-X Make & Model . NISSAN CABSTAR 3.0 G (M) EURO 5
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS Excess ;. 0.00 Add Excess ©  0.00

I oTy DESCRIFTION

REPAIRER AMT (§)  SURVEYOR APP.

Sub Toinl 2400.00

Labour & Misc e
1
LABOUR TO FACILITATE REFA,IR* 1500 POV

Sub Total fos™ Bals 750.00

3,150.00
Remarks:

3 c[ﬂ*)ﬂ o | SUBTOTAL
?_d,j: - #4,. .r-,f,..;.--' GST 7.0 % 220,50

TOTAL 33 7050
Surveyor's name: ?ﬂﬁﬁﬂ_ - H.'ﬁ ‘iu'mm GB’
Principal's nome: ETHOZ Group Lid
Survey Date & Time: o_s’/u—f'uw (ﬂ_ ljﬂ "")
PAGE 2

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 30 s Batok Grescent Singapore 858075 | Tel 6319 8000 | Fax 6654 7543 | www sthosgroup com
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Summier Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Andrew Lim <andrew.lim@gbe.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 5 February, 2020 4:.07 PM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com; claims@lkkauto.com
Cc: Admin A; Jenny Toh; claims-singapore
Subject: FW: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427 9"_ m‘\
Attachments: 2_20200203104039 pdf .
Importance: High P Zoya ]

gy 5Mmo
Dear Sirs, T "W

V-
Please help to arrange for survey at Ethoz Group

¢V

Insured: GZ2544P

TP: GBD43B4X

Date of Accident: 18/01/2019
Contact Details: As per emall below

Thank you.

Andrew Lim

Execulive

Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tewer, Singapore 048583
+65 G477 1243 | +65 6224 6633

WWabsile Linkedin Twitteq

& QBE

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Selamatshahh.Zainal@ethozgroup.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 3:22 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew lim@qgbe.com>

Cc: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee @ethozgroup.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@gqbe.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Importance: High

Hi Andrew,

Please assist to make the arrangement soonest for LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey at 30 Bukit Batok
Crescent.

Warmest regards,

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations



ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075

HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fax: 6654 7542
Website: .com

From: Selamatshahh Zainal

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 3:13 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew.lim @gbe.com>

Cc: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee@ethozgroup.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Hi Andrew,
Please make arrangement for LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey at Ethoz 30 Bukit Batok Crescent.
Warmest regards,

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore b58075

HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fax: 6654 7542
Website: www . ethozgroup.co

From: Andrew Lim [mailto:andrew. lim@gbe.com]

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 2:15 PM

To: Selamatshahh Zainal <Selamatshahh.Zainal@ethozgroup.com=>

Cc: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee @ethozgroup.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore @gbe.com>
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Dear Sir,

We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors:

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

Infinitl Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (S} Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to any of the motor surveyors.

Thank you.



Andrew Lim

Executive

Claims | Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6477 1243 | 465 6224 6633

Webaile Linkedin Tty

& QBE

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Selamatshahh Zainal@ethozgroup com>
Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 11:00 AM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew.lim .£om

Cc: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee@ethozgroup.com>

Subject: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X

Importance: High

Hi Maotor Claim,

Please assist to make arrangement for TP survey GBD4384X accident an 18/01/2020. Claiming against your insured
GZ2544P. A capy of the accident report and estimate is enclosed. Vehicle can be survey at Ethoz 30 Bukit Batok
Crescent.

Before we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this
notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you
within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Warmest regards,

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Maotor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075

HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fax: 6654 7542
Website: www.etho LCOMm

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be respansible nor liable
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay
in its receipt or damage to your system.

eeeeeaeeaeeceee IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any

k|




disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy
any hard copies produced.

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential Information intended only for the use of the addressee named
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay
in its receipt or damage to your system.

- IMPORTANT NQTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this
email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by
reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny toh@gbe com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 509 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Ce: claims-singapore; Andrew Lim

Subject: VCD13427 [REJECT CASE] RE Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref:
VCD13427

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Asher

Proceed to reject the third party claim.

__rEEur[ls
Jenny Toh
Senior Assisiant
Claims / Asia
1 Ralfles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore D48583
+B85 6224 6633 | <05 6477 1225

& QBE

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng @ lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 2:39 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew.lim@ghe.com>

Ce: claims-singapore <clums-singapore@ gbe.com>; Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe com>

Subject: [REJECT CASE] RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBRE Ref: V013427
Your rel: VC013427

Dear SirfMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 2544P (O1) & GBD 4384X (TP) ON 18/01/2020

We refer 1o the above matter

Based on both party report third party have opened the door when insured moving oul of the loading bay
We are of the opinion thut BOLA 264 shall be applied and the liability in not third party favour.
In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP cluim,

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.



Thank You.

Bes! Regoros,

Ashet Sng | Coe Honciler

LEE Aute Consultornty Ple Lid

pnons: s841-6051 | emal garenng@ikonro com | fox: 6740 -8108

Bik 51, Poya Ubl induairiad Pork_ (b Avenus |, #02-28 | 51408933)

From: Andrew Lim <aidrew lim o ghe com>

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 9:41 AM

To: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) < Methwan @ kkawto com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-u @ 1kkauto.com™; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) < AsherSng @ [kkauto com™; claims-singapore
<clms-singupore (i ghe com>: Jenny Toh <jenny oh @ gbe com>

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Hi Mei Kwan,
Our insured has reported.

Please find accident report as attached.

Andrew Lim

Executive, Claims

Claims | Asia

| Ratfles Quay. #28-10 South Tower, Singapora 048583
+B5 B47T7 1243 | +65 6224 6533

| PR e o ke by ser

S QBE

From: Andrew Lim

Sent: Monday, 10 February 2020 9:24 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ [kkauto, com®

Ce: Admin A <admin-g @ [kkauto.com™; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng ¢ Ikkauto com>: claims-singapore
<clums-smgapore @gbe.com>: Jenny Toh <jenny.1oh@gbe com>

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VCN13427

Dear Mei Kwan,
Our insured has not reported the acaident.

We will be sending them u non-reporting letter.



Thank you.

Andrew Lim

Execulive, Claims

Claims | Asia

| Ratfies Quay. #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B65 B477 1243 | +85 6224 6633

e TN g s

S QBE

From: Mei Kwun (LKKAuto) <Meikwun @ lkkanio.com®

Sent: Sunday, 9 February 2020 7:03 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew him @ gbe com®; Jenny Toh ~jenny oh 0 gbe.com™

Ce: Admin A <admin-a @ lkkino.com™>: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AshetSng @ lkkauo.com>
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

QBE ref: VC013427
LKK REF: CC4/QBEZ0002102/R1ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,
We had inspected TP vehicle GBD 4384X on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal 1s:
TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank v,

Best Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Fhone: dabb 0055 | email: MeiKwan@ | kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Bk 50, Paya Ubi Industeial Pack, Ubd Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408a55)

From: Andrew Lim [maito: andrew, imi@ghe,com]
Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 4:07 PM

To: assignments; claims@lkkauto,.com

Cc: Admin A; Jenny Toh; claims-singapore



Subject: FW: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: V(013427
Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

Please help to arrange for survey at Ethoz Group
Insured: GZ2544P

TP: GBD4IR4X

Date of Accident: 18/01/2019
Contact Details: As per email below

Thank vouw,

Andrew Lim

Executive

Claims | Asia

1 Raffies Quay. #2910 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6477 1243 | +B65 6224 6633

o TR it H st

& QBE

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Sclamatshabh Zamal @ ethorsronp.com®

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 3:22 PM

To: Andrew Lim <gndrew. lim @ gbe com>

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin Lee® ethozgroup com>: claims-singapore <claims-singupore @ghe com>; SUR
<surf lkkaumo com®

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC13427

Importance: High

Hi Andrew,

Please assist 1o make the arrangement soonest for LKK Auto Consultants 1o conduct the survey at 30 Bukit
Batok Crescent.

Warmest regards,

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075

HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fax: 6654 7542
Website: www.ethoze COHn




LMO®

From: Selamatshahh Zainal

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 3:13 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew lim@qgbe_com™

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin Lee @ ¢thozgroup.com®; claims-singapore <claims-singapore @gbe.com>
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Hi Andrew,

Please make arrangement for LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Litd to conduct the survey at Ethoz 30 Bukit Batok
Crescent

Wirmest regirds,

Selumatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 Bukut Batok Crescent Sigapore 638075
HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fux: 6654 7542

Website: www ethozgroup.com

From: Andrew Lim [mliocandrew lim @ gbe com|

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 2:15 PM

To: Selamatshahh Zainal <Sclomatshahh Zunul @ ctbosgroup.com>

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.l ce@ethozgroup.com®; claims-singapore <glaims-singapore @@ gbe com>
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Rei: VC013427

Dear Sir,

We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors:

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte Lid

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (5) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to any of the motor surveyors.

Thank vou



Andrew Lim

Executve

Claims Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
«B5 B47T7 1243 | +65 6224 6E33

Lok sl s

»QBE

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Sclumutshuhh Zainal @ ethozeroup com>
Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 11:00 AM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew . lim @ gbe com>

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.| ce @ ethozgroup.com>

Subject: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X

Importance: High

Hi Motor Claim,

Pleuse assist to make arrangement for TP survey GBD43B4X uccident on 18/01/2020. Cluming against your
insured GZ2S44P. A copy of the accident repont and estimate is enclosed. Vehicle can be survey al Ethoz 30
Bukit Batwk Crescent

Belore we proceed 1o repair the damaged vehicle, plense let us know within 2 working days of your recaipt ol
this notice whether you would hike to conduct a pre-repair survey of the velicle. If we do not recerve uny reply
from you within the supulated tumeline, we shall proceed to repuir the velicle without Turther reference o you.

Warmest regards,

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Buku Barok Crescemt Singupore 658075

HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fax: 6654 7542
Website: www ethozgroup.com

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee
named above. If you are not the mtended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use,
dissemination. distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by
mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks belore
opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has
been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed
in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group.

[



ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete transmission of the
information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system.
---------- — IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email 1s confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the itended recipient, uny use or dissemination of the information and uny disclosure
or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply email or telephone, You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information miended only for the use of the addressee
named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use,
dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by
mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before
opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integnity of this email or attiuched files has
been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed
in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group
ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete transmission of the
information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage 1o your system.
—————— IMPORTANT NOTICE - The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure
or copying of this email 1s unauthonsed and stnctly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy uny hard copies

produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure
or copying of this email 15 unauthorised and stnctly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The Information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
not the intended reciplent, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng [LKKAuta)
Sent: Friday, & March 2020 10:48 AM
To: Selamatshahh.Zainal@ethozgroup com
Cc: ChenSin Lee@ethozgroup com
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref VC013427 // ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBD 4384X AND GZ 2544P ON 18/01/2020
Attachments: Q| SEETCH PLAN. pdf
WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi SirfMdm,

We refer to the above matter.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 384X AND GZ 2544F ON 15/012020

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client door opened
and cause collided into our insured vehicle.
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o i LRl =] Qreats |
AL 0N

Apphcabla whethed dnver =
nside of outsads of vohicke

We are of the opinion that lability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances. we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and
unable to look into vour client’s claim.

Thank You

LLTER ]

Avher bng | Came Honokss



LEE Auto Comultants Me Lig

phore: 484 1-605] | emal gihemngildiguto com | fos §7al-4108
Ui 51, Poyo Ubl Industicd Pork. Ubs Avenus |, 802-25 | 5{4085933)

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Selamatshahh Zainal @ ethozoroup.com™

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 3:22 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew lim i gbe com>

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin.Lee@ethozeroup.com; clmm,l..-singu.pnn; <elpime-singapore@ ghe.com>: SUR
<surt®lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VCD13427

Importance: High

Hi Andrew,

Please assist to make the arrangement soanest for LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey at 30 Bukit
Batok Crescent

Warmest regards.

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075
HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7319 | Fax: 6654 7542

Wehsite: wwng; ethozgroup.com

From: Selamatshahh Zainal

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 3:13 PM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew lim @ gbe com™

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin Lee @ethozgroup.com>; elaims-singapore <cliins-singapore 6
Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Hi Andrew,

Please make arrangement for LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid to conduct the survey at Ethoz 30 Bukit Batok
Crescent

Wiarmest regards,

Selamatshahh Zainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ



ETHOZ GROUP LTD

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 638073

HP: 9624 86356 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fux: 6654 7542
Webhsite: www ethozgroup.com

From: Andrew Lim [multo:andrew lim @t gbe.com|

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 2:15 PM

To: Selamatshahh Zainal <Sclamatshahh Zainal @ ethozgroup.com>

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin Lee@ ethozgroup com™; claims-singapore <cliims-sinpapore 00 gbe com™

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X - QBE Ref: VC013427

Dear Sir,

We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors:

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessars Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priarity Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (5] Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to any of the motor surveyors.

Thank you.

Andrew Lim
Execulive

Claims | Asia
1 Ralfles Quay. #29-10 South Tower, Singapare 04B583
+B5 B477 1243 | +65 6224 6633

SQBE

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Selamatshahl Zainal @ ethoz eroup.com™
Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 1 1:00 AM

To: Andrew Lim <andrew. lim @ ghe.com>

Ce: Lee Chen Sin <ChenSin [ ee @ athozeroup com™

Subject: Request TP Claim Survey for GBD4384X

Importance: High

Hi Motor Claim,




Please assist to make amangement for TP survey GBDYIB4X acaident on [8M2020, Claiming against vour
msured GE2544P. A copy of the accidem repont and esnmate 15 enclosed. Vehicle can be survey at Ethoz 30
Hukit Batok Crescent.

Betore we proceed (o repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of
this notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply
from you within the stipulated tmeline, we shall proceed w repar the vehicle without further reference (o you,

Wirmest regirds,

Selamatshahh Lainal
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Operations

ETHOZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075
HP: 9624 8656 | DID: 6654 7519 | Fax: 6654 7542

Website: www ethozproup.com

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee
named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message vou are hereby notified that any use,
dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by
mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before
opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has
been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed
in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group.
ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor hable for the improper and meomplete transmission of the
mformation contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage 1o your system.
IMPORTANT NOTICE : The mformation in this emal 1s confidential and may also be
privileged, If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure
or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.
Disclaimer: This message may contwn confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee
named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use,
dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by
mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before
opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the mtegnity of this email or attached files has
been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed
in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group.
ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete transmission of the
information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system.
IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information mn this email 15 confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the imended recipient. any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure
or copying of this email 15 unauthonsed and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 68256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-9807198-R

CG‘-"DBEZII!JH D2/R1ea3q2

QBE INSURANCE .:smwone:, PTELTD

1 RAFFLES QUAY #29-10 SOUTH T ||I|IIII|||I|I
TOWERSINGAPORE 048583 s . I
Code: QBE

1 =i olicy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY ¢
Insured Veh Veh. Inspected
Policy No 8-V0014667-MVA-R002 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No VC013427 Excess ($) 0.00
05/02/2020

ANDREW

NISSAN CABSTAR 3.0 5M

Anlgn Ihtn

Mah & Hudtl c.c 2953
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. JN1SC2F2420856556 Colour BLUE
Odometer 19180 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR

Size
R/H Front Tyre [195R15 OHTSU 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre [195R15 OHTSU 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |165 R13(D) OHTSU |&/6 mm

Accident Date

165 R13 (D)

THE VEHICLE EUSTNNED DMGES AT THE HEAFI o5 Pﬂﬂﬂﬂﬂ
DA.MAGEB SEE DETAILS.

18/01/2020

05/02/2020
Survey held at ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT

SINGAPORE 658075

ﬁ]THE INEPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
8)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR It lNSTRUCTIGNS '-'E'E Hﬁ.\-‘E NCIT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NI‘JHMAL PERIGD FDR REPAIR:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, No: 199607198R GST Reg No. 18-8607188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 4384X

1|REAR ALUMINUM DOOR FRAME RH (SN BENT 800.00 400.00
1|REAR ALUMINIUM DOOR PANEL RH (SN) BENT 750.00 400.00
1|REAR DOOR WOODEN PANEL (SN} CRACKED 300.00 200.00
1|REAR ALUMINUM DOOR HINGE UPPER (SN) BENT 250,00 150.00
1|REAR ALUMINUM DOOR HINGE LOWER (SN) BENT 250.00 150.00
10|REAR DOOR RIVET (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR CABIN SIDE FRAME PILLAR RH (NPA) (SN} TO REPAIR SEE -
LABOUR
2,400.00 1,350.00
LABOUR
LABOUR TO FACILITATE REPAIR.INCLUSIVE OF THE 750.00 400.00
REPAIR OF REAR CABIN SIDE FRAME PILLAR RH.
750.00 400.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,150.00 1,750.00

I

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

DISTLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report ks made solaly lor the use snd benslt of ihe Clisni named on (he front pegs of this Report.

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE20002102/R1ea3q2

HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor




