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ki A = Pra L Company Bagistration ko 109960710

£1 URIAVE 1, #82-25 PAYA UHIISDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J0888% TEL : (W57 BIEHEERI FAN ;S alRed)

Your ref: CMTD2000589/SYH
Our ref: CS/SMO20002101/Uvd3 DATE: 11/2/2020
The Motor Claims Department

M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear SirMadam
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLH 5698U

We thank for your instruction on 6/2/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
10/2/2020 at the premises of M/s MB PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5510,835.20
Revised Estimate Amount  :882,714.50

"Check” Ilems Amount :5§3.304.70
Market Value 55
LTA Reimbursement Value :5%
Nett Value 5%
Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the hearside
rear o/s portion
rear m
Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



: Veron Chen !LKI(Autu]

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 February 2020 10:19 AM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; SUR; Hwang, Shiang Yi

Ce: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; "Henry, Irene James’

Subject: RE: CMTD2000589/SYH - LKK/ SBPB21P(nr} & SLH5698U ACC ON 05.02.20
Attachments: SLH 5698U PRELI ADVISED pdf

Dear Shiang Yi,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLH 5698U
Date of survey: 10/2/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Hest Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 62564315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 4:28 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com=>; SUR
<surf@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Hwang, Shiang Yi' <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg=>: "Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000589/SYH - LKK/ SBP821P(nr) & SLH5698U ACC ON 05.02.20

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

» Wishing you @ Hoppy ana rrosperous Lunar New Year -

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408933)



From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.leo@sompo.c
Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 1:59 PM
To: jong@mb-performance com; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments(@lkkauto.com'; surf@lkkauto.com
Ce: clement@mb-performance.com; Hwang, Shiang Yi; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James
Subject: CMTD2000589/SYH - LKK/ SBP821P(nr) & SLH5698U ACC ON 05.02.20

Our Reference: CMTD2000589/SYH
Your Reference: SLH5698U

Without Prejudice
Date: 06/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

QOUR Email: motorsurvey i sompo.coim. s

Attention:
M/S MB PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBPS821P & SLH5698U ON 05.02.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Marcus of LKK AUTO to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK AUTO,
Please make the arrangement to survey for SLH5698U on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.
Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Shiang Yi.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

O SOMPO - A century of Trust

INSURAN




~ Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

Download now (@ m or _

I Foor Travel, Personnl Accldent & Home Insurance | ¥ For Trovel, Personal Accident. Home & Provate Motor Insurmce

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the parson(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be urlawiul and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient. please delete this messags

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is P;;qurnm:dfraquimd by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

--=-Original Message—---

From: jong(@mb-performance.com <jo
Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2020 12:37 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.120/@SOmpo.com.sg=>

Ce: clement@mb-performance.com; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong
Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry @sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Re; CMTD2000589/SYH - PRI(NR) SBP821P & SLH5698U ACC ON 05.02.20

eriormance.com=>

Hi Grace,
We choose Marcus Chua from LKK.

tqtq

On 2020-02-06 12:06, Teo, Grace wrote:
> Our Reference: CMTD2000589/SYH

-

> Your Reference: SLH5698U

-

>

> WITHOUT PREJUDICE

>

> Date: 06/02/2020

> EMAIL ONLY

-

b

> OUR EMAIL: MOTORSURVEY @SOMPO.COM.SG
>

> ATTENTION

-]

> M/5 MB PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

-

> Dear SirYMadam,

-

> ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBPS821P & SLH5698U ON 05.02.2020
=

> We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 06/02/2020.
=



> Please be informed that MS, HWANG SHIANG Y1 is the handler of this
> case who can be contacted at 632935 205/ shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg
>,

i

> Please be informed that we have yet to receive our insured's accident

> report.

>

> We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your

> client's/your customer's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor

> workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the

> attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint

> expert.

-

> PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

>

> MOTOR SURVEYOR
>

> SURVEYOR

>

> SELECTION (INDICATE AS TICK)
>

>1

>

> Raleigh Services

-

> Andrew Ow Yong

>

> Vincent Ng

=

>2

=

> LKK Auto Consultants

>

> Kenneth Kong (North area)
-

> Marcus Chua (East area)
>

> Mohd Rasul (West area)

-

> Mohd Taufikh (West area)
=

>3

>

> Priority Services

>

> Jimmy Lee

>

> Lawrence Ng
=

> Jeffrey Ong

>

> Please let us know within TWO (2) WORKING DAYS whether you agree to
> the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint

> expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We

4



> will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single
> joint expert.

>

> Best Regards

-

> GRACE TEO

>

> Claims Division

-

> D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

-

> FOR MOTOR CLAIMS SURVEY REQUEST, PLEASE EMAIL TO
> MOTORSURVEY@SOMPO.COM.SG

>

> SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.

> 50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
> WEBSITE: www.sompo.com.sg [1] | FACEBOOK: www.facebook.com/SompoSG [2]
-

-

> QUICK & EASY CLAIMS SUBMISSIONI & PRODUCT PURCHASE2 VIA SOMPO SG
=

> DOWNLOAD NOW @ [3] OR [4]

-

> 1 For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel,

> Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

=

> DISCLAIMER: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the
> person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or legally
> privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of

> this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are not the
> intended recipient, please delete this message.

>

> PRIVACY POLICY NOTICE: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may
> collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated

> in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and

> associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is

> permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and

> agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here [5] for our Privacy

> Policy

>

> ——---Original Message-----

> From: jong@mb-performance.com <jong(@mb-performance.com=

> Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2020 10:02 AM

> To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>

> Subject: Notification of accident involving sbp 821 p

>

> Hi Officer In Charge,
>

> Please refer to attached.

=

> Thanks

>

>JY

>



"~ Nivitha !LI{K Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 1:59 PM

To: Jong@mb-performance.com; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@Ilkkauto.com’;
sur@Ikkauto.com

Cc: clement@mb-performance.com; Hwang, Shiang Yi; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry,
Irene James

Subject: CMTD2000589/SYH - LKK/ SBPB21P(nr) & SLH5698U ACC ON 050220

Attachments: GIA REPORT- SLH 5698 U6220.pdf; 11M. PERFORMANCE6220.pdf

Our Reference: CMTD2000589/SYH
Your Reference: SLH56981)

Without Prejudice
Date: 06/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvevi@sompo.cont.sg

Attention:
M/S MB PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBP821P & SLH5698L ON 05.02.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Marcus of LKK AUTO to canduct the survey,

Hi LKK AUTO,
Please make the arrangement to survey for SLHS698U on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.
Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Shiang Yi.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvevi@sompo.com.sg




(@& SOMPO
O A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte, Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

& App Store

* Google Play

Download now ‘a i
For Travel, Personal Aceident & Home Insurance | # For Truvel, Personnl Accident. Hotiie & Privite Motoe Tnsiroisee

Disclaimer: This e-mall, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andfor legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawiul and Is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies. credit bureau, paries to wham

disclosure is permitied/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Palicy

-----Original Message--—-

From: jong@mb-performance.com <jong@mb-performance.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2020 12:37 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teof@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: clement@mb-performance.com; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; Ye. Yong
Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Re: CMTD2000589/SYH - PRI(NR)/ SBP821P & SLH5698U ACC ON 05.02.20

Hi Grace,
We choose Marcus Chua from LKK.
tqtq

On 2020-02-06 12:06, Teo, Grace wrote:
> Our Reference: CMTD2000589/SYH

-

> Your Reference: SLH5698U

>

-

> WITHOUT PREJUDICE
>

> Date: 06/02/2020

> EMAIL ONLY

-3

-

> OUR EMAIL: MOTORSURVEY@SOMPO.COM.SG
=

> ATTENTION:

-

> M/S MB PERFORMANCE PTE LTD

-

> Dear Sir/Madam,

-t

> ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBP821P & SLH5698U ON 05.02.2020
2



L
© > We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 06/02/2020.

>

> Please be informed that MS. HWANG SHIANG YT is the handler of this

> case who can be contacted at 63295 205/ shiangyi hwang@sompo.com.sg
>,

>

> Please be informed that we have yet to receive our insured's accident
> report.

>

> We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your

> client's/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your motor

> workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the
> attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint

> expert.

>

> PRE-REPAIR SURVEY
>

>MOTOR SURVEYOR

>

> SURVEYOR

-

> SELECTION (INDICATE AS TICK)
-]

> 1

>

> Raleigh Services

-2

> Andrew Ow Yong
>

> Vincent Ng

>

>2

>

> LKK Auto Consultants
>

> Kenneth Kong (North area)
>

> Marcus Chua (East area)

=

> Mohd Rasul (West area)
==

> Mohd Taufikh (West area)
=

>3

>

> Priority Services
>

> Jimmy Lee

>

> Lawrence Ng

>

> Jeffrey Ong

=



> Please let us know within TWO (2) WORKING DAYS whether you agree to
" > the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint

> experl. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We

> will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single

> joint expert.

>
> Best Regards

>
> GRACE TEO

>

> Claims Division

-

> D: 63295170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

-

> FOR MOTOR CLAIMS SURVEY REQUEST, PLEASE EMAIL TO
> MOTORSURVEY@SOMPO.COM.SG

>

> SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.

> 50 Raffles Place. #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore (048623

> WEBSITE: www.sompo.com.sg [1] | FACEBOOK: www.facebook.com/SompoSG [2]
>

-

> QUICK & EASY CLAIMS SUBMISSION! & PRODUCT PURCHASE2 VIA SOMPO SG
>

> DOWNLOAD NOW @ [3] OR [4]

-

> | For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel,

> Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

>

> DISCLAIMER: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the
> person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or legally
> privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of

> this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are not the
> intended recipient, please delete this message.

>

> PRIVACY POLICY NOTICE: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may
> collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated

> in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and

> associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is

> permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and

> agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here [5] for our Privacy

> Policy

==

> «----Original Message--—-

> From: jong@mb-performance.com <jong@mb-performance.com>

> Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2020 10:02 AM

> To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>

> Subject: Notification of accident involving shp 821 p

-

> Hi Officer In Charge,

>

> Please refer to attached.
-

> Thanks



5 :
" >JY

>

> Links:

o

> [ 1] http://www.sompo.com.sg/

> [2] hup:/fwww. facebook.com/SompoSG

> [3] htps://itunes.apple.com/sg/app/sompo-sg/id 1387425777

>[4]

> https://play.google.com/store/apps/details?id=sg.com.sompo.sompoapp
> [5] https://www.sompo.com.sg/prc



Used NX Turbo NX2001 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2
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PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 144D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLH5698U

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: LEXUS NX200T EXECUTIVE
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: BARW365657
Chassis No.: JTIBARBZ902094550
Maximum Power Output: 175.0 kW (234 bhp)
Open Market Value: $41,971.00
Original Registration Date: 10 Nov 2016

First Registration Date: 10 Nov 2016
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $50,760.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 0% Nov 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $38,070.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 09 Nov 2026

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $56,340.00

COE Rebate Amount: $38,018.00

Total Rebate Amount: $76,088.00

Page | of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Feb 2020

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput?FUNCTION ID=F030... 10-Feb-20



MIEPERFORMA

Pte

NCE

Ltd

Co. Reg2005 126067

GST Reg. 20-0512606-7

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD ESTIMATE TP19020
50 RAFFLES PLACE #05-01/06 Diate : 06/02/2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWER SD48623 ’
Ref No SLH 5698 U
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIM DEPT OFFICER IN CHARGE Palicy Mo : 2100489492-03
Page 1
RE: VEHICLE NO. 5LH 5698 U LEXUS NX200T
[ Qty  Description Unit Price Amount |

B s e e R B e e s

RIGHT REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR
REAR BUMPER

REAR BUMPER LIP

REVERSE SENSOR

REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET

REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
RIGHT REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE
REAR EXHAUST BOX

REAR EXHAUST BOX MOUNTING

SPECIAL NETT ITEM
BOOT LOGO "NX200T"
BOOT LOGO "LEXUS"
REAR BUMPER CLIPS
CAR WRAP

L/C TO RECTIFY WIRING SYSTEM & SENSORS
L/C TO REMOVE & INSTALL EXHAUST

L/C FOR PANEL BEATING

SPRAY PAINTING

TOTAL (3)
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50 RAFFLES PLACE
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paye Ul Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL E256 3581 FAX 6256 4315
MNo: 189607188R GST Reg No. 18-9607 168-R

CE/8MO20002101/Uvd3n2

PARTY C

] l.lmp-cud T

Insured Veh SLH 56898U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No CMTD2000588/SYH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TED Assign Date D6/02/2020
Make & Model LEXUS NX200T (A) c.c 1908
Engine No HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No.  JTJBARBZB02084550 Colour MULT| COLOUR
Odometer 49803 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/60 R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/60 R18 BRIDGESTOMNE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/60 R18 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Rear Tyre [225/60 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm

-1‘:‘ « —

“In--.-. -“ni‘r Har o

TTHE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAG
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

ES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.

e ———

Accident Date  05/02/2020

Survey held at BLK 30224 UBI ROAD 1 #01-50
Repairer

MB PERFORMANCE PTELTD

A)THE IHSPEGH WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT P
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

Days ol
Elni gwin = i




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapors 408533
TEL: B256 3561 FAXN: 8258 4315

Reg No: 199807188R GST Reg. No 15-9607198-R Page No 1 of 2

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 5698U

1|RIGHT REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 125.50 -
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED / 7e8.30 789.30
DEFORMED
1|REAR BUMPER LIP GRAZED 485.20 49520
4|REVERSE SENSOR @$295.00 SERVICEABLE 1,180.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET @8§145.20 NOT NECESSARY 280.40
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE §99.20
LABOUR
1|RIGHT REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE TO REPAIR SEE 530.30
LABOUR
1|REAR EXHALST BOX TO REPAIR SEE 265080
LABOUR
2|REAR EXHAUST BOX MOUNTING @5$95.00 NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -120.45
B,860.70 1,165.05
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1]|BOOT LOGO "NX200T" (SN) NOT NECESSARY 135.00
1|BOOT LOGO "LEXUS" (SN) NOT NECESSARY 95.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS [SN) NECESSARY 80.00 50.00
1]CAR WRAP (SN) NECESSARY 1,300.00 500.00
1,620,00 550.00
LABOUR
L/IC TO RECTIFY WIRING SYSTEM & SENSORS. 180.00 50.00
L/C TO REMOVE & INSTALL EXHALIST. 250.00 100.00
L/C FOR PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 850.00 500,00
REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT RIGHT REAR
EXHAUST CHROME PIPE AND REAR EXHAUST BOX
SPRAY PAINTING., 1,100.00 450.00
2,.380.00 1,100.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,960.70 2,815.05

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20002101/Uvd3n2
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CHUA HAMNG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAMER OF LIMULITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report s mads solsly far the use anid benefil ol the Client named on the fronk page @l this Repert.
LE c L gty wels T part wiil: o et Ady Dhird party scin




