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51 UBIAVE 1, m1-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL 1 (065) 623683561 FAX : (0651 62264315

Your Ref: CMTD2000577/GPL Date: 10"™ February 2020
Our Ref: CS/SMO20002064/Uqf3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo [nsurance

Attn: Grace

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO__SLD 50368 .

We thank you for the instruction on _06/02/2020.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 07/02/2020 at the premises of M/s ABWIN SERVICE and have the
following to report.:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S 883387 .
Revised Estimate Amount ;88 362037
“Check” Items Amount - 5% -

Market Value : 8§ -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -

Nett Value : 5§ -
Description of Damage: R

e vehicle sustained €5 T

offwoe

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

Marcus Chua
Licensed Appraiser



" Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 10:42 AM

To: AbwinM83 - Sharifah; Gnoh, Pau Loong; ‘admin-d®@Ikkauto.com’;
‘assignments@lkkauto.com’; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD2000577/GPL - LKK/ FS5947P & SLDS036B ACC on 05/02/2020

Attachments: SAS52745736.PDF

Our Reference: CMTD2000577/GPL
Your Reference: SLDS0368

Without Prejudice
Date: 06/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

Dear Sharifah,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FS5947P & SLD5036B ON 05.02.2020

We refer to your emall reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK AUTO,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SLDS036B on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loang is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 217/
Pauloong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg .

Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Mr. Pau Loong,

Thank you.

Best Regaras

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T 6461 65655 | F: 6221 3147



For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey

G SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid.
50 Raffies Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoeSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

® App Store

Download now (a or
For Travel Personal Accident & Home Insurmnee | ¥ For Trmvel Personal Accident. Hivne & Private Motor Ihsurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments. /s intended for the person(s) or company named and may conlain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disciosure, copying or use of this information may be uniawful and 1s prohibitad
If you are not the intended recipient. please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pt Lid may collect, Use and disciose your personal data for the purposes
siated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disciosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is parmitted/required by laws, our third party service prowiders and agents (acting on our behalf) Please click hare for
our Privacy Policy

From: AbwinM?9 - Sharifah <sharifah@abwinm9.com:

Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2020 10:25 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Gnoh, Pau Loong <Paul.oong.Gnoh(@sompo.com.sg>
Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James
<irene.henry(@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000577/GPL - PRI/ FS5947P & SLD5036B ACC on 05/02/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Grace

Please proceed to appoint LKK for the PRI
Thank you.

Sharifah (Ms)

Claims Executive
DID +65 6713 9408 M +65 9848 2243

ABWINE

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T +65 67139400 | F+65 6713 9415

No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4

#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809
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From: Teo, Grace [mailto:orace. teola sompo.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 9:48 AM

To: AbwinM9 - Sharifah <shanfahiwabwinmY.com>; Gnoh, Pau Loong
<Pauloong. Gnohiisompo.com.sg>

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvi
<irenc.henrv/@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD2000577/GPL - PRI/ FS5947P & SLD5036B ACC on 05/02/2020

p.com,se>; Henry, Irene James

QOur Reference: CMTD2000577/GPL
Your Reference: SLDS0368

Without Prejudice
Date: 06/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Emall: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

Dear Sharifah,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING F55947P & SLD50368 ON 05.02.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 05/02/2020.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 217/
Pauloong Gnoh@sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the mator surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Maohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jlimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong




Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 632295170 | T 6461 6555 | F: 6221 2147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANC E

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place. #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? vin Sompo SG

. )“«im.':_itar.{:

Download now @ o .
"For Travel, Persongd Accidenm & Home Insimneg | = For Travel, Persooal Acciden. Home & Privale Mot Insuramee

Disclaimer: This e-mall, including attachments, Is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged infarmation. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be uniawful and Is prohibited
I you are not the intended reciplent, please delete this message,

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure 1o holding and associaled companies, credit bureau, parties {o whom
disclosure is parmitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Pisase click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: AbwinM9 - Sharifah <sharifuh @ abwinm®.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2020 4:46 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvevid' sompo.com. sg>

Subject: PRI - Accident Involving SLD5036B & FS5947P on 05/02/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/ Mdm
We have been appointed by MR YANG WEIHAL the registered owner of vehicle no. SLDS036B to claim

damages against you in connection with a road waffic accident involving SLD5036B & FS3947P on
05/02/2020 at around 0840hrs along CLEMENTI ROAD (SLIP ROAD TOWARDS AYE).

Please arrange for your surveyor to conduct the Pre-repair Inspection soonest at our premises (please let us
have the available date/timing):

Workshop Location:
Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4
#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809



Please note that if you fail to arrange the pre-repair inspection within the next two (2) working davs
excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday and/or Public Holiday. our workshop will commence the repair
works mthuut any further notice or reference to you.

Thank you.

Sharifah (Ms)
Claims Executive
DID +65 6713 9408 M +65 9848 2243

9ABWINZ

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

T+6567139400 | F +65 6713 9415

No. 17 Kaki Bukit Road 4

#01-60 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417809

mﬁ*"lﬂfmo &3
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Shiau Chan SLI{I{Autn] ——————————————————————————

From: Shiau Chan {LKKAuto]

Sent: Monday, 10 February 2020 1:37 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; 'Gnoh, Pau Loong'; assignments; SUR

Cc: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James'

Subject: RE: CMTD2000577/GPL - LKK/ F55947P & SLD50368 ACC on 05/02/2020
Attachments: CSSMO20002064Uqf3 pdf

Dear Mr Gnoh,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLD 5036B.

Best Regards,

Shinu Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phione: 6256-3561 | email: stewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-47315
Blk 51, Poya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-di@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 11:04 AM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Gnoh, Pau Loong' <Paul.oong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments(@lkkauto.com>; SUR <surf@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; ‘Henry, Irene James'
<irene.henry(@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000577/GPL - LKK/ FS3947P & SLD5036B ACC on 05/02/2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.

4 Wishing you a Happy ana Frosperous Lunar New Yeg,

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments/@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.leod sompo.conLsg>
Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 10:42 AM

oong. Gnoh/@sompo.com.sg>; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’ <admin-da [kkauto.com=;
'assignments(@lkkauto.com' <assi d/ lkkauto.com>; suri [kkauto.com

Ce: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ve@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James

<jrene henrv@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD2000577/GPL - LKK/ FS5947P & SLD5036B ACC on 05/02/2020

Our Reference: CMTD2000577/GPL



20 Used veze| Car & Usad Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarhart
SGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars e Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Foru

ANNOUNCING Carway

as sgCarMart Premium Dealer for the 3" Consecutive Year

Post an Advertisement
Sell It yourselfl Advertisa It at Just

$58 until it's SOLD!

DML TOME CRECET EWNTIRPRISES FTE LTD i

ct Ot 'l'ﬁll:.mr'?'ﬂﬂ uhits of ":'Im“
" T T " : 12 choose fram, ranging from
an & Advertisar Logr wirys of Selling all Eﬂfu'pmu.liﬂlln&l Makws.
Browse by Category v *Back(12345)Next - 20ct by Dite Posted): ¥V
98 vehicles versl b
Model Price Depreciaton Eng Cap Milaage Veh Type
Search Selection verel Arry Ay 2016 Arry Ay Arvy
Honda Vezel Hybrid 1.5A RS $70,800 $9,630 fyr J0-Dec-2016 1.496 cc 63,000 km Suv
Honda Sensing
Fuel Type: Petrol-Electric

RS Model, Only 1 Unit Left, 1 Owner Only, 100% Accident Frae. Extremely High Quality Interior. Original Japan Full Kit, Alloy Rim.
Different Fram Others, HID And LED Fog Lamp. View Now! High ARF $8.843.

Posted: OV -Fab-2020 Tegs: 2016 Monda Vezel 2016 honda versl Hords Vessl honda vessl, Honds, Vessl vezel, Used Handa

Honda Vers| 1.54 X $61.800 $8,750 fyr 02-Aug-2016 1,496 cc 38,000 km suv

Cheapest In The Market, Non PHVI Full Loan Avallable, Immediate Transfer For Cash Deal. Extremely Well Taken Care Of By 1 Singie
Owiner, Accident Free Condition, Original Palntwork Since Day 1. View To Belleve! Bank And In Mouse Loan Avaliable! In Mouse Loan Init

Heritage Auto Enterprise Pte Lid

Peting Fel- 2020 Tags: 2016 Honda Viersl, JO16 nonda i, Vondd Vesel, honda verel, Honda, Verel vessl L i vl

Honda Vexsl 1,54 X $61,800 $8,530 fyr 3-Aug-2016 1,496 cc 63,850 km SUvY

Dan't Miss This Supert Condition Vezel 1.5A, See To Fall In Love On First Sight! 1 Lady Owner, Non Private Hire/Leasing Car, Genuine
Low Mileage Done E3850km, Just Done Major Senicing In Sept 19 With Proaf. New Paimtwork/Dunlop Tyres. 100% Accident Frea, Call

Lake View Credit Pte Ltd

Posted: 06-Feb-2020 Tags 2018 Honda vered, 2018 honda verel, Honga Vierel, honda vessl. H snidn. Viezel verel Used Honds

Honda Vezel 1.5A X $59,800 $8,830 fyr 27-Ape-2016 1,496 cc 40,268 km SuvV

Low Mikeage. 1 Owner! Weall Maintained Unitl Selling Chieap! Practical And Fuel EMickant SUW Spacious And Easy To Maintain| Full Loan
And High Trade In Available! Flexible Loan Avallsble With Fast And Easy Loan Apgrovall Immediate Transfer Of Ownership Upon Collect],

Benefit Auto Enterprse Pte Ltg

Posted: D5-Febi-2020  Tags: 2016 Honda Vess| 2012 honda versl, Honda Vezel honga wezel, Heta Vel vasel, Used Honda

Door Visor
Honda Vezrel Door Visor

More Info about this product

Honda Vezel 1.54 X $60,800 §9,550 fyr 06-Jan-2016 1,496 cc 51,765 km =T

fy Silver Vierel With Red Lesther Intsrior And Upgraded Mugen Front Grill s Definitely Not To Be Missed) Loan Intersst Starts
%, Both Bank And In House Lonn Available. Do Call Our Sales Consultant For A Viewlng!

fiips-iwww sgcarmart com/used_cars/listing. php?MOD=vezel8 PRC=0ADEP=0ARGD=20 1BEVEH=08AVL=2 104
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOE Rabate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.;

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
224H

SLD5034B

No

07 Feb 2020
HONDA

VEZEL 1.5X CVT
White

2015
L15B4032157
RU11112152
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$20,982.00

20 Jun 2016

20 Jun 2016

0

$11.375.00

Yes
19 Jun 2026
$8,531.00

19 Jun 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$£53.694.00

$34,185.00

$42,716.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Feb 2020

https: vl lta.gov sgitaivrifaction/anguireRebata ByPublicBaforeDereginput TFUNCTION_ID=FO304008TT

1



ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

17 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#01-60 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE SINGAPORE 417808

fal: 67138400 Fax: 67130415
Email. serdcacentref@abwinmf.com Website, wwwabwinmé cam
Company Reg. No; 20131868856 GST Rag. Mo: 2013186850

oy

mw

SeviceCenie =

ESTIMATED COST: HQQO00268

TO  : SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD ] / ‘/{ XD  DATE : 07-FEB-2020
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT MAKE : lggnﬁ
SLD50368 £ .;,_:&Ei—-( CHASSIS NO : RU11112152
MR YANG WETHAI ENGINE NO L1584032157
BLK 4948 TAMPINES . 0% EIEIWICE ADVISOR SHARIFAH
AVENUE 9 / PAEE : 1 OF 2
#07-460 /f' [
SINGAPORE 520494 -
CONTACT NO : 82980964
QTY  DESCRIPTION REPAIR AMOUNT (SGD)  SURVEYOR APP (SGD)
LIST ITEM { -
1 TAILGATE 4,459 g 1,155.00
L5} —_—
1 TAIL GATE LOCK a1 X e 172.70 X
1 REAR BUMPER W) 510,077
I REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH o 752 19.25
1 REAR BUMPER REFLECTORLH 4 7 ¥ 155.10 X
1 TAIL GATE EMBLEM T A Y 20.70 X
I TAIL GATE EMBLEM "VEZEL" ALy ~— 4730~
1 REAR END PAMEL ﬁv -X 453.00 A
1 REAREND PANELTOP GARNISH /171 XU 101.50 X
1 TAILGATELAMPLH 11 291.05 X
I TAIL LAMP LH 19X 485.65 K
| REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING 444 ~— 132,00 .~
1 TAIL GATE LOCKSENSOR 717 X 193.05 X
1 TAIL GATE INNER HANDLE /127 X 27.50 X
I TAIL GATE WEATHERSTRIP oY) A 101.50%
1 REAR SMART BUZZER 4 88.00~
1 REAR EXTENSION PANELLH /L X QJL 176.00 X
1 REAR CHASSIS BEAMLH /41 104.50 X
Sub Total 4,233.87 0.00
tu—l/'{
1 gf REVERSE SENSOR S iy, 380.00 100
REVERSE CAMERA /7" }k 480.00 %
10 REAR BUMPER CLIPs /Lt 50.00 L~
I REAR END PANEL SEALANT /77X s0.00
1 REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT 441 YD 5000 ¥o
1 REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL M4 3 7 50.00 3o
1 REAR WINDSCREEN PRIMER & CLEANER V11 X, _ 50,00 ¥



ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

17 HAKI BUKIT RDAD 4

#01-80 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE SINGAPORE 417809
Tel 67130400 Fax 67130415

ABWINZ )

Emall: servicacentraffabwinmB.com Wabsite: www.abwinm8.com Service Ceatre
Company Reg. No: 201318685G G5T Rag. No: 2013186856
ESTIMATED COST: HQQO00268
TO  :SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD DATE 07-FEB-2020
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT MAKE HONDA
MODEL VEZEL 1.5% CVT
SLD50368 CHASSIS NO RU11112152
MR YANG WEIHAI ENGINE NO L1584032157
BLK 4948 TAMPINES SERVICE ADVISOR SHARIFAH
AVENUE 9 PAGE 20F2
#07-460
SINGAPORE 520494
CONTACT NO : 82980964
QTY  DESCRIPTION REPAIR AMOUNT (SGD)  SURVEYOR APP (SGD)
Sub Total 1,110.00 0.00
LABOUR
I TOCONDUCT PANEL BEATING AND STRAIGHTEN PARTS 120000 4 Do
ON DAMAGED AREAS
1 TOSPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS 120000 L0
1 TO APPLY UNDERCOATING FOR RUST PROOFING 15000 (D
I TODISMANTLE AND REPLACE REAR WINDSCREEN 15000 7 )0
COMPONENTS
I TO DISMANTLE, REPLACE AND/OR REPAIR REVERSE 12000
SENSOR & TESTING >
i TO DISMANTLE, REPLACE AND/OR REPAIR REVERSE 120.00
CAMERA & TESTING
I TO DISMANTLE, REPLACE AND/OR REPAIR TAILGATE 250.00 62
COMPONENTS
1 TO DISMANTLE & REFIX INTERIOR UPHOLSTERY 150.00 cf-‘\)
I TO CHECK WIRING 15000 2o’
Sub Total 3,490.00 0.00
p- 17 3037
r
7
p- 135421
S 300-00
= (572.2
3224
SUB-TOTAL 8,833.87 24/¢ 0.00
GST - 7 % 618.37 0.00
TOTAL 9,452.24 0.00

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD

Prepared By
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 189607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

 Affiliated to Federation Intemnationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

50 RAFFLES PLACE

Rel CS/SMOZ0002064/Ugf3n2

#05-01/08 Date: 21-02-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. ~ Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FS 584TP Veh. Inspected SLD 50368
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD200057T/GPL Excess () 0.00
Assign From  GRACETEO Assign Date 080272020
Make & Model "HONDA ‘JEzEI:{A_i N c.c 1486
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RUTITI2IE2 Colour WHITE
Odometer 87120 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
Ganaral GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Fromt Tyre |215/60 R16 FALKEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/60 R16 FALKEMN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215/B0R16 FALKEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/80 R16 FALKEN & mm
% Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/02/2020 |inspection Date 071022020
Survey held at ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
17 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#01-60 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE
SINGAPORE 417809
Sa. i i Remarks
AJTHE INS-P_ECT]GH WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WATHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS,
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

|E5TIHMTED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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TAIL GATE

TAIL GATE LOCK

REAR BUMPER

REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH
REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH
TAIL GATE EMBLEM

TAIL GATE EMBLEM *VEZEL"
REAR END PANEL

REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH
TAIL GATE LAMP LH

TAIL LAMP LH

REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING
TAIL GATE LOCK SENSOR

TAIL GATE INNER HANDLE

TAIL GATE WEATHERSTRIP
REAR SMART BUZZER

REAR EXTENSION PANEL LH

REAR CHASSIS BEAM LH
LESS 20% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN)

REVERSE CAMERA, (SN}

REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN)

REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN)

REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN}

REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (SN)

REAR WINDSCREEN PRIMER & CLEANER (SN)

BADLY DENTED
NOT NECESSARY
DENTED

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

NOT NECESSARY

SHORTED

NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20002064/Uqf3n2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ul Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: B258 3561 FAX: B258 4315
Reg Mo 189507198R GST Reg No. 18-9607168-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLD 50368

1,155,00
17270
§10.07

18.25
155,10
20,70
4730
453.00

101.50
291.05
485.65

163.05
2750
101.50
88.00
176.00

104,50

Page Mo 1ol 2

423387

380.00
480,00
50.00
50.00
50.00
50.00
50.00

1,110.00




’ ” ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

ad 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01:25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL! 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg No: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607168-R

TO CONDUCT PANEL BEATING AND STRAIGHTEN 1,200.00 600.00
PARTS ON DAMAGED AREAS. INCLUSIVE OF THE

REPAIR OF REAR END PAMEL AND REAR EXTENSION

PANEL LH.

TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS. 1.200.00 600,00
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING FOR RUST PROOFING. 150.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE AND REPLACE REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120,00
COMPONENTS.

TO DISMANTLE, REPLACE ANDIOR REPAIR REVERSE 120.00 40,00
SENSOR & TESTING. }

TO DISMANTLE REPLACE AND/OR REPAIR REVERSE 120.00

CAMERA & TESTING. }

TO DISMANTLE REFLACE ANDI/OR REPAIR TAILGATE 250,00 60.00
COMPONENTS,

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX INTERIOR UPHOLSTERY. 150,00 80,00
TO CHECK WIRING. 150.00 20.00

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

ISCLAIMER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD FARTIES - This Aepart s made solsly lor e ses snd benslil of the Clisnt named oo the o pags of this Raport.

Raper o whele oo i part does S0 88 bis ar het geen sk,



