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£1 UDTAVE 1, #01-15 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408913 TEL : (065] 615610561 FAX ! (062) 63544315

Your Ref: CMTD2000535/THE Date: 07 Feb 2020
Our Ref: CS/SM0O20002061/Hy{3
The Motor Claims Department
INSU ORE PL
Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SKNS767J .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 06/02/2020 at the premises of M/s CYCLE & CARRIAGE FULCO MOTOR
DEALER PTE LTD and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 9.235.0 4

Revised Estimate Amount 18§ 703100 .

“Check” Items Amount :SS 1.750L.00

Market Value (58 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -

Nett Value : S8 -

Description of Damage: ——

The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion. il W I‘ ] | -
e

Yours faithfully

LEE HOCK ANN

Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 5:32 PM

To: Mars Ler; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@|kkauto.com’; sur@lkkauto.com;
Choo, Thelma

Cc: Chris Bulaclac; Renemer Bagang; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD2000535/THE - LKK/ FBE2883E SKN5767) ACC ON 31.01.20 - PLS ASSIST TO
ARR SUV TMR B/2 {9.30-12N)

Attachments: SKNST67) pdf

Without Prejudice

Our Reference: CMTD2000535,/THE
Your Reference: SKNS767)

Hi Mars,

We refer to your email of today.

Please be informed, we have appointed LKK AUTO to survey the above vehicle.

Aside to LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SKN5767) on a without Prejudice and any admission of liability
basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63224 681/
thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg .

Please submit with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Thelma.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division
D 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurveyv@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

IH';UF\‘I'hhﬂE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffies Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Eusy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG
1




Download now (a

For 1Tmvel. Personal Accldent & Huoine Insairmree For Travel, Persisud Aceidemt. Hoerme & Privaie Motor Insuranee

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, Is intended far the person(s) or campany named and may cantain confidential
andfor legally pnvileged information. Unautharised disclosure copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended racipien! please delele this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompa Insurance Singapore Pte Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure to halding and associated companies. credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is parmitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf) Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Mars Ler <mars ler@ccfulco.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2020 2:49 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>; Renemer Bagang
<renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene
James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000535/THE - LIS(SUV)/ FBE2883E SKN5767] ACC ON 31.01.20

Dear Grace ,

Please kindly arrange survey on tomorrow 06/02/2020 Thu rsday 09.30am to 12.00 pm .

Wishing You A Prosperous
Lunar New Ye:

( , CFTAF & CASTLALY « TULCD

Thank vou,
Best regards

Muars Ler
Senior Advisor - Motor Claims
Cyele & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd

Bad



330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650
VD 65949163 H/P 21792566

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 2:11 PM

To: Mars Ler; Choo, Thelma

Cc: Chris Bulaclac; Renemer Bagang; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James
Subject: CMTD2000535/THE - LIS{SUV)/ FBE2BB3E SKN5767) ACC ON 31.01.20

Without Prejudice

Our Reference: CMTD2000535/THE

Your Reference: SKN5767)

Hi Mars,

We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo Is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63224 681/
thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg .

Kindly advise us when your client will be leaving the vehicle at your premises for survey.

Aside to Thelma,

Please assist on the liability from Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Litd.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO Century of Trust

IN SURAHCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place. #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower. Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo com sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

* Google Play

& iy Sioe
Downlond now (a pp Store ur

For Travel, Personn] Acdident & Home Inswance For Travel Porsoidl Accldeot. Home & Private Mitor Insumnce

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments. is intended for the person(s) or campany named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged information. Unautharised disclosure. copying or use of this information may be untawful and 1s prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete lhis message



Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
staled in our Privacy Paolicy. This may include disclosure 1o halding and associated companies, credil bureau, parties to whom
disclosure s parmittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acling on our behall). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Mars Ler <mars.ler(@cclulco.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 7:32 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurveyi@sompo.com.sg=>

Ce: Chris Bulaclac <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>; Renemer Bagang
<renemer.bagangiaiccfulco.com.sg>

Subject: Re:Accident On 31/01/2020 Involving Our Insured SKN5767) And Your Insured FBE2883E

Dear Motor Claims ,
Our client is looking to make a claim against your insurer for property damage caused to her vehicle.

Please confirm if your insurance company is prepared to engage in a direct settlement for property damage
only.

This settlement excludes out client’s right to recover further loss arising from rental of alternative /
replacement vehicle.

As our client requires the use of a vehicle during this period that her vehicle 1s in our workshop, our client
has will rented a vehicle and will be looking towards your company to make good her loss/rental cost.

Please confirm that you understand that any direct settlement reached for the cost of repairs to our client's

vehicle does not prejudice her rights to recover any other damages he has suffered.

Please arrange for Pre-survey (Advance notice required 1
day ,vehicle with customer)

.IHI|? _.:‘-'r‘: )
i #T A8

1".1;.113“_”5__: You l"[...-."u'lhll.\
Limar New Yeu

( , CTTLE & CABFLLES « FULED




Thank you,
Best regards

Mars Ler

Senior Advisor - Motor Claims

Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650

D/D 65949163 H/P 91792566



Yvonne Wung (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, February 07, 2020 3:29 PM

To: Teo, Grace’; SUR; ‘Choo, Thelma'

Cc: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; ‘Henry, Irene James’

Subject: RE: CMTD2000535/THE - LKK/ FBE2BB3E SKN5767) ACC ON 31.01.20 - PLS ASSIST TO
ARR SUV TMR 6/2 (9.30-12N)

Attachments: SKN5767) PRELI ADVISE pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKN5767)
Date of survey : 06/02/2020
Number of days : 7 days

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultnnts Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408a933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, February 06, 2020 10:02 AM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg>; ‘Mars Ler' <mars. ler@ccfulco.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; ‘Choo, Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: 'Chris Bulaclac' <chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg>; Renemer Bagang' <renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg>;
"Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: CMTD2000535/THE - LKK/ FBE2883E SKN5767) ACC ON 31.01.20 - PLS ASSIST TO ARR
SUV TMR 6/2 (9.30-12N)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.

» Wishing you @ Happy ana ¥Frosperous Lunar New Yeg, -

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Yvonne Wnna (LKK Auto)

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 618 PM

To: Mars Ler

Ce Yvonne Wong {LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: CMTD2000535/1/H- LKK/ FBEZBB3IE SKNST767) ACC ON 31.01.20 - PLS ASSIST TQ

ARR SUV TMR &/2 (9.30-12N)  Finalization

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear ler,

Good day, comfirm amount part/part COR $ 3671 before GST .DOR 5 DAY close,

Thks.

Best Regards,

Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mars Ler [mailto:mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg|

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March, 2020 3:54 PM

To: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Ce: Chris Bulaclac; Renemer Bagang

Subject: RE: CMTD2000535/1JH- LKK/ FBE2883E SKN5767) ACC ON 31.01.20 - PLS ASSIST TO ARR
SUV TMR 6/2 (9.30-12N) Finalization

Dear Hock Ann ,

As per attach for your reference , please help to finalize . (5 working days)
Thank you,

Best regards

Mars Ler

Senior Advisor - Motor Claims
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Lid



Hock Ann !LI{K Autu!

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 5 March, 2020 937 AM
To: Mars Ler
Cc: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SKM 5767) LIMIT REPAIR COST.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear ler.

Good day, regarding vehicle SKN 5767) KIA FORTE K3..

Have repair limit cost repair , limit § 7 k to do it

Kindly refer back with thanks.

Best Regards,
Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn/@ kkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, UTbi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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Usad Kia Caralo Car for Sale in Singapore, Apex Automaotive - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up
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Kia Cerato K3 1.6A
Dmrview Financial Insurance Acressories Similar Ressmrch Photod
Price $41,238
Deprediation $7,850 fyr Reg Date 09-0ct-2014
View modeis with similar depre {%yrs Brmtna Pdeys COE left)
Mileage 103,000 kem (19.4k fyr) Manufactured 014
Aoad Tax $738 jyr Transmission Auto
Dereg Value $35,286 as of today (change)  OMV $13.8589
- . - N i i
Engina Cap 159 e Power §5.3 kW (127 bhp)
o e -_
Type of Vehice Mud-Szed Seaan
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Fuel EfMoent And Responsive 1.5 DOKC Dual CVVT Engine Coupled With Smooth 6 Speed Gearbon Froducing —_————
127ohp, Torque L57HmM. View specs of the Kia Carato K3 (2013-2018)
Shortliet Coumpsars Add note
Accessories Rpsart Errer Miare Actions

Factory Fitted Audio System With Bluetooth, AUX, USH, Reverse Sensor And Camera, Front And Rear Recoroer,
Leather Sests, Solar Film, Sports Rime.

Description
Pristing Condition! Mo Repairs Needed, Guaranteed Accident-Free. Low Milesge, 100% Loan And Low-Interest
fate Az Juss 1.88%! All Trade 1 To 1 Exchange With No Cash Top Up Is Available! Call Us Now For An Viewing
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ArarLULU Used Kia Forte Car for Sale in Singapore, Ka-Hup Vehiclas Trading - sgCarMari
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owiner ID Type:

Owiner Dy

Vehicle Detalls

Viehicle Na.;:

Viehicie to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Data:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Pald;

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibllity:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
FARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herain is correct as at 01 Feb 2020

Singapare NRIC
0352

SKN5767)

o

27 Feb 2020

KlA

FORTE K3 1.6A
Red

2014
G4FGEHT17688
KNAFX411MF5267015
95.3 kW (127 bhp|
$13,713.00

26 Jun 2014

24 Jun 2014

OK

$8,713.00 11 (s

Yes
25Jun 2024
$6,099.00

25 Jun 2024

A-Car up to 1400cc & 97kW (130bhg)
10

$40,002.00

$25.917.00

$32,016.00
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<t #09-07 Tokdo Marine Centra Singapore 069046 \

o111 i (B5) 8221 4355 / (65) 6224 0BES - tmisPkiomarmacomsg | www.toklomerine.com

_ TOKIO MARINE
» INSURANCE GROUP

Certificate of Insurance FORM MX|

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960
ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (MALAYSIA)
Policy No.:  |B-MV004939-R02 (Private Motor Car)

I. Index Mark and Registration Number SKN5767) Chassis No.: KNAFX411MFS267015
of Vehicle
1. Name of Policyholder MR LEE SIAK QUEE (LI XIQUI)

3. Effective date of the Commencemen: of
Insurance for the purposes of the Act 26/06/2018

4. Date of Expiry of Insurance 25/06/2019
5. Persons or Class of Persons entitled o drive®
(n) The Policyholder,

{b) Any other person who is driving on the Policyholder's order or with his permission,

‘ﬁmﬂhmrmﬁhqumhminu%ih%udwhnwmhhumﬁw&ﬂm%:hm
npcmhnd-ﬂ:ludhqﬂﬂhdhyardwuhﬂnmnrmuhmormmmumhﬁmhhmrﬂmthuhm
Vehicle. And providod flrther that the Motor Vehicle is registered under the Road Traflic Act und its registrution under the Road TrafMic Act has
mmm:hmdmwhuum‘.

6. Limitations s to use®

Use only for social domestic and pleasure purposes and for the Palicyholder's business.,
Thnpnlicydnunﬂmmmﬂ:nrhhtwmimm;mmﬁingrdhhuhym.m-mﬂuwﬂuwﬂr
lmdi[mhrlhlnmphjhmmbnuﬂhmyuﬁwhdmwmhmypmmmmhwimmum
Trode.

-mmwtkﬂmﬂfﬁMIMMmewCWMMiﬂhmb 189)

anid Section 95 of the Roed Trensport Act, 1987 [Malaysia), are mot 1o be irctunded wrvler fvese heauiings,
thmbym-ﬂlsrlhumFu!i:yluwhh:hilCmiﬁmwuswhmﬂmummummwﬁch
{ Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act. 1987 {Malavsind.

Please refer o the Palicy Schedile fior Ml detsils, terms and conditions of the inseramee.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

This Cenificaie is not transfernble. During its currency, IF the insurmce is cancelled for whatsoever remson, you must retumn the Certificate i Tokio
hﬁnlnumﬁhumeth?mmrmirnmm-hhmwmmmm-mmuﬁum
effeer. Fﬂnmmmmmhmmmmvm:mmnmm&wnymmwlm

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION Account: 1460DDA
Insurance Plan: Comprehensive Approved Workshop Plan
Limit for total loss or thefi: mmun&vum S0 600

Windscreen F.m:um. SGD 100

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Lad,

&

Tl | ' Authorised Signature

User Name:  Inermediaries from T™M O Printed 20062018



Invalce

21372020
. ' GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
mSMNCE Phone: +65 8224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION

Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday 8am lo Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No GR-20-019281

Date of Reguest: 03/02/2020 Your Ref No; Online Purchase

Cycle & Camage Fulco Motor Dealer Pta Ltd

330 Ubl Road 3

Singapore 408650

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 03/02/2020

Enquiry By Mars Ler Yeong Cherng

TP Vehicle No. FBE2BB3E

Accident Date 31/01/2020

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance insurer Tel. No.
FBE2BB3E AXA Insurance Pte Lid 09/02/2018-08/02/2020 BBB0 4888
FBEZBB3E Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. 08/11/2018-07/11/2020 6461 6555
Thank You.

Tha ed lo you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
smwm take r,:u responalbliity for their sccuracy or contents and shall be under no Habliity whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of
ar in cannaction with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

nllpuzlm.M-WMHMMTM#MMHWNIHWQH1ZD&CFID-H4?BT13&EFTOKENHHHBG--- 2



32020 . Inveica

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00. Singapare 048580
INSUMNCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSODCIATION Opnftl:lng_ Hours: Monday to Friday Bam lo 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE OST Registration No: Ma00017735

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref No GR-20-019281
Date of Request: 03/02/2020 Yaur Ref No: Online Purchase
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pta Ltd
330 Ubi Road 3
Singapaore 408650
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 03/02/2020
Enquiry By Mars Ler Yeong Charng
TP Vahicla No. FBE2883E
Accident Date 31/01/2020
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S3)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amaunt Dua (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ | Cash [ ] Cheque

hitps.'www. glarme.ong.sg/claims/index. ofm Plusebox=MTRsasslussaction=dsp_geninvipirefid=24281204CFID=6847671J4CFTOKEN=TBa3dBe. . e
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

-
L]

CYCLE & CARRIAGE-FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD
EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE
330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650 Tel 67461000 Fax: 64875857

5 MIPNTBEOBE
T0 REPLACE REAR
-CUT & RE-WELD REAR END PANEL

ESTIMATE
Invoice Name & Address (- 0 mmm
SOMPO Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd Cust No/Nase [Mr_Lee Siak Quee (11 Xiqui)
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06 Reg No/Reg Date SKN5767J / 26/06/2014
Singapore Land Tower Date In/Mileage 03/02/2020/ 0
;1:9“2?1““5&3 Chassis No KNAFX411MF5267015
RN, B %S Tt Engine No G4FGEH717688
Contact No Make/Model KIA/1SMY F K3 1.6 A EX
Colour/Trim K3R J WK
AccountNo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIPNo w
FODODOGE Credit 03/02/2020/ 19:20 DS 218 / MarsLer 41144
Description of Goods / Services _ ~—___Qty _ UnitPrice Disc’ __ Amount
M SUNDRY i~ 50.00
C & C LOGO =
S MIPNTBBOBS P ) )\ 280.00
REVERSE SENSOR SET -
§ MIPNTBBDEB ) L 250.00
DIAGNOSTIC / SCANNING v
S MIPNTBBOBS /100,00
TO CHECK LIGHTING AND WIRING SYSTEM ON REAR ACCIDENT W~ . P
AFFECTED AREAS
5 MIPNTBBO8B

TO REMOVE AND RE-INSTALL TR
WAY ACCESS REPAIR ON REAR A

i LU d |
BUMPER, REIN ﬁg@ﬁ%ﬂ:ﬂ M:H;D @/E o g7

-TO REPAIR TRUNX LID #_.
STRAIGHTEN,REFORM,ALIGN ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
S MIPNTB8088 XZ00.00
TO APPLY SEALANT KIT ON NEW PANEL & >0 % =
S MIPNT980BS 213 < /ﬁuﬂ.uq_‘_' i
SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS [
LM ks 86611 A7 000 COVER - REAR BUMPER .~ /7~ 1.00 768.00 0.00 768.00
M ks B669S A7 000 LWR COVER - REAR BUM " r« 1.00 234.00 0.00 234.00
L n ks 92405 A7 000 LH REAR REFLECTOR RE 5«7t 1.00 112.00 0.00 112.00
4 M ks 86613 A7 00O LH SIDE BRACKET ASSY " == 1.00 33.00 0.00 33.00
M KS 86614 A7 000 RH SIDE BRACKET ASSY i 7uv ) 1.00 33.00 0.00 33.00
M KS 86631 A7 000 BEAM-RR BUMPER 7 x (rve) 1,00 365.00 0.00 365,00
M KS 86641 A7 000 LH STAY - REAR BUMPE 1.00 75.00 0.00 75.00
M KS 86636 A7 000 BRACKET - REAR BEAM 7 ¥ (1 2.00 5.00 0.00 10.00
M KS 86635 A7 000 BRACKET - REAR BEAM 7 1,00 5.00 0.00 5,00
P KS 0G032 50 037A CLIP - BUMPER |~ 10.00 2.00 0.00 20.00
LM ks 86310 A7 050 LOGO ASSY - KIA SUB ~ #= 1,00 37.00 0.00 37.00
1P Ks 86310 1M 000 EMBLEM-FORTE- ( 4 DR ~ 1.00 32.00 0.00 32.00

’ r E‘Uﬂ-uu

AND CAPERTINGITO GIVE

o i

Confirm & accepted by

Authorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of guote. This i3 a computer generated document, ne signature i3 required.

Estimated costs gquoted are excluding 65T, We would mention that the above estimate |3 based on our initial inspection and doms not include
any additiona) parts or labour which may be required after repair work has commenced. Dccasicmally wern or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replocesent. However, should this occur, we would advise you, Please be informed that a
af 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, eredit card or
cheque. You must also agree to pay full smount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of insdvertent breaksge in the course of renewing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

deposit

Page 1 of 2



% @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE'FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD
EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650 Tel: 67461000 Fax: 64875857
ESTIMATE
i " Invoice Name & Address ' I ~_ OwnerName & Vehiclelnfo
SOMPO Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd Cust No/Name /Mr Lee Siak Quee (11 Xigui)
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06 Reg No/Reg Date SKNS767J  / 26/06/2014
Singapore Land Tower Date In/Mileage 03/02/2020/ i}
Singapore 048623 Chassis No KNAFX411MF5267015
Notee G Dept Engine No G4FGEH?717688
Contact No Make/Mode] KIA/1SMY F K3 1.6 A EX
Colour/Trim K3R / WK
AccountNo  Terms Datei/Time Printed  CSE_ Operatar fis: i s WIENC -
FOODDOGB  Credit 03/02/2020/ 19:20 DS 218 / MarsLer 41144
" Description of Goods / Services ________Qty _ UnitPrice Disc%»  Amount |
P WFEMBLEMK3 EMBLEM K3 o ~— 1.00 15.00 0.00 15.00
M KS 92403 A7 020 LH LAMP ASSY-REAR r:u: iy '. 1.00 242.00 0.00 242.00
P KS 92401 A7 010 LH LAMP ASSY-REAR CO. * “-/ 1.00 302.00 0.00 302.00
M KS 69100 A7 000 PANEL ASSY - BACK = = (7 1.00 372.00 0.00 372.00
Z NOTES

ACCIDENT ON 31/01/2020 ALONG SLIP ROAD FROM TOM TUCK AVENUE
OWNER CLAIMING THIRD PARTY

REQUIRED REPLACEMENT CAR

# FBEZ2BB3E TP INS : SOMPO

gl . LIK Auto Consultants hence notify
FI ihe Repairer of the following
] - L! |l + To remurvey before'afer vpray (aining
| YV & ! : + To deoley darmaged Bars| Jurog Feanwy
] T i » Parts prces arw sabyect b confirmalion
! ﬁ?." » Thard party Survey & on 8 “Wolhoy! Preudds” bean
ST = (\! * Mo lingal modificstion]a | m siiowsd
| ! %l » Suppiemantary Bermis] most bo resureeyed ang
Ll" E':J o s n pubsect 10 finad approwed from breunence Carmpay
1|_".-;' Aranomeesige! by Racaes:
Ditac
Confirm & accepted by Parts 2,655.00
Labour 0.00
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 6,530.00
Others(Lub,etc) 0.00
Sundry 50.00
Total(w/o GST) 9,235.00

Kuthorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate 15 14 days from date of quote. This |5 a computer generated document, no signature Is required.

Estimated costs quoted are excluding GST. We would mestion that the above sstimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include
any sdditional parts or labour which may be required after repair wark has commenced, Occationally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replecement. However, should this oceur, we would advise you. Fleass be informed that a
depesit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
chegue. You must alse agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertant breakage in the course of renewing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring the resmoval of the windscreen.

Page 2 of 2



@@ CYCLE & CARRIAGE-FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTELTD
EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE @

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 4086850 Tel: 67461000 Fax: 84875857

ESTIMATE
= [F T Ownor Name & Vahicla Infos
SOMPO Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd Cust No/Mame |  /Mr Lee Siak Quee (11 Xiqui)
50 Raffles Place #05-01/06 Reg No/Reg Date SKN5767J / 26/06/2014
:::::g:: lu-:;:z;mr , Date In/Mileage 09/03/2020/ 121596 -
Moter Clafms Dept. Chassis No KNAFX411MF5267015 s
Engine No GAFGEH7 17688
Contact No Make/Model  |KIA/ISMY F K3 1.6 A EX n
Colour/Trim K3R J WK
Account No " Data/Tima Printe S CEER O oorator
FOOO 218 / MarslLer
- wio S Gty Unit Price Disctms
C & CLOGO
5 MIPNTBB0EB /g;g_gg
DIAGNOSTIC / SCANNING .
S MIPNTES088 " 80.00
TO CHECK LIGHTING AND WIRING SYSTEM ON REAR ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS
S MIPNTEB0BB _f,f"'iuo,m
TO REMOVE AND RE-INSTALL TRIMMING AND CAPERTING TO GIVE
WAY ACCESS REPAIR ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
S MIPNTBBOES ] /qﬁu,uu
TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,ETC '
-TO REPAIR TRUNK LID S D @
STRAIGHTEN, REFORM,ALIGN ON § AKFGCTED
S MIPNT38088 /840.00
SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
X KS 86611 A7 000 COVER - REAR BUMPER 1.00 768.00 0.00| .7 768.00
X KS 86695 A7 000 LWR COVER - REAR BUM 1.00 234,00 0.00 L 234,00
X KS 92405 A7 000 LH REAR REFLECTOR RE 1.00 112,00 0.00 ~112,00
A KS 86613 A7 000 LH SIDE BRACKET ASSY 1.00 33.00 0.00 33,00
X KS 06032 50 037A CLIP - BUMPER 10.00 2.00 0.00 L~20.00
X K5 B6310 A7 050 LOGO ASSY - KIA SUB 1.00 37.00 0.00 v i
X K5 86310 1M 000 EMALEM-FORTE- ( 4 DR 1.00 32.00 0.00 32,00
X WFEMBLEMK3 EMBLEM K3 1.00 15.00 0.00 _~15.00
Z NOTES
ACCIDENT ON 31/01/2020 ALONG SLIP ROAD FROM TOH TUCK AVENUE
OWNER CLAIMING THIRD PARTY
LOSS OF USE 05 DAYS
TP # FBE2BB3E TP INS : SOMPO
Parts 1,251.00
Confirm & accepted by o 0.00
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 2.370.00
Others(Lub,etc) 0.00
hmﬁiu’lf (o Sundry 50.00
Total (w/e GST) 3,671.00

Ruthorized signatory and company stamp

Validity af this estimate i3 14 days from date of gquote, This s a compuier genaratad document, no signature 1§ required.
[uiut{l coits quoted are u:hi’.:p GST. Wa would mantion that the above estimatc |3 based en cur initial inspection and does not Include
any additional parts or labour which may be required after repair work has comsenced. Occasfonally worn or damaged parts ars discoversd
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. Howsver, should this occur, we would advise you, Please ba Informed that a
depesit of 50k of the above estimate \s payable before commancement of the work, Payment for this may be wade in cash, credit card or
chegue. You must also agres to pay full amount for renewal of the windscrean in the svent ef Insdvertent breakage in the course of renewing
the rubber seal or sther repair requiriog the removal of the windicresn. bace 1 of 1

g 0



y 7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

T —{— 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

-
- TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6258 4215

Reg. No: 188607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9807188-R

[SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL CS/SMO2000206 1/Hyf3n2

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Date: 23-03-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Insured Veh. SKN 6T6TJ
Policy No. 0.00
Claim No. CMTD2000535/THE 0.00

06/02/2020

Make & Model KIA FORTE K3 c.C 1681

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. KNAFX411MF5287015 Colour RED
Odometer 120467 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |205/55 ZR16 MICHELIN 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 ZR16 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 ZR16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 ZR16 MICHELIN & mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date  31/01/2020
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE FULCO MOTOR DEALER PL

NO.330 UBI ROAD 3
IWFGRE

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




N e S T e Y

3

(=]

B S ™ e e .

COVER-REAR BUMPER (SN)
LWR COVER-REAR BUM (SN)
LH REAR REFLECTOR RE (SN)
LH SIDE BRACKET ASSY (SN)
RH SIDE BRACKET ASSY (SN)
BEAM-RR BUMPER (SN)

LH STAY-REAR BUMPE (SN)
BRACKET-REAR BEAM (SN
BRACKET-REAR BEAM (SN)
CLIP-BUMPER (SN)

LOGO ASSY-KIA SUB (SN)
EMBLEM-FORTE-(4 DR)(SN)
EMBLEM K3 (SN)

LH LAMP ASSY-REAR CO (SN)
LH LAMP ASSY-REAR CO (SN}
PANEL ASSY-BACK (SN)

CA&C LOGO (SN)

SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN)

LABOUR
DIAGNOSTIC/SCANNING.

TO CHECK LIGHTING AND WIRING SYSTEM ON REAR
ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS.

TO REMOVE AND RE-INSTALL TRIMMING AND
CARPETING TO GIVE WAY ACCESS REPAIR ON REAR
ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS.

TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT,ETC -
CUT & RE-WELD REAR END PANEL -TO REPAIR TRUNK
LID.STRAIGHTEN REFORM ALIGN ON REAR ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS.

TO APPLY SEALANT KIT ON NEW PANEL.

SCRATCHED
SCRATCHED
NECESSARY
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
SERVICEABLE
NECESSARY
SERVICEABLE

NOT NECESSARY

Report Rel No. CS/SMO20002061/Hyf3n2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Awe 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408833
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg Mo 190607188R GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKN 5767J

Te8.00 768.00
234.00 234.00
112.00 112.00
33.00 33.00
33.00 -
365.00
75.00 -
10.00
5.00
20.00 20.00
3r.00 37.00
32.00 32.00
15.00 15.00
242.00
302.00 -
3r2.00 -
§0.00 50.00
280.00 -
2,885.00 1.301,00
250.00 250.00
100.00 80.00
600.00 300,00
3,000.00 900,00
200.00




I 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
s ma 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 18-0607198-R Page No.2 of 2

Alna |I'_

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20002061/Hyf3n2

Joer KR

LEE HOCK ANN ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Assl Automolive Assessor B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DECLAMMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Repor m mide solsly for the use and bens® of e Cllart named on ihe from page of Bhis Repert.

At o whols or o part. doss 8o 82 his o et own sk,



