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Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SKJ1561H (1151514308SG)
[SKK4040U]

TP
SCHULZ ACHIM ANDREAS

Jan 8 2020 12:00AM
[SCHULZ ACHIM ANDREAS]

Precise Auto Service

From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 14/04/2020 10:55 AM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2040.00) - SKJ1561H - Claim Handler: MdNoor, Norsiah

Approved:2040.00.
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>
Sent: May 6, 2020 4:47 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Accident Involving Between SKJ 1561H & SKK 4040U on 08-01-2020 Along Keong 

Saik Road *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG20002035/Uhs3

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mr. Jasper 
 
We would like to accept your above offer at global sum $2,000.00 (all in). 
 
Waiting for DV. 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards 
Yan Hong 
 
On Wed, 29 Apr 2020 at 15:53, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $2,000.00all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 3:36 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Su Li (LKK Auto); Admin A 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving Between SKJ 1561H & SKK 4040U on 08-01-2020 Along Keong Saik Road *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIG20002035/Uhs3 

  

Dear Mei Kwan, 

  

Thanks for your provided details, herewith attached our client GIA Report, Police Report & Accident Video 
Footage (Front/Rear) for your attention. 

  

We are looking forward to your reply with the case liability. 
 
Thank You. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
Arine 

  


