Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: April 29, 2020 3:54 PM

To: 'support@preciseauto.sg’

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Between SKJ 1561H & SKK 4040U on 08-01-2020 Along Keong

Saik Road *** LKK REF: CC4/A1G20002035/Uhs3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $2,000.00all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Precise Auto Service [mailto:Support@preciseauto.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 3:36 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Su Li (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident Involving Between SKJ 1561H & SKK 4040U on 08-01-2020 Along Keong Saik Road *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20002035/Uhs3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Thanks for your provided details, herewith attached our client GIA Report, Police Report & Accident Video
Footage (Front/Rear) for your attention.

We are looking forward to your reply with the case liability.

Thank You.



Best Regards
Arine

On Thu, 6 Feb 2020 at 14:30, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement.






Please provide us the following.
o evidence i.e. video and scene photo.
e PIR result (if any)

o Estimated cost of repair
e GIA / police report

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Precise Auto Service <Support(@preciseauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February, 2020 2:27 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@]lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving Between SKJ 1561H & SKK 4040U on 08-01-2020 Along Keong Saik Road

Your Insured Vehicle no : SKK 4040U

Our Ref no : SKJ 1561H/T/20

Dear Mei Kwan,

We refer to the above mentioned road traffic accident, we would like to request a copy of your insured GIA
report for record purposes.

Thank You.



Best Regards
Arine

"Best Wishes for Chinese Lunar New Year 2020,
Gong Xi Fa Cai !!! "

T:67457367 | F:6841 3390

E : support@preciseauto.sg

W: www.preciseauto.sg

A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Follow us on social media:

tps://www.instagram.com/preciseautosvs/

ttps://twitter.com/preciseautosys

ttps://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/
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