Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 May 2020 9:17 AM

To: ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

Cc: Suhaimi

Subject: RE: RE: SGR 8181E / TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Dear Ronnie,
Confirm final figure $3856,3 days.

Please submit your documents to directly to budget insurance

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 11:33 AM

To: ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Suhaimi <suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: SGR 8181E / TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Hi Ronnie,

| gave a chaser to Adrian, | update u shortly

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ronnie Tan <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 11:21 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Suhaimi <suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: fw: RE: SGR 8181E / TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Hi Ms Denise / Adrian

Can we finalize this case



Thank you
Regard

Ronnie

From: "Ronnie Tan" <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 May, 2020 3:20 PM

To: "Denise Tay (LKKAuto)" <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: "Suhaimi" <suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: fw: RE: SGR 8181E / TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Hi Ms Denise Tay
As your Request
Thank you
Regard

Ronnie

From: "Denise Tay (LKKAuto)" <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 21, 2020 10:58 AM

To: "ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg" <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>
Cc: "Suhaimi" <suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SGR 8181E / TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Dear Ronnie,
Can re-forward me the finalize invoice. | think he miss out

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: _sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ronnie Tan <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 10:57 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Suhaimi <suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: re: SGR 8181E/ TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Hi Denise Tay

Iwe have already fix SGR 8181E

| also have send finalize Invoice to Adrain . But | cant confirm Adrain has finalize or not
Thank you

Regard

Ronnie



From: "Denise Tay (LKKAuto)" <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 21, 2020 9:30 AM

To: "Ronnie Tan" <ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Cc: "Suhaimi" <suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg>

Subject: SGR 8181E / TP / BUDGET DIRECT INSURANCE /DOA: 29/01/2020

Dear Ronnie,
Would like to follow up on this case, is the repair done?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: _sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




