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From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Friday, 7 February 2020 9:12 AM

claims@premiu mauto.com.sg; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJJ 3920 D ON 31/1/2020

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle sJJ 392oD (Excess $300/-).

lf there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office's Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434

to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before

com pletion of the rePair.

*Our client reserve their rights not to pav if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best ReBards,

Denise Tay I Case Handler

Ll(( Auto consultants Pte ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetav@lkkauto.com I fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndust.ial Park, UbiAvenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claims@premiuma uto.com.sg <cla ims@premiuma uto com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday,4 February 2020 3:19 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a @lkka uto.com>; Admln-D (LKKAuto) <ad min-d @lkka uto.com>; SUR <sur@ lkka uto'com>

Cc:'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJJ 3920 D ON 31/t/20?0

Dear all,

Survey had been carried out by Adrian earlier just now,

Kindly assist on OD aPProval.

Best Regards,

Kee Siang

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 1999o2271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 987t 9902
e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w, www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p' +65 6836 2223

1



View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

xsJJ392OD (403O17399OSG)
OD

lan 31 2020 6:00PM
IKWOK TIAN CHEE]

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

lulark as Unread Delete

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on OGlO2l2O2O 12t56 Pn.
To LKK_HQ
Subiect Alert - Adj I'landate Approved (S112658.00) - S,J3920D - Claim Handler: ilithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaui

:12658.00:Authorise repair, Kindlyjustify Iabour 2 (2.5 days) with breakdown in accordance to l4anufacture timing, Re-inspection to be
for damage check and sopplementary items / labo!r.

DOCUIiIENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents,



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd rco.*"g.nr.:reesoTie8R)
51 UbiAve 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel: 62563561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte. Ltd.
AIG Building
78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Preliminarv Advice

:SJJ3920D
: AUDI A3
: Osl02l202o

| 0210212020

: PREL4IUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBl)
55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Repaire/s Estimate (Gross)

Revised Amount

Check ltems (Estimated)

Total

Lump Sum Repair

Tolal Losa Consideration

New for Old Value

Pre-Accident Value

COE i PARF Rebate
Salvage Value

Margin for Repair

From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 UbiAve '1 #0'1-25
Paya Ubi lnduskial Park
Singapore 408933

05 Feb 2020

Accident Date

Policy No.

Excess

Est. Duration of Repair

Vehicle No

Make

Assignment Date
Date of lnspection

lnspection At

: 3110112020

: 1800088216

:S$0.00
:5.00

Point of lmpact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle susiained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

:S$

:S$

:S$

:S$

:S$

:nu
:S$

:S$

:!o
:S$

18,413.00

12,658.00

1,609.00

14,267.00

90,000.00
38,385.00

51,615.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us have
your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( ) other comments :

Attn:



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for

Owner lD Type:

Owner lD:

Vehicle

Singapore NRIC

247C

Vehicle to be Exported:

lntended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle lvJake:

Vehicle Modeli

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open MarketValue:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Countl

ActualARF Paid:

,)39200
No

05 Feb 2020

AUDI

43 sEDAN 1.0 TFSI S TRONIC (LED)

Red

2078

cH2466306

WAUZZZSV 7069554

85.0 kW (113 bhp)

$22.104.O0

26 )vl2O!8
26 )ul2078
0

$22,946.00

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eiigjbility Expiry Date:

PARF RebateAmount:

Yes

25 )ul2028

$77,2o9.oo

COE Expiry Datei

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The inform ation co nta ined herein is correct asat05 Feb 2O2O

25 )ul202A

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW(13obhp)

10

$25,000.00

$27,77 6.OO

$38,38s.00

OK
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$58 until it's SOLD!
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1 Greiut Owner. very welt raten Care Oi Atwavs pa
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@

@
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36,000 km
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$9,s)O /yt 08'lLrn-2018 17,339 km
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-1,,r-6S'..ffiil
W":iWffi
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:
AttaGhments:

Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Saturday, 1 February 2020 12:30 PM
'Admin A'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR'

'Claims'

oD cLArM FOR SJJ 3920 D ON 31/1/2020
SJJ 3920 D - 31012020.pdf

Dea r all,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA for your reference.

We willforward you the estimate once it is available.

Kindly arrange survey on 4/2/2020,2.15PM. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,

Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Prerniu:It :\utorrrobiles fte l-td rt.r,:.. q,lo:r.rur

-ii trhi l{,rrrd I Rold Siogapo.c,103(}99
p. 6-s 61rit3 1.123 d. ,65 6763 982U t .6i 6ttll I I8.l
c. qlcjtt!.-o-prqutuqolUllullx *. \\ t\ \\.a ud i.com.stl

Audi Celltre 2lJl ,.\lcrunil|a I{oacl S +65 68-16 l22i

EmailDisclaimer
rlils emai . Inc udlrg any altachment, is .cnfidefiial and m.y also be privrlsSed.

ii vo!r hav€ receivcd it in error, pl€rse norify us lmmediately by roply enrailard then deleie th s ,rr€ssa8c from yo!r system.

ll.irse do nol.opy lt o. us€ lt forany purpose, or disclose its contents or any atrach,ne.t to:nY.ther person. ThsnkYou.

1



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tet:6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 WIp: 29090
Emait: Nora. kha i@ premiu ma uto.com.sg / c[aims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Vehicte NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way
#07- 16 AIG Bu itding
Singapore 0791.20

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Ctaims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Estimate
Workshop
Contact No
Fax No
Reference
Date

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.

Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage
Date In
Estimated By

Accident Date
Place of Accident

Accident Repa irs

Ubi Road 1

6366 2323
6841 1183

PA/OD/OL3L/2020/NS
3-Feb-20

Ms Kwok Tian Chee

Blk 6 Lorong Lew Lian

#03-120
Singa pore 531006
HP +65 98529823
Own Damage C[aims

1800088216

sJl3920 D
Audi 43 Sedan 1.0 TFSI 8V

Jut-18
cHz 466306
w AUZZZ8V9ILO69554

Johnny Boo / A[[an Wu

31-Jan-20

Bishan Flyover Towards BradetI



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tet : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Su rveyor's

Recom mend ation s

To remove and transfer front wire harness for
t headtights, horns, fog Lamps, outside temperature S/N S

sensor and head[ight washer assy.

To dismantle and renew front bumper assy, bonnet

" and ths headLight. Re-organise front crash
' manaqement components. Reinstatt at[ parts

removed.

To respray front bur6per and

To carry out diagnostic check.

SUB TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

2

bonnet. s

S/N S Lg2.OO.."'

s 4,802.00

360.00 r-''//'

z,+sV{ ttS

1to c



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tet : 6366 2323 Fax : 684I 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Reqn No, SII 3920 D

Damage Parts & Prices
S/N Parts Description S/NETT Remarks

//U4'1L

n- - -1 FRONT BUT4PER '1^ ,i2 FRoNT BUMPER GRTLLE - CENTRE zi"- L-"
3 RADIAToR GRILLE 6;*L_zt

5 1,894.00 +

s 1sl .oo r' ,2O.V0

s 1,338 .oo / IUlro q-q---

s 180 .oo .-C,'@ bn

t.oo r 6 3LNEc S

4 RADIATOR CRILLE CLOSINC ELEMENT

s A.rRLoN s rlcKER Z'l-'-
6 CAUTIoN SICN STIcKER I

7 FRoNT BUMPER covER 1

8 FRONT BUI.4PER FOAM FILLER PIECE

9 FRoNT BUMpER stDE REINFoRCEMENT sEav l
10 BoNNET .r1,*<d

1]. BONNET ATTACHMENT PARTS I

12 BONNET SAFETY CATCH H *

13 BONNET STRIKER - 
" ' 

*' ,' ".
I

14 BoNNET EDCE pRoTECTIoN ( -. (-----"-r

15 BoNNET cATCH HooK )-1 .'

16 LED HEADLICHT. LH

17 FRONT NO PLATE

c.*()

18 suNDRrEs l

NEC s t3'oo -"-- to L\j

s 115.00 'h4
s 178.00' h4

s 681.00 l6s
s 2,988 .OO 

/

TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES : S 13,611.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : S 4,802.00
GRANDTOTAL , S re, 13OO
At[ charges are not inctusive of CST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are SpeciaI Nett.

2aQo .qo

)s lss.oo ihn
5 84.OO .v

2 s ZOA.OO L

s 26'oo / 7a *o
s oo.oo J-

s s,1s3 .oo t--'/ 4t5\L{X
s/N s +o.oo/ 4o

s :oo.oo ? !,lh



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Te[ :6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

L{KAqlA Collldtaltls hence notify
the Repalrer of tl.e followtng;
. To resLrrvev be[cre']frer spr6y parnling

. Todisplay damaged part(s)during resurvey

. Parts prices aresubjectto confirmation

. Third party suNey is cn a'I/r'ihout prejudice'basis

. No illegal modificalion(s) is alowed

. Suppjemenlary{em(s) must be resureved and
is subjecl lo f,rlalapprovar from tnsurance Cffiany

Acknowledged by Regairer

Siqnature:

Date:
Name

Surveyed Date

Authorised Date

Excess Cost

Liabitity
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfu[[y,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

41"; i----:

olfo.fro /

M &'-*h'ttz,t, ,t y

This estimate is based on visuaI inspection ofthe affected vehicle.

Should we require further [abour charges and spare parts in the

progress of repair, we sha[[ inform you according[y.

For inspection of vehicte, ptease refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Te[:6768 9828 for a ppointment.

At[an Wu

Claims Consultant


