15/52010

o womm NORSIAH | CCB3/AIG20001959/Gda3 er
ASSIGNMENT
Surveyor: XING GUO QIANG por: 10/02/2020 Date/ Time: 05/02/2020
Registered in Merimen: M
Pre-assign / CCU/FTE
Insured Vehicle No. SLZ 7309K Claim No. 5486452112SG
Name of Insured LAI JUEN BIN Policy No. 1800050623
Insured Tel No. HP: Make/Model : JAGUAR XE-2.0 (A)
Excess Sec I1 :S$ D.OA: 03/02/2020 15:20 place of Accident: KK WOMEN'S AND CHILDREN'S
HOSPITALCARPARK
Is driver the owner? (fEJ/NO)  Nature of Accident :

If NO, Driver Name / Age :

01 GIA REPORT: {EJ/NO ; TP GIA REPORT: {E3 / NO

Driver Tel No. : (V/L: YES/NO) Insured Liability : %o Final ? Yes/No
SME 4182 e — —
INSRS: INSRS: INSRS: INSRS:
WSP: PREM]UM WSP: WSP: WSP:
Tel : Tel : Tel : Tel :
Liability : Liability : Liability : Liability :
RMKS: RMKS: RMKS: RMKS:
Date/ Time
SME 418Z - X SLZ 7309K - X [race DATE/ PIC
|Non-Reporting ltr (1st):
|Non-Reporting Itr (2nd):
lNomReponing Itr (Final):
INotification Itr (if non-pickup):
Call OL
After call Itr to OL:
Documentation Check List: Handler  Typist
INotification Itr (if non-pickup)
After call Itr to OL:
Authorisation To Act: I
|Release Voucher: = [
[Final Repair Bill:
Car Rental Invoice:
[Towing Invoice ]
|LTA/GIA:
[Medical Bin: ]
|Pi&: 1
Mandate/Reject Instruction: :_
LOD (=] =
Payment Breakdown Form:
|[PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Sent By: Post-Repair Photos: | | |
|Others: 1 [ ]
FINALIZATION Date/Time: Confirm with: Confirm by:
Repair Cost: S$ ( days) Reduction: % Email [ Jcan [ |
FINAL SETTLEMENT __ Date/Time: Confirm with Emaill__| Call |
Final Liability: %o (Agreed / Assessed) BOLA S/N No. : If NO or B 28, Ass. Lia:
Repair Cost: S$
Loss of Rental (LOR): S$ ( days)
Loss of Use (LOU): S$ ($ X days)
Loss of Income (LOI): S$ ($ X days)
LORonly ] LOUonly [ | LOR +LOU [ ] Lor+LOI__| [Tickonly one]
GIA/LTA Search S$
Medical: S$ 1) Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Disbursement: Ss (e.g. Tow/ Independent ) 2) Report Format:
Iegal Cost S$ 3) Survey fee:
Total: S$ Global Sum S$:
FINAL PAYMENT Date/Time: Confirm with: Email | | cal___|
Payee 1: S$ Name 1:
[Payee 2: (Strike if N.A) |S$ Name 2:
[Payee 3: (Strike if N.A.) __|SS Name 3:




AES. FEC.BY: M\ l hlq |2 %/ol ‘

ASSIGNMENT

From: 48 Dale: 10-2. 2020 Veh No: i gMé (pz ?Z'”Reg"' (Q %w

Type: @ M.Cycle / Bus / Van I Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover /

OD{/ TP /MVS | TP RES / OD RES [ EVA / INV | MV 1 Truck / Trailer or

To Inspect Vehicle No: Smé I'H % Z M M Aé ce l 7?8
at Workshop m/s Frlmw{\ 3 | colour 61 lnsuredIStdINHNA

5 6 017/ r‘pnd , o | Sp-Reading ‘)9@?777,_ T/Radio: Insured / Std / NI/ NA
Insured: Eng/No: V

Policy No. IQS"‘"\F" W? g('&- “‘ i W&MTZZZ_C[/@CEME{O% '

Claims No. Gen. Cond: §odd / Fair / Poor / Burnt
Sum Insured: T omi. M Eionse 7 : ‘; Steering: Ingider / Jammed / Leaked / Burnt or
(Client's Record) ' == Brake: Ir@erlJammedlLeakedl Burnt or Ny
Make of Veh: q 304-m Oy wail?{ Modi:  Nil /SIRim / STim or -
& Tyre Size: _~17$ Z _g Lz‘ . 15
(Policy Condition) o S kb
Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | O/S | | BS/DUN/EXNOVA/GY/FS/ LIZAI OHTSU / PIR / SUMI /
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO/ YOKO or
Bal. or Market Value: Eront Rear
IDAC Accident Rport: | Consistent? : Yes or No R/Bal. & mm é
GIA / PR Seen: T Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal. ZZ* mm L/Bal. -
Est. Repairs: _ days Res.: Yes or No D.O.A._ D.O.l. 16501—“
Lum Sum: % 3Val.: Yes or No Survey held at WE T')) o
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS /M’ ’ Des. of Damages : Frt /| Rear / OIS | NIS | UIC | Rooftop or
Vehicle: IN/JOUT | N S .
Date: _ Person Contacted: The UIC | Chassis frame / Bod‘ Structure affected due to collsion.

Date / Time Action / Instruction

R P o, ey I

Dale/Time, File Pass 107 D; Preli. Report Days Of Repair:

1) I I: Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: ~ |Survey Fee: o
Date/Time, File Return 10?7 Transporlafion

: Add Fee: : Site Ingp  ($ )-8 +Rs__sI .

snterview (6 ) Fhols

Feport Forme D Tegh v u:-.‘ — oty L

Lutap o/ LET: G .
| ena gl‘ = ___'__F

Desl enc



\
!
Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 3:07 PM

To: ‘Admin A'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)’; 'SUR'

Cc: ‘Claims'

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SME 418 Z AND YOUR INSURED SLZ 7309 K ON 3/2/2020
Attachments: SME 418 Z - 03022020 ADDENDUM.PDF

Dear all,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for above mentioned case. We propose for a 100% direct settlement in our
client’s favour

Please advise who the officer in-charge we shall liaise with is. To avoid dispute during finalisation, we propose for
LOU/R at $100/180 per day.

Attached is the GIA report and estimate for your reference.
Kindly arrange survey on 10/2/2020, 9.30am. Owner waiting.

We are claiming AIG.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd reg vo 199002271w)

55 Ubi Road | Road Singapore 408699

p. +635 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claimsi@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road

I Find out more }

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may alsa be privileged
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attac hment to any other person. Thank you.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 879C
S e e S T ey
Vehicle No.: SME418Z
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A6 1.8 TFSI ULTRA (P1) (NAV)
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: CYG023783
Chassis No.: WAUZZZ4G4IN046604
Maximum Power Output: 140.0 kW (187 bhp)
Open Market Value: $43,964.00
Original Registration Date: 10 Aug 2018
First Registration Date: 10 Aug 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $53.550.00
e ey
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 09 Aug 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: $40,162.00
S S o HOMAI 83 s 5=y St 2 R AR WAL 21 2 e e i e ]
COE Expiry Date: 09 Aug 2028
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $34,381.00
COE Rebate Amount: $29,214.00
Total Rebate Amount: $69,376.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Feb 2020

OK



