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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 6:26 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SMR5016Z @ LOD LETTER

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Jasper, sorry for the late reply. 
 
We would like to accept your total propose settlement @ $7,006.45 for the ACCIDENT INVOLVING (SJV 4033U) AND 
(SMR 5016Z) ON 01/02/2020 . 
 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,099.00 , 2. Loss of Rental  (9 days x 
$100.00) $ 900.00 and 3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $7.45. Total amount 
$7,006.45 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
WINSTON 
DIRECTOR 
98719488 
GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE. LTD. 
48 TOH GUAN ROADS ENTERPRISE HUB, #01-119 SINGAPORE 608586 
(TEL) 62640995    (FAX) 62645948 
(Email) claims@goldautoworks.com.sg     (Website)  
https://goldautoworks.com.sg/ 
 
 
*STRICTLY CONFIDENTIAL* 
 
This message, its contents and any files transmitted with it are intended SOLELY for the addressee(s) and may be 
legally privileged and/or confidential. Access by any other party is unauthorised without the express written 
permission of the sender. If you have received this message in error, you may not copy or use the contents, 
attachments or information in any way. Please destroy it and contact us immediately via e-mail return. This message 
has been prepared using information believed by the author to be reliable and accurate; we make no warranty as to 
its accuracy or completeness. We do not accept responsibility for changes made to this message after it was sent. 
 
***********************************************************************************************
*********************************************************************** 
 
**WARNING: Computer viruses can and/or may be transmitted via email.  
Kindly check and ensure that all emails received from our firm ends with the domain @goldautoworks.com.sg 
before acting on them. When and/or if unsure, please contact us to verify. Please note that the company accepts no 
liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email. 
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On 2020-03-20 15:18, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) wrote: 
> Your Ref: SMR 5016Z 
>  
>  Our Ref: SJV 4033U                          WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
>  
>  Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
>  
>  ACCIDENT INVOLVING (SJV 4033U) AND (SMR 5016Z) ON 01/02/2020 
>  
>  We refer to the above matter. 
>  
>  We propose settlement as follows: - 
>  
> 1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 
>  
> $ 6,099.00 
>  
> 2. Loss of Rental  (9 days x $100.00) 
>  
> $    900.00 
>  
> 3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 
>  
> $        7.45 
>  
>  TOTAL 
>  
> $7,006.45 
>  
>  Please confirm acceptance. 
>  
> Best Regards, 
>  
> Jasper Chua| Case Handler 
>  
> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
>  
> Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
>  
> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
>  
> -----Original Message----- 
>  
> From: GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE LTD <claims@goldautoworks.com.sg> 
>  
> Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 12:37 PM 
>  
> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
>  
> Subject: SMR5016Z @ LOD LETTER 
>  
> Hi Hsiao Tong, without prejudice 
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>  
> ATTACHED is the LOD LETTER for our veh no : SMR5016Z Please kindly  
> assist. 
>  
> -- 
>  
> Best Regards, 
>  
> (NAME) SIMON TAN 
>  
> (Position) 
>  
> (  HP     ) 8199-9149 
>  
> GOLD AUTOWORKS PTE. LTD. 
>  
> 48 TOH GUAN ROADS ENTERPRISE HUB, #01-119 SINGAPORE 608586 
>  
> (TEL) 62640995    (FAX) 62645948 
>  
> (Email) claims@goldautoworks.com.sg     (Website) 
>  
> https://goldautoworks.com.sg/ [1] 
>  
> *STRICTLY CONFIDENTIAL* 
>  
> This message, its contents and any files transmitted with it are  
> intended SOLELY for the addressee(s) and may be legally privileged  
> and/or confidential. Access by any other party is unauthorised without  
> the express written permission of the sender. If you have received  
> this message in error, you may not copy or use the contents,  
> attachments or information in any way. Please destroy it and contact  
> us immediately via e-mail return. This message has been prepared using  
> information believed by the author to be reliable and accurate; we  
> make no warranty as to its accuracy or completeness. We do not accept  
> responsibility for changes made to this message after it was sent. 
>  
> ********************************************************************** 
> ********************************************************************** 
> ************************** 
>  
>  
> **WARNING: Computer viruses can and/or may be transmitted via email. 
>  
> Kindly check and ensure that all emails received from our firm ends  
> with the domain @goldautoworks.com.sg before acting on them. When  
> and/or if unsure, please contact us to verify. Please note that the  
> company accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus  
> transmitted by this email. 
>  
> Links: 
> ------ 
> [1] https://goldautoworks.com.sg/ 
 


