Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 April 2020 9:53 AM

To: 'Wally Tan PTCBC'; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Dion Wang

Subject: RE: B4 painting and replace rear w/screen for SIM2919A
Dear Wally,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed amount $12,859.70 before GST @ 9 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to ERGO INSURANCE

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wally Tan PTCBC [mailto:wally.tan@borneomotors.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 April 2020 3:32 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh @lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Dion Wang <Dion.Wang@inchcape.com.sg>

Subject: RE: B4 painting and replace rear w/screen for SIM2919A

Hi Taufikh and Veron,
Please find attached final bill of SIM2919A for your kind perusal.

Regards
Wally

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 11:05 AM

To: Wally Tan PTCBC; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Dion Wang

Subject: RE: B4 painting and replace rear w/screen for SIM2919A




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Wally,
Vehicle can finalise?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wally Tan PTCBC [mailto:wally.tan @borneomotors.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 4 April 2020 9:03 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh @lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Dion Wang <Dion.Wang @inchcape.com.sg>

Subject: RE: B4 painting and replace rear w/screen for SIM2919A

Hi Taufikh,

For your reference.

Thank you

Wally Tan TCBC
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Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of
file attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.

2



