Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 12:10 PM
To: Siak Tong Sim; Tristan Farhan; Tan, Mary; Yvonne Ng; Sandy Ho
Subject: [REPUDIATE CLAIMS] RE: LOD/Invoice for SLM7344B
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: SLM 7344B
Our Ref: CC4/A1G20001914/Qea3

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 7344B AND SJP 6277B ON 30/01/2020

Please be informed that our Principal had repudiated the claim due to our insured breach of policy terms and
conditions due to non reporting.

Therefore, we will close the matter at our end.
Kindly redirect your client’s claim to the owner of SIP 6277B.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 April 2021 4:55 PM

To: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Tristan Farhan <tristanfarhan@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Tan,
Mary <Mary.Tan@aig.com>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Sandy Ho
<sandyho@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LOD/Invoice for SLM7344B

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Sim,
We refer to the email below.

Our insured have yet to report till date, we are currently pending instruction from our principal.



Will revert the matter to you in due course.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 April 2021 4:51 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Tristan Farhan <tristanfarhan@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Tan,
Mary <Mary.Tan@aig.com>; Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Sandy Ho
<sandyho@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: LOD/Invoice for SLM7344B

Dear Sir/Madam

Final Reminder

Please let us have your offer to settle for this case within the next 3 days

We shall escalate this case to GIA DRM to handle if we do not hear for your end

Thanks & Best Regards
S.T.Sim

Manager

Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-35/36 Carros Centre
Singapore 737869

H/P: 65- 69559351

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Date: Tue, Feb 2, 2021 at 1:24 PM

Subject: Fwd: LOD/Invoice for SLM7344B

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <ashersng@lkkauto.com>, Tristan Farhan <tristanfarhan@Ilioncityrentals.com.sg>, Yvonne
Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>, Sandy Ho <sandyho®@Ilioncityrentals.com.sg>

Dear Sir/Madam

Please refer attached 10D which has been outstanding for nearly 6 months
Please let us have your offer to settle within the next 7 days

Thanks & Best Regards

S.T.Sim

Manager



Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-35/36 Carros Centre
Singapore 737869

H/P: 65- 69559351

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Date: Mon, Jul 6, 2020 at 3:58 PM

Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLM7344B

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <ashersng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Yvonne Ng <yvonne.ng@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Dear sir
Attached LOD/Invoice for SLM7344B for your approval and early settlement

Thanks & Best Regards
S.T.Sim

Manager

Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-35/36 Carros Centre
Singapore 737869

H/P: 65-97422188




