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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 3 April 2020 1:30 PM
To: Janet Tan
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto); dannysk yeo
Subject: RE: Accident involving SFE7987J and SML8250A on 16.01.2020 along Dunearn Road
Attachments: statement.pdf

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 8250A & SFE 7987J ON 16/01/2020 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Based on our insured’s report, your client’s vehicle is coming out from sub road and our insured is on main 
road. From the point of impact, it shows your client did not give way to our insured, thus causing the 
accident. 
                                                                                                                                            
In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client’s 
claim. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 8:56 AM 
To: Janet Tan 
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto); dannysk yeo; Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SFE7987J and SML8250A on 16.01.2020 along Dunearn Road 
Importance: High 
 
Dear Janet, 
 
Kindly note the respective handle, Jia Le will look into this matter.  
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
FYNA. 
 
Thanks  
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
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Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Janet Tan [mailto:sltanjanettan@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 April 2020 11:56 AM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SFE7987J and SML8250A on 16.01.2020 along Dunearn Road 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please send DV to proceed payment ASAP! 
 
Thanks 
 
Regards  
Janet Tan  
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 

On 18 Mar 2020, at 13:44, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Janet, 
  
Content noted with thanks 
  
  
“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be 
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The 
terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this 
accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.” 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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From: Janet Tan [mailto:sltanjanettan@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 March 2020 1:32 PM 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SFE7987J and SML8250A on 16.01.2020 along Dunearn Road 
  
Dear Cecilia, 
  
OK, so I send together with another accident vehicle no. SLZ 4771C all original documents 
to your attention.  
Kindly confirm upon receipt.  
  
Thank you! 
  
Regards, 
Janet Tan  
  
  
On Wed, Mar 18, 2020 at 1:28 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
<CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Janet, 

  

Kindly send the original documents to me. 

  

Thanks  

  

  

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be 
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The 
terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this 
accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 
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From: Janet Tan [mailto:sltanjanettan@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 March 2020 1:02 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
<CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; dannysk yeo <dannyskyeo@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident involving SFE7987J and SML8250A on 16.01.2020 along Dunearn Road 

  

RESEND  

  

DEAR JASPER, 

  

PLEASE ADVISE WHO IS THE CASE HANDLER? 

SO I CAN SEND THE ORIGINAL DOCUMENTS TO THE RIGHT PERSON. 

  

THANKS. 

  

REGARDS, 

JANET TAN 

  

On Tue, Mar 17, 2020 at 1:51 AM Janet Tan <sltanjanettan@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Jasper, 

  

I enclosed the final repair cost and supporting documents for you to proceed with the 
settlement. Please confirm upon receipt and let me know if you have any questions. 
Thanks. 

  

Note*if this is not under your case, please help to froward to the right officer-in-charge. 
Thank you! 
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Regards, 

Janet Tan 

  
YSK AUTO WORKSHOP 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-49 
Autobay Singapore 417883 
Tel no.: 9640 2541 
Contact Person-in-charge: Mr. Danny Yeo  
Email: dannyskyeo@gmail.com 


