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51 URI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE 05933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD2000525/THE Date: 05 Feb 2020

Our Ref: CS/SMO20001841/Ksf3

The Motor Claims Department
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SCV49438 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 04/02/2020 at the premises of M/s HC AUTO PTE LTD and have the following to

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 14.439.80

Revised Estimate Amount ot 7.009.14

“Check” Items Amount : S% 1.456.34

Market Value : S% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage: N—

The vehicle sustained damages ) R ——

at the ofs front body. e N
otRide

Yours faithfully

Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, February 05, 2020 11:07 AM

To: ‘Teo, Grace’; Choo, Thelma

Cc: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: RE: CMTD2000525/THE - LKK/ SMN1654D & SCV4943B ACC ON 1 FEBRUARY 2020 AT
MSCP OF BLOCK 429 CHOA CHU KANG AVEMUE 4 AT ABOUT 1315 HOURS

Attachments: SCV4943B PRELI ADVISE.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SCV4943B
Date of survey : 04/02/2020
Number of days : 2 days

Thank you.

Hest Regards,

YC Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: ywonnew @k | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday. February 03, 2020 5:41 PM

To: Elaine Toh <Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com=; Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo(@sompo.com.sg=: Admin-D
(LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur(@lkkauto.com>
Ce: ylteam26@gmail.com; Ye. Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James
<irene.henry(@sompo.com.sg=

Subject: CMTD2000525/THE - LKK/ SMN1654D & SCV4943B ACC ON 1 FEBRUARY 2020 AT MSCP
OF BLOCK 429 CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 4 AT ABOUT 1315 HOURS

Our Reference: CMTD2000525/THE
Your Reference: SCV 4943 B (et)
Without Prejudice

Date: 03/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey({®sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S VISION LAW LLC



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 5:41 PM

To: Elaine Toh: Choo, Thelma; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’;
sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: ylteam26@gmail.com; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD2000525/THE - LKK/ SMN1654D & SCV4943B ACC ON 1 FEBRUARY 2020 AT

MSCP OF BLOCK 429 CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 4 AT ABOUT 1315 HOURS

Our Reference: CMTD2000525/THE
Your Reference: SCV 4943 B (et)

Without Prejudice
Date: 03/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motors $0Mpo.com.s

Attention:
M/S VISION LAW LLC

Dear Elaine,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN1654D & SCV49438 ON 01.02.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Kenneth Kong of LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK AUTO,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SCV4943B on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo_the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63224 681/

Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Thelma.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

1



6/ SOMPO A century of Trust
P/ insuRaNce |

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook; www facebook comiSompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

¢ App Store

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to helding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Elaine Toh <Elainetoh@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 5:32 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg>: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo(@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: ylteam26@gmail.com; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=: Henry, Irene James
<irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000525/THE - PRI/ SMN1654D & SCV4943B ACC ON 1 FEBRUARY 2020 AT
MSCP OF BLOCK 429 CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 4 AT ABOUT 1315 HOURS

Importance: High

Our Ref: SCV 4943 B (et)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your email of even date informing that you wish to conduct a pre-repair survey and your List of
Surveyors.

Our client confirmed appointment of LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (KENNETH KONG) as
the Single Joint Expert for this matter.

Venue: H C Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#05-09 Sin Ming Auto City

Singapore 575722
Contact: Mr. Joe @ 9457-0678 (Please call before going)

If you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 working days excluding any intervening
Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday, the said workshop will commence repairs thereafter without further
reference to you.

Thank you. Please initial here after completion of pre-repairins pection

Thank you

[:‘é‘-:’ Appointed surveyor
{(Name & Signature)

Date & Time of Inspection :




Regards,

Elaine Toh (Secretary)

VISTON LAW LLC

133 New Bridge Road

#18-01/02 Chinatown Point

Singapore 059413

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122) / Fax: 65356802

cc: SCV 4943 B — By fax: 64578287 only

From: Teo, Grace [! Xo 9

Sent: Monday. 3 February 2{}2{] 4. 29 PM

To: Elaine T{}h Chor:r Thelma

Ce: viteam26a .com: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTDEGD{}SESFTHE PRI/ SMN1654D & SCV4943B ACC ON 1 FEBRUARY 2020 AT MSCP
OF BLOCK 429 CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 4 AT ABOUT 1315 HOURS

Our Reference: CMTD2000525/THE
Your Reference: SCV 4943 B (et}
Without Prejudice

Date: 03/02/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S VISION LAW LLC

Dear Elaine,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN1654D & SCV4943B ON 01.02.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 03/02/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Thelma Choo the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63224 681/
i A mp

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)

3



Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of

the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F. 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.Sg

B, SOMPO
0/ A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo com sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase” via Sompo SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message,

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Elaine Toh <Elainetoh/wivisionlawlic.com=
Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 2:33 PM
To: Claims - Motor Survey <MolorSurvey@sompo.com.sg=

Ce: ylteam26/@ gmail.com

Subject: PRE REPAIR SURVEY --- YOUR REF: SMN 1654 D --- ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCV 4943
B AND SMN 1654 D ON 1 FEBRUARY 2020 AT MSCP OF BLOCK 429 CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE
4 AT ABOUT 1315 HOURS

Importance: High

Our Ref: SCV 4943 B (et)
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,



We are instructed by CHU MUN KONG to notify you of a road traffic accident on 1 February 2020 at about 1315 hours
at MSCP, of Block 429 Choa Chu Kang Avenue 4 involving our client’s vehicle registration number SCV 4943 B and
vehicle registration number SMN 1654 D driven by you/your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged
vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like
to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline,
our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Toh (Secretary)

VISION LAW LLC

133 New Bridge Road

#18-01/02 Chinatown Point

Singapore 059413

Tel: 65342811 (Ext. 122)/ Fax: 65356802

cc: SCV 4943 B — By fax: 64578287 only

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:



The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for
the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing
and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any
errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




Certificate of Insurance Pg. 1

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd.

[Company Rag. No. 19230001 6M) (GET Reg Mo M2-0000023-4

#0 MeCalum Straat #00-81 Tokio Marina Centre Singapoce 068048

T [B5) S22 111 F:[85) 6221 4385 / (5%) 8224 0895 E tmis@tokiomariancomag W www Lokiomaring. com

MARIN
N . TNSURANCE GROUP

TR Certificate of Insurance FORM MX1

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (MALAYSIA) N

:

Policy No.:  19-MV002847-R03 (Private Motor Car)

1. Index Mark and Registration Number SCVas43B Chassis No.: WDD2050422R049243
of Vehicle

2. Mame of Policyholder ME CHU MUN KONG

3. Effective date of the Commencement of
Insurance for the parposes of the Act 08042019

4. Date of Expiry of Insurance 0710472020

%, Persons or Class of Persons entitled to drive®
{s) The Policyholder.
() Any other person who is driving on the Policyholder's order or with his permission.

# Provided thal the Person driving i permitted in accordance with the Mummwmﬂmwﬁnhw?ﬁﬂ or i beon
s0 permitind and is not disualified by order of & Court of Law or by reason of any ermctment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Motor
Viehiche. And provided further this the Motor Vehicls is registered under the Road Traffic Act and its regsatration under the Road Traffle Act has
nod been cancelbed af the tme of the sccident losi or damage.

6. Limitstions as to use*

Usse only for social domestic and pleasure purposes and for the Policyholder's business.

The policy does not cover use for hire mmmm-mmiﬁmwﬁ.wdﬂminlmu carriage of
m{mmm}hm«mm-qmwmmmmwwhmmmm
Trade.

& Limsiicaitos mendited Dioparantve by Secrion § of the Mator Felvicles {Third: Party Risky and Compansation) At (Chapier 157)
it Saction 95 of the Rood Trangpen dct, 1987 (Malayra), are nol i be inclwdid under thiss Readings
W harsby contify that the Policy 1o which this Certificate relsiss s insed in accordance with the provision of the Motor Vehicles
(Third-Party Risks and Compensation] Ave (Chapier 159} snd Part TV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysis).
Please refer 10 the Policy Schodule for fill detnils, serms and conditions of the nyurance.
IMPORTANT BOTICE
This Certificate is nol transferable During its currency, if the insurance is cancelled for whatsoever reason, you must returs the Certificaa w0 Tok
Marin¢ Insuranos Singapore Lid within 7 days thereof or, rucmumumﬁ.mmmummhu
effect. Faifure to comply with this mu-m&mmmmum}um 189

ol ol o ooy e ey e — ¢

ADHMDIONAL INFORMATION Account: 1932DDA
Invurapce Plan: Comprehensive Approved Workshop Plan
Limit for total lous or thefi: Prevailing Market Value
Policy Excess: Orwm Damage Claims SGD 1,500
‘Windscreen Excess SGD 100

Tokio Marine Insurnnce Singapore Lid,

Autharised Signature

User Mame:  [ntermediaries from TH O Printed  DOTLTHS

Page 7 of 17



H C AUTO PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #05-09 Sin Ming Auto City Singapore 575722
Tel : 64570678 Fax : 6457 8287
Co.and GST Reg. No. : 200820153N

Date : 03 /02 / 2020

ESTIMATE COSTS OF REPAIR

WO =] O L B W —

e =

Mr Chu Mun Kong ez i e
C/o 160 Sin Ming Drive

# 05-09 Sin Ming Auto City léﬁfn/v /;J%g_ /Qn
Singapore 575721 Z L é) #/ ";
P s

Dear Sir / Madam .

24
Vehicle no. : SCV 4943 B - Mercedes Benz C200 s
Accident date  : 01/02/2020
| Quantity Descriptions Amount ( Sw
1 pe front bumper fascia /6a 6 4’“ /4‘{ 1.726.00 L
1 pe ofs front bumper side retainer s T, 93.00 —
1 pc o/s front bumper side bracket § f=~ 25060 K
I pc o/s front bumper sponge cht b A 183.00
1 pe o/s front bumper tow cover § = 7900 X
I pe os head lamp 2(¢0.4s Cas 538000 —
1 pe o/s head lamp panel § #T 828.00 ¥
I pe o/s head lamp lower bracket § #U ga00 A
2 pes o/s front bumper sensor | @ 306.00 243 s407 612,00 -1
1 pe o's wheel tyre § 966,00 ¢
1 pe o/s wheel rim $ ‘=~ 1,193.00 £
§  11.394.60
Less 10 % S 1,139.46
[$  10.255.14 |
Labour charges p 120000 Z2e(¢
To putty and spray painting 5 1,000.00 Z5. ef
To check. replace, repair wiring. re-set fault code § A~ 680.00 K
Re-seal anti rust g4 20000 X
Remove and refix reverse sensor b 160.00 & e/ | ~
§  13495.14 [(360F>
Plus T% GST ) 944.66
Sub-Total [s  14,439.80 |

Page 1 of 1



H C AUTO PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive # 05-09 Sin Ming Auto City Singapore 575722
Tel : 6457 0678 TFax : 6457 B2E7
Co. and GST Reg. No. : 200820153N

Date : 04 /02 / 2020

RE : Supplementary

Mr Chu Mun Kong

C/o 160 Sin Ming Drive

# 05-09 Sin Ming Auto City
Singapore 575722

Dear Sir/ Madam ,

Vehicle no. : SCV 4943 B - Mercedes Benz C200

Accident date 01/02/2020

r Quantity Descriptions ﬁmuunt{SS}!

1 I pec ofs front bumper fog lamp cover Del's 119.30 /
Less 10% 5 11.93
E 107.37 |

Plus ;: 7% GST 3 7.52
Grand total |'s 114.89 |

Page 1 of |



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333

TEL:

G256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 129607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURAMNCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO20001841/Ksf3n2
oot " LN
#05-01/06 Date: 19-03-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SMN 16540 Veh. Inspected SCV 49438
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD2000525/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TED Assign Date 03/02/2020
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES C200 (A) c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WDD2050422R049243 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 160515 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 225/50 R17 COMTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre 225/50 R17 CONTIMENTAL 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  01/02/2020 |inspection Date 04/02/2020
Survey held at HCAUTO& MOTORS SERVICE
BLK 14 SIN MING ESTATE,
#01-07/08,
SINGAPORE 575658
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h, Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days




-
-

1 74 74

22a

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SCV 49438

Page No.1aof 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [\t &) o
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER FASCIA BUCKLED / 1,726.00 1,606.00
DENTED
1|ors FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER NECESSARY 93.00 93.00
1|ors FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET SERVICEABLE 250,60 -
1|0rs FRONT BUMPER SPONGE CRACKED 183.00 183.00
1]0/s FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER SERVICEABLE 79.00 -
1|0/S HEAD LAMP cuTt 5,380.00 3,640.80
1|0/S HEAD LAMP PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 828.00 -
LABOUR
1|0is HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 84.00 -
LABOUR
2|cis FRONT BUMPER SENSOR @3$306.00 SHORTED (1 PC 612,00 265.00
OMNLY)
1|0VS WHEEL TYRE SERVICEABLE 966.00 -
1|0/S WHEEL RIM SERVICEABLE 1,193.00 -
1|o/s FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER (ADDITIONAL) |DENTED 118.30 119.30
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,151.39 -580.71
10,362.51 5,316.39
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF Qs 1,200.00 220.00
HEAD LAMP PANEL AND O/S HEAD LAMP LOWER
BRACKET.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 250.00
TO CHECK, REPLACE,REPAIR WIRING RE-SET FAULT NOT NECESSARY G80.00 -
CODE.
RE-SEAL ANTI RUST, NOT NECESSARY 200.00 =
REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. 160.00 60.00
3,240.00 530.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,602.51 5,846.39

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20001841/Ksfan2
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Page Mo.:2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

4,650.00

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O20001841/Ksf3n2

/45

KOMNG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

iy aciing or eolying on this

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client namad on the front page of this Report.
= dp i i g o il - Do il O A0 CAart SNy Uierg od




