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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2019 2:29 PM
To: SLQK23@GMAIL.COM
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 6350J & SME 4969Z ON 13/09/2019 ALONG/AT 88 

TANGLIN HALT ROAD

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

SLQK23@GMAIL.COM

Admin A

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 11/13/2019 2:29 PM

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 11/13/2019 2:29 PM

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 11/13/2019 2:29 PM

Our Ref: CC3/AIG19016430/Eka3 
 

LIM QING KANG,SHAWN 
[POLICY HOLDER] 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 6350J & SME 4969Z ON 13/09/2019 ALONG/AT 88 TANGLIN HALT ROAD 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you 
and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
We have received a claim against your motor insurance policy. 
               
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may not 
be absolved from blame for this accident. As such, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
 
If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in writing
within the next 10 days i.e. by 23/11/2019, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the 
without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other 
party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 14 October 2019 4:11 PM
To: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: LOD   Re: Accident on 13/9/2019 involving SHD 6350J & SME 4969Z (AIG's insured)  

Our Ref: TAX/09/19/2045/lg 
Attachments: img-X14153258-0001.pdf

Dear All, 
 
We quantify our own losses as follows:-  
  

Cost of Repair $2400.00            
Loss of Rental $869.38  ( 6.5 days x $133.75  ) 
LTA Search Fee $7.00            
Total $3276.38            

  
  
We enclose the following documents:  

1)    Repair invoice  
2)    Proof of rental rate 
3)    GIA report  
4)    Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5)    LTA search 

 
Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 
 










