
















Our Ref:  CC6/QBE20001784/Aha3 

 

25 FEBRUARY 2020   

  

MUHAMED REDWAN BIN ABDUL RAHIM    By Post & By Email 

BLOCK 182 PASIR RIS STREET 11 

#05-36 

SINGAPORE 510182 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMD 8783X AND SGW 2721K ON 24/01/2020  
 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for QBE Insurance (Singapore) 

Private Limited to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the 

Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 

therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.  

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 

30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 

However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 

claim and your NCD will be protected.  

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh 

Case Handler 

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. QBE Insurance (Singapore) Private Limited 

             (Motor Claims Dept) 

 redizanah@gmail.com  

 (Email)   
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Andrew Lim <andrew.lim@qbe.com>
Sent: May 18, 2020 2:20 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Jenny Toh; claims-singapore
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMD8783X (OI : QBE - VC013406) AND 

SGW2721K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/QBE20001784/Aha3) on 24/01/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Jasper, 
 
Please proceed as advised. 
 
Thank you. 
 
  
Andrew Lim 

Executive 

Claims | Asia 

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583 

+65 6477 1243 | +65 6224 6633 

Website LinkedIn Twitter    

 

 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 15 May 2020 4:00 PM 
To: Andrew Lim <andrew.lim@qbe.com> 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMD8783X (OI : QBE - VC013406) AND SGW2721K (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/QBE20001784/Aha3) on 24/01/2020 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the subject matter. 
 
It was reported that Insured rear-ended third party. 
 
A letter was sent out to the Insured to notify TP claim and NCD issues and no feedback received till date.   
 
Summary to offer to repairer NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD  is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED  REVISED -TO OFFER  
Cost of Repair (w/gst) $                  21,373.79   $                   7,704.00 
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Loss of Rental  ($180.00 x 11 days)   $                     1,980.00   $                    1,650.00 ( $150.00 x 11 days)  
GIA Search Fee   $                             2.00   $                            2.00 
Proposed Total   $                   23,355.79  $                     9,356.00 

 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 
 

Recommended days      6 Days 
Weekends / Downtime / Holiday       5 Days 
CLAIM DAYS       11 Days 

 
For your approval and/or further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 13 March, 2020 2:57 PM 
To: Andrew Lim 
Cc: Admin A; Jenny Toh; claims-singapore; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SMD8783X (OI : QBE - VC013406) AND SGW2721K (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/QBE20001784/Aha3) on 24/01/2020 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Enclosed for your perusal are the following:  
 

-          Marked Estimated Cost of Repair 
-          Preliminary advice 

  
Thank you. 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>
Sent: May 18, 2020 3:14 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Chloe
Subject: Re: SGW2721K CLAIMING AGAINST SMD8783X DOA 24.01.2020 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/QBE20001784/Aha3

Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Jasper 
 
Thanks for your email. 
 
We accept your offer as $9,300, please send us the discharge voucher for the close case,thanks. 
 
*** Please kindly take note this claim is under "New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd" *** 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Sukyi Chong 
New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd  
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883) 
Tel : 6747 9241     Fax : 6741 7276 
 

Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 
 
On Mon, May 18, 2020 at 2:52 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
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Thank you for your email. 

  

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $9,300.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: May 13, 2020 9:24 AM 
To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) 
<jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SGW2721K CLAIMING AGAINST SMD8783X DOA 24.01.2020 *** LKK REF: CC6/QBE20001784/Aha3 


