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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 30 January 2020 10:35 AM

To: 'Admin A'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR’

Cc 'Claims'

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SLW 9160 Z ON 29/1/2020
Attachments: SLW8160Z - 29012020.pdf

Dear all,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.

Kindly arrange survey on 3/2/2020, 11AM. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,

Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Lid reg ve iwomozzniwg
35 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p- +65 6388 2323 d. +63 6768 9828 1. +65 6341 1183

- The new Audi A7 Spottback: Do you re

Email Disclaimer

| then delete this messaga from your system.

or useit for ar intents or any attachment to any ether person, Thank you.




Note: This document has not been finalised. \

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregNo:1sss07198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933 ‘
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn: Date: 04 Feb 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SLW91602 Accident Date : 29/01/2020
Make : AUDI A4 Policy No. : 1800022575
Assignment Date : 03/02/2020 Excess 1 580.00
Date of Inspection : 03/02/2020 Est. Duration of Repair 14,00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s partion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :8% 13,717.00
Revised Amount :S% 2,622.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 0.00
Total :S% 2,622.00
Lump Sum Repair :S%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S%
Pre-Accident Value S8 120,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S% 60,278.00
Salvage Value :S§
Margin for Repair S$ 59,722.00

Remarks

( x ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us have
your authorisation.

{ )  The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( ) Other comments :



Denise Tay (LKKAuto) = s o

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 February 2020 4:53 PM

To: Claims; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SLW 9160 Z ON 29/1/2020
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLW9160Z (Excess $$600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 9:02 AM _

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SLW 9160 Z ON 29/1/2020

Dear Denise,
Attached is the police report.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg no 198502271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLW9160Z (24698086425G)
oD
Jan 29 2020 11:45AM
[KELVIN WONG CHONG YU]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

[Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread | _Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 07/02/2020 15:06 PM,
To  LKKH . S ..
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$2622.00) - SLW9160Z - Claim Handler: Chan, Yoke Shi

Approved:2622.00:Why labour 2 needed? Photo required. Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents.




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 650H
e AN A S e e L R A 53N A 0 B0 Y L o o i |
Vehicle No.: SLW9160Z
Vehicle to be Exported:' No '
Intended Deregistration Date: 03 Feb 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI S TRONIC
Primary Colour: Black “
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: CVK052310
Chassis No.: WAUZZZF41JA086181
Maximum Power Output: 140.0 kW (187 bhp)
Open Market Value: $33,058.00
Original Registration Date: 08 Mar 2018
First Registration t?_eufé: 08 Mar 2018
Transfer Count: ) 0
Actual ARF Paid: $38,282.00
T B e e ey
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 07 Mar 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: $28,711.00
R A e S e T T e ey
COE Expiry Date: 07 Mar 2028
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $39,001.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31,567.00
Total Rebate Amount: $60,278.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Feb 2020

OK
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Ej Audi A4 2,0A TFSI S-tronic | $128,000  $13,550 fyr 12-Feb-2018 1,984 cc 5,000 km Luxury Available

Loan Interest At 2,28%, Extremely Well Maintained And Fully Agent Maintained, This Beast Does Not Just Look Beautiful, Tt's 100%
Accident Free, View To Belleve! Trade In Welcome Call/SMS To Arrange A Viewing Today! Viewing Strictly By Appointment Only!

[ Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic | $119,800  $12,470 fyr 20-Feb-2018 = 1984cc - 26,500km . Luxury . Available

Agent Car With Serviced History.

i 7 Posled: 070202019 Tags: 2018 Audj A, 2015 audi 59, Aud: A4, audi a4, Audi; A4, 24, Used Audi

D Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $118,800 $12,140 fyr 11-Apr-2018 1,984cc . 29,000km Luxury . Available
Low Monthly From $8xx Only! Full Agent Unit Maintained By Premium AutoMobiles, 5 Years Warranty Available Till April 20231 Spacious, "

Sporty Yet Powerfull As Good As Brand New., Low Depre At $11,500 Only! Flexible Financing Schemes Available Here, Trade In Welcome... L Pacuiluan g
“L\‘ Posted: 20 Tags: 2018 Audi A4, 2018 aud| a4, Audi 24, audi a4, Audi, &4, 34, Used Audi

[] Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic ( $123,800 ©  $12,620/yr | 11-May-2018 | 1984cc . 27750km . Lwary  Available

Only Sporty Grey On The Market In 2018! 1 Owner Only! Agent Warranty With Audi Singapore Till May 2023! A Peace Of Mind!
Call/SMS/WhatsApp For Viewing Today!

Republic Auto

o Ry e L : 3 e : 3
3 _\_r Posted; 02-Dec-2019 - Tagst- 208 Audi A4, 2028 acdl 84, dudi A4, audl ad, Audi, A4, a4, Used Audi

KGC Workshop Pte Ltd (Koh Guan Chua Workshop) - Specialist for Audi Car repair, servicing & maintenance
We specialise in general car repair, insurance claim, car spray painting, respray, bodykit fitting, custom bodykit.
More info about this shop

[:| Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic © $119,800 $12,100fyr | 25-May-2018 = 1,984cc 44,000km Luxury ! Available

Tip Top Condition! 5 Years Agent Warranty Until 2023, Powerful, Sporty Yet Luxury! Almost Brand New Condition. 100% Low Genuine
Mileage. Well Maintained, Bank Loan Promo Rate 2.28% Only! 100% High Loan/In House Loan Avallable,All Trade In Welcome, Please C...

Hua Yang Credit Pte Ltd

S 7 -Postedi D2:eb2020° | Yoas: 2018 Audl A4, Z0Y8 audi ad; Audi A4 aldi a4 Auidl, 4. a4, lsed Audi

a Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic $129,000 | $12,780 fyr . 31-Aug-2018 1,984cc © 18,000km | Luxury Available

Almast New Condition, 5 Years Agent Warranty, WhatsApp/Text Far Appointment, Ideal White/Black Combination, Just Completed 1st
Servicing With Agent! No Consignment Agents Please,

[7] Audi A4 2.0A TFSI S-tronic | $128,800  $12,710/yr  © 10-Sep-2018 | 1984cc ~ 24488km °  Luxury  Available

1 Owner Unit, 5 Years Agent Warranty With Audi, Sporty Sedan And Spacious Interior, Genuine Low Mileage At Only 25K Km.
Call/SM5/WhatsApp For Viewing Today!

Republic Auto
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