Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 8 December 2020 10:29 AM

To: '‘Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK)'

Cc: '‘Cheng Hoe Motor (HQ)'; Admin A

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SJN1046U vs SKX2174L (AIG) on D.O.A.: 23/01/2020 ***

LKK REF: CC4/AIG20001739/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear June,

We confirm settlement as per your LOD for $1,898.50(all in).

PAYMENT ADVICE
Your Ref : AlG Vehicle no. D |SKX2174L
Claimant Vehicle No. D |1SIN1046U
Date of Accident . 123/01/2020

Traffic Accident involving vehicle/s No. : |LEVEL 2 PRPM29(ELIAS MALL)MSCP

BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S

S/No. [tems Amount Remark
1 Repair cost b 1,658.50
2 Loss of Use $ 240.00 ($80 x 3 days)
3 LTA Search $
TOTAL $ 1,898.50

All payment should be made payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd.

We will proceed to do the needful.

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 6 March 2020 1:16 PM

To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) <chmamk(@singnet.com>

Cec: Cheng Hoe Motor (HQ) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SIN1046U vs SKX2174L (AIG) on D.O.A.: 23/01/2020 ***
LKK REF: CC4/A1G20001739/ka3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’'s approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) <chmamk(@singnet.com>
Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 12:35 PM
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To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Cheng Hoe Motor (HQ) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SJN1046U vs SKX2174L (AIG) on D.O.A.: 23/01/2020 ***
LKK REF: CC4/A1G20001739/ka3

Hi Khanchna,

Pending for your advise on liability for this case as well please.
P/S : Kenneth has surveyed the above vehicle on last month.
Thank you.

Rgds

Dorlyn Li

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK)
Tel : 64812001

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK)

Sent: Friday, February 28, 2020 11:09 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) ; Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) ; Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SIN1046U vs SKX2174L (AIG) on D.O.A.: 23/01/2020 *** | KK REF:
CC4/A1G20001739/ka3

Hi Khanchna,

Please assist to advise on liability for SIN1046U please.
* Kenneth has surveyed the above car on 04/02/2020.
Thank you.

Rgds

Dorlyn Li

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK)

Tel : 64812001

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 9:16 AM

To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) ; Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SIN1046U vs SKX2174L (MSIG) on D.O.A.: 23/01/2020 *** LKK REF:
CC4/A1G20001739/ka3

Dear Sirs / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal to release OI GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Khanchna at 6841 2360.
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Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

« Wishing you a Happy and rrosperous Lunar New Yegq, » : £ i

.S
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK) <chmamk(@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 31 January, 2020 3:54 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-B <admin-b@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SIN1046U vs SKX2174L (MSIG) on D.O.A.: 23/01/2020

Hi,

Please assist to advise who is the case handler for the above vehicle and advise on liability pls.
* GIA report as per attach.

Thank you.

Rads,

Dorlyn Li (Ms)

CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD (AMK)
No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A

#01-04 Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6481 2001

Fax : 6482 1296

Email :chmamk@singnet.com

On Fri Jan 31 2020 10:19:46 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time) Nivitha (LKK Auto)
<admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote:

---------- Original Message ----------

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.



Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From:

Subramaniam, Divyashni [mailto:Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com ]|

Sent: Friday, 31 January 2020 9:13 AM

To: assienments@lkkauto.com; 'Admin A'

Cec: Lim, Kok-Chong; Fan, Winnie-LW; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Azlan, Syazairdina; Chan,
Yoke Shi; Hor, Yinrul; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Parthiban,
Theerthan; Subramaniam, Divyashni; chmamk(@singnet.com.sg

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — SIN1046U vs SKX2174L (OI) on D.O.A.:
23/01/2020

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Este es un mensaje cifrado y seguro. Para leerlo, abra el archivo
adjunto.

Esta € uma mensagem criptografada segura. Para lé-lo, abra o
anexo.

Ceci est une sécurité, un message crypté. Pour le lire, ouvrez la
piéce jointe.

ChIFESIEEIN-BF A —IILTI, BEICIEIRTTI7AIL
#HRWLTLESLY,

Click here by 2020-02-06 19:12 CST to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.



More Info
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