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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page | of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
591B

SGD9939D
No

31 Jan 2020
NISSAN

SYLPHY 1.6 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
4DR

Brown

2015

HR16975143B
MNTBBAB17Z0024975
85.0kW (113 bhp)
$16.439.00

27 Nov 2015

27 Nov 2015

0

$16,439.00

Yes
26 Nov 2025
$12,329.00

26 Nov 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$59,200.00

$34.467.00

$46,796.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 31 Jan 2020

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl‘action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereglnput ZFUNCTION _ID=F030... 31-Jan-20



Used Nissan Sylphy Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COMM in  Sig

Rental Cars Soll My Car Directory Products Inuurance Articles Forum

Mow Cars

ANNOUNCING Speed

as sgCarMart Premium Dealer for the @

Page | of 2

Resouroes

Post an Advertisement 2014 serr Banz High Spec B200 Dapre & $10K Only VALUE FOR MONEY
VALUE FOR TIME

Sell it yoursell Advertise T a0 st

£58 until it's SOLD!

A PEACE OF MIND

HOTLINE: 6741 9997  vew out s

Browse try Categary w Sort by Date Posted W | ) resuilta/page | W)
g wehicles Mes=an Swiphy B Submiti
M e Deprecabion Eng Cap Ml mge veh Type

Missan Syiphy L.64 Premiun £53, 900 §8, 000 [yr 1&-Dc1-20N5 1586 oc #1313 km Sextan
Pristing Condition, Very Well Maintsined, Vehice Alweys Pasked [n Sheitered Carpath. Excellent Conditiors. High Loan And High Tride In

fisz=an Sylphy 1.6 §54, 800 $8.100 /i 11-Det-2015 1,598 cx 1,154 SeEn
Beautiful Conditsony Wit | Dwener Onby,100% Accident Free Reguler Serwoed. Nice+Lucky Car Mate Number, Powerful 1.6L Yet Fusi EM

Nissan Syiphy 1.6A $51 800 §7. 740 fypr 21-Oec-2015 1,558 c Y8, 000 om Sedan

Sig Andd Spacioun Mid Sipe Sedan With Sporty Red. Getting A Safety And Good Fuel Effoent Sedan Car For You And Your Lovety Family

Nis=an Sylphy 1 &4 Premium 150 800 L7 &40 Jyr J8- Ay OIS L5098 (x BE, D) imi Sedan

Accident Fres

da
MNissan Note 2ot Front Strut Bar

Missan Sylphy 164 $51.99% 18,450 Sy 1620158 L5548 ¢ 000 km Seapia

| Dwrer Bestifiul Ang Sporty White [n Blarh Leather nteroe fissan Syiphy | BA) Greal Pusl EMicency And Mantained By Agent Tan Ch

Fiisan Sylphy L.GA %50 AEN B, 710 IB-Apr- 015 1,594 o 03,000 wm Sear

! Dwrer Beautiful Biack In Brown Lesther Interior Nessn Syipitny 184" Graat Foe! Efoency &nd Maintained By Agent Tan Chong Mators

Missan Sylphy 1.8A Premiun $52.700 $7 470 fpr 30-Der- 2015 1,508 o B0, 000 km Seda

lrrradiate Trinafer OF Owmeribip For Peace OF Mind! No Delays! very Well Maintmined Unit, Accident-Free, Wiew To Believe Mo Repars

Compars

hitps://www.sgcarmart.com/used cars/listing.php?RGD=2015&MOD=Nissan Sylphv&RPG=20&VEH=..
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 January 2020 6:25 PM

To: 'sur@|kkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Elmer Alfonso; C Meenachi - 11

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SGD9939D AND YOUR INSURED
VEHICLE GBD7305E ON 22/01/2020

Attachments: SGDY939D ESTIMATE 22.01.2020.pdf, SGD9939D GIA REPORT 22.01.2020.pdf:

SGD9939D LTA SEARCH 22.01.2020 pdf
|rtﬂ'ﬂ""b -59.“}”:'{1

Dear Sir / Mdm, P E\mﬂ"
v ot In

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SGD9939D and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Meenachi.
*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

*We have started using audatex since 1" Dec 2019, Please do adjustments through Audatex and upload the
report onto Merimen,

Thank You,

Warmest regards,
31‘:/11&# ofa.f
Motor & Work Injury Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecll Street, 108 Bullding, Level 5
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 206 Fax: 6224 4174
S5&P ‘A-* rated Enmpnn:.f

IH’I MA

J' Ih TELNATIONAL
(‘ ]N\UHAht 1

From: Elmer Alfonso [mailto:elmer@tanchong.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 29 January, 2020 11:14 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE 5GD9939D AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE GBD7305E ON
22/01/2020

Dear Sir/Ma'am,
We propose LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Best Regards,



Elmer Alfanso

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 11:01 AM

To: Elmer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SGD99390 AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE GBD7305E ON

22/01/2020

ACCIDENT ON 22/01/22020 INVOLVING GBD7305E (111) & SGD9939D
Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We propose using one of the following motor surveyors:

* Automobile Inspection Services Pte Lid
* VP Appraisal

* Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd

« Infiniti Appraisal Service

* P Knights Adjusters

LBS Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Priority Services

RT Appraisal

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

@ & =

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections
to the above list.

We have started using Audatex since 1* Dec 2019.
Please submit your estimate/quotation through Audatex so that our surveyors can make the adjustments according.

Warmest regards,
Stanley fo
Motor & Work Injury Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecll Streat, 108 Bullding, Level 5
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 206 Fax: 6224 4174
5&P A’ rnu-d Cummr
Ihl]lﬁ
lh P HMNATIONAL
(l Ir-u-.uu.-mu
||||| & F D E B

o ey

From: Elmer Alfonso Emg'I;n:e!mgr@:agghggg,mm]

Sent: Wednesday, 29 January, 2020 10:22 AM

To: Motar Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Subject: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SGD9938D AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE GBD7305E ON

22/01/2020

Dear Sir/Ma'am,



Good afterngon,

Prior the above, my client wish to make third party claim against your insured, direct settlement with claiming for
loss of use/vehicle rental . Can you Arrange survey 30.01.2020 on 11:00 am. Here at AUTOLUTIION INDUSTRIAL PTE
LTD address 19 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408623

Kindly check your insured liability and revert.

Attachment are my client accident report and workshop estimate
Regards,

Elmer Alfonso

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubl Road 4
5408623

Tel:6703B691 EMAIL: elmer@tanchong com

Fram: Elmer Alfonso

Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2020 5:33 PM

To: Mator Claim - 1| <motorclaim@iiji.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SGD9939D AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE GBD7305E ON
22/01/2020

Dear Sir/Ma‘'am,
Good afternoon,

Prior the above, my client wish to make third party claim against your insured, direct settlement with claiming for
loss of use/vehicle rental . Can you Arrange survey 30.01.2020 on 11:00 am. Here at AUTOLUTIION INDUSTRIAL PTE
LTD address 19 UBI ROAD 4 SINGAPORE 408623

Kindly check your insured liability and revert.
Attachment are my client accident report and workshop estimate
Regards,

Elmer Alfonso

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd
19 Ubl Road 4

5408623

Tel:67038691 EMAIL: elmer@tanchong com

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree 1o the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

3



It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

notified that any use. distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

intercepted. corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

[ndia Intermnational Insurance Pre Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this ¢laim 1o us, you are deemed 10 have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby

notified that any use. distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.

India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No, 198703792-K



2NT12020 Manmen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall is associated with .

*5GD9939D (MCV202000000270)
[GBD7305E]
™

TAN HONG CHOON
Jan 22 2020 12:00AM

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG). sent on 17/02/2020 09:10 AM,
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($50.00) - SGD9938D - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

|}ipprwed:ﬂ.uu:xmnw REJECT TP CLAIM. TP ADMIT HE CHANGING LANE

hitps iisingapore. menmen.comiclaims/index.cfm fusebox=SVCmall&fuseaction=dsp_PrinlACFID=57192241ACFTOKEN=fbbeb0308104004-25F 11



Cecilia thnna (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 9:271 AM

To: Elmer Alfonso

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SGD9939D AND YOUR INSURED
VEHICLE GBDT305E ON 22/01/2020

Attachments: 01 GIA REPORT.pdf

Your Ref: SGD §939D Without Prejudice

Qur Ref: CC4/M2000167 1 /Ugs3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 7305E(lll) & SGD 9939D ON 22/01,/2020
We refer to the above matier.

Attoched s a copy of our insured accident statement for your easy reference. We have reviewed the matter
and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accident. Your client has admitted that he change o
Our Insured lone. Thus Bola 515 applies to your client.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction ta deny liability and unabile to look into your client's
mattar,

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negaotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred fram this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | emall: CecilinChonglidauto.com! fax; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ul Industninl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{a08033)

g I
SESRSR W Save bhe Lardh Priné only when necassary:

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 10 February 2020 2:39:34 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: 'Elmer Alfonso'; "Maotor Claim - III'; SUR; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Admin A

Ce: 'C Meenachl - I1T'



Menmen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

e -CLAIH SUBFDLDER."{PGI“"HH for Eur\l‘lv ﬂﬁﬂﬂrﬂ
we

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cane Fintified Est Submmitted Adtj Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad| Submmitted Ins Auth ed Status
oy | 12,780 2020 o $$1,55000  |$$1,550.00 Lo et
tonhes | £ Ad) Rpe | o esmates | | _view e | Cancal Cowe |

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by sdjuster]
Insured: = 1D: -
Mg
Clabmant: TAM HONG CHOON
Vehicls Beg, . |22/01/2020 00:00 - :59
gy SGD9939D Date of LOSS: [/ 49 Months and 26 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r))
Claim Type: | TP / MCV2020D0000270 raaeycover | p1gMCvo001298
Vehicle Reg.
No. GBD7305E m":ﬂ
(Imsured) )
Exress:
Aepairer: Autolution Industrisl Pte Lisl (Ubl) 19 Ubl Rosd 4, 408623 Ubl - Tel:
HANEIAG | india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 63476100 ... [Handied by C. Meanachi - 6347 6071]
Adjustar: LKK Auto Consuftants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 11/02/2020]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case mail |
o 115G (00320201 AMert - Adj Mandate Approved (550,00) - SGOY93Y0 - Claim Handler: C. Mesnachi
e 1I_SG (17/02/2020): Aert - Ad] Mandate Approved [5$0.00) - SGD99390 - Claim Handler: C. Mesnachi
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View All | Search Tusks | Create New Task | compiete |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?

No regults.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ds... 4/3/2020



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*5GD9939D (MCV1020D0000270)
[GBD7305E]
™
TAN HONG CHOON
Jan 22 2020 12:00AM

[-1
Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Upioad Bocuments |  Upioed Protos | Compone wew Lester | View [fizw i Srowsar |
Photos/Images Goerpage V]| &
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 170220 00:27 | Ganaral View O ceavc | A
2 [17/022009:27 | General View @ | Lediec |
3 |17/02/2009:37 | Ganeral View 0| ire | @
4 |17/02/2009:27 | General View Q| warws | B
5 |17/02/20 09:27 | Ganaral View 0| oawc | B
& |17/022009:27 | Genersl View 0| s | B
7 |inpuznpe:27 | General View 0| wadws | B
8 [17/02/2009:27 | Geners View 0| waaws | B
9 |17/02/2009:27 | Genersl View 0| wows | B
10 | 17/02/20 09:27 | General View g was G | B4
11 |1702/2009:27 | Genersl View 0| eawc | A
12 |17/02/2009:27 | General View 0| tasws | A
13 |17/02/2009:27 | Genersl View Q| weiwrc | A
14 [17/0/2009:27 | Odometer Reading 0| ooaws || A
15 |17/02/2009:27 | Genersl View @ wwows | B
16 |17/02/20 09:27 General View 0| wawe | A
17 |10 0227 | General View @ | earws | A
16 |17/00/20 09:27 | Ganaral View 0| ceawc | A
19 [17/02/2009:27 | Geners] View 0| weiws | A
20 [17/0/20 09:27 | General View 0| weaws |
21 |17/02720 09:27 Ganeral View ! Load G | BA
22 |17/02/2009:27 | Genersl View 0| eews | A
73 |17/02/30 09:27 | Genersl View | weaws || B
24 |17/02/20 09:27 | Genersl View @ | oaws | M
25 |17/02/20 09:27 | Chassis Number 0| oaaws | A
Documentation 1 per page ~]| &
No | Amiabel/Aeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HGQ) Thumbnail |Print
1 |31/01/20 16:07 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAILL TO III DO 30.01.2020 Load POF
2 [3/01/20 16:07 | TP ESTIMATE Load POF
3 [31/01/20 16:07  |TP GIA REPORT Load POF
4 |05/02/10 10:52 | TP ESTIMATE-MARKED Load POF
5 |26/02/20 16:11 | REJECTION EMALL TO TP @ | loaaror
No | Finalized On India International Insurance Pt Ltd (HG) Thumbnail | Print
1 |01/02/2009:44 | Singapore Accident Statement @ | Load Por
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Thiers are no document checklists configured.
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Dur Checklist Remarks - LK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HO)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Hiakl- SEmarks arm private @niews you show 8 B T vl
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co regno 1sss071s8m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6258-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

QOur File No:  CCa4MI2000167T1/UGS30Q2

Date: 04/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. a2 Intermational Insurance Ple ey o, D19MCV0001298
Claimant Insured Vehicle
Vehicls No : SG0D8eY38D No : GBD7305E
Date of Loss:  22/01/2020 Nature of Claim: TP Claim  11cV202000000270
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SGD93%38D
Make & Model: :‘IBS&S&?;I SYLPHY, 1.6 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD Engine No: HR169751438
Reg. Date: 27M11/2015 (Man. Year; 2015) Chassis No MNTBBAB17Z0024975
Caolour: Grey Odometer: 58412 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Markel Value/New Car
. NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 195/60 R16
Fronl Lefl Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama & mm
Froni Right Side: Yokohama 6 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama 6 mm
The above values represant the remaming lyre reads depih
'COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %)
Parts 818.72 BE6B. T2 50.00 544
Miscellanaous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.,350.00 1,070.00 1,280.00 54 4T
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 3,268.72 1,838.72 1,330.00 40.69
Approved Total (Overridden) (55) 1,550.00
(5%) 3.268.72 1,550.00 1.718.72 52.58
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55%) 228 81 10B.50 12031 52.58
MNett Amount (S$) 3,497.53 1,658.50 1,839.03 52.58
Global Sum Settlament (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 28/01/2020
Date Inspected: 31/01/2020 Inspected AL Autolution Industrial Pte Lid (Ubi)
19 Ubi Road 4
Singapore 408623
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0days
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Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: This report representiy our findings af ihe time and place of ingpection siated hersin, Such napection has bean camed o fo e bast af our
knawiledge and abilly but amy oiher labilty under any other circumstancas i1 hersby expressly exciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 03 Mar 2020)

Parts: 143 NISSAN SYLPHY 1.8 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD 4DR (A) (Catalogue:Mernmen Singapore
1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominaled Standard List) .

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SGDS838D) '

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *RH RR DOOR UPPER SASH TAPE Necessary 31.60FN *31.80FN
2 1 *RH RR DOOR RR SASH TAPE MNecessary 19.20FN *18.20FN
3 1 *RH RR DOOR FRT SASH TAPE Mecessary 19.50FN *18.50FN
4 1 *RH RR DOOR Dented 1,01560FN *1,01560FN
5§ 1 *SUNDRIES Mot Necessary 50.00FS *.FS

F=Franchise part S=SpcNatt. N=NettliamDiac

Sub Total (S§) 1,135.90 1,085.90

- Nett Item Discount on N tems 20,00/20.00% (55§) 217.18 217.18

Total Parts (S§) 818.72 868.72

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellansous items ssiected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltams

1 LABOR CHARGES TO REPAIR RH RR FENDER & RH New 1,170.00 390.00

ROCKER PANEL ,RENEW RH RR DOOR

2 CHARGES TO SPRAY PAINTING SAME Mew 1.000.00 500.00

3 REMOVE AND TRANSFER RH RR DOOR MECHANISM MNew 80.00 80.00

4 APPLY SEALANT TO RH RR DOOR New 100.00 100.00

Gross Labour Cost (S55) 2,350.00 1,070.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. _I

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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