Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 10:34 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Ong Shiying; Lina Pang

Subject: RE: Your Ref. SKG 9061Y - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB 9527Y AND SKG

9061Y ON 25/01/2020 - LKK REF CCB/LPC20001662/Uha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic,
We are pleased to accept your offer of § 9,562.00 for my client’s vehicle property claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Jasan Tang

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

lason@fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal Injury claim [If any) of the owner/
claimant.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto,com)

Sent: Wednesday, March 4, 2020 9:17 AM

To: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Ong Shiying
<shlying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: Your Ref: SKG 9061Y - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKB 9527Y AND 5KG S061Y ON 25/01/2020 - LKK REF
CC6/LPC20001662/Uha3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jasan,
We refer further to our below email and we confirmed in receipt of your LOD and video footage.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’'s mandate and we offer below amount to settle your client’s claim.

Cost of Repair (w/gst) 5 8,560.00



Loss of Rental (5100 x 10 days) $ 1,000.00
GIA SE rch FI‘.‘E

1
(1

(LKK) for

if agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward the original signed ha
payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on @ without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of llability on our part or on the part of our insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made In respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settiement arising from this offer
in any other reloted matters,

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhbi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

i

== Save the Farth- Print only when necessary

This e-mall conlain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,



Vie !LKKAutn]

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 8:10 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5KB9527Y (Ol : LPC -

TBA) AND SKG9061Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC20001662/Uha3) on 25/01/2020 -
Oref: 19/20/20/VP05/022966 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic

Please proceed as per your recommendations.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

= The all {¥&%) lonpac.com.sg

—
g =

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto,com>

Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 10:33 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE=> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKB9527Y (Ol : LPC - TBA)
AND SKG9061Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC20001662/Uha3) on 25/01/2020 [External Confidential]

Your Ref: TBA
Our Ref: CCo/LPC20001662/Uhal

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES S5KB 9527Y (OI) AND SKG 9061Y (TP) ON 25/01/2020

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 3™ February 2020 of Third-Party’s request to do
Direct Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that Insured vehicle rear-ended the TP vehicle,
As such, in view of the MCF and BOLA scenario 27, liability 1s not to our Insured’s favour and we have to

settle the claim from the TP vehicle.
1



We propose to offer to TP repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) 520,722.69 5 B,560.00
Loss of Rental (5180 x 16 days) 5 2,880.00 % 1,000.00 {5100 % 10 days)
GIA Search Fee 52.00 52.00 L |
TOTAL [$2360469 |s956200

TP VEHICLE DETAILS:
MARKET VALUE : $41,500.00 (est)
LTA REBATE : §33,219.00 (est)
NETT VALUE : § 8,281.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Qur surveyor's recommended days to repair 7 days
Weekends / Downtime 3 days
TOTAL | 10 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank vou.
Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2096 | emall: vicalpeh@lkkauto. | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4085933)

MH == Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient.
Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe
that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the
e-mail and all attachments, mcluding any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-
mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 February, 2020 5:43 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto), MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKB9527Y (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND SKG9061Y (TP :

LKK REF - CC6/LPC20001662/Uha3) on 25/01/2020 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,

We refer further to our below email.



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405/ 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Dhate 13.02.2020

Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road

#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn: Mator Claim Departmient

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES : SKG 9061Y / SKB 9527Y ON 25.01.2020

We ure the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SKG9061Y |, which was involved
in the captioned accidem with your insured vehicle no: SKB9527Y . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of vour insured driving. we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalfl of the owner/claimant.

11 Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) £ £,560.00

2y Loss of Rental 5 2,880.00

31 GIA Search Fee b 2.00
5 11,442.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents (o support the claims

i) Final Repair Invoice by Car Remal Invoice / Agreement

¢) GIA Search Result d) Letter of Autherisation, elc...

e) GIA Repon f) 1/C & Drniving Licence

g) Insurance Centificate h) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
s soon as possible,

Flease note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be withour prejudice 1o
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant,

Thank you.

Y ours faithfully,

Jason Tang {jasun[{]‘:fns:cchqum;;:nm.sgl
For Fastech Auto Pre Lid



DATE  : (5. 02 2020

TO :lonpae  Trauvonce  BHD

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. _ SKG 9061 | Qkp A3

ALONG _CTE_ (viter \ane) Towards Yo Chu Vang Bad

ON 5.0V 7420

I'We., Lion  Nowowi

of (NRIC No./ROC No.) SI430095 ]

of _Blk \6 (nrdonment Reod & I1-83 Singapore k530

owner of vehicle no. S8 9oLl in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle  SKG G06! Y at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTI to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,

ete. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me'us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I'We further agree and undertake 1o indemnity them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner %’%

Name of Owner Lion  Mowauwj.




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

"o This nhm, Voucher &

¥ ir e

or his prope fimay ilf |I|“ i wist .IIuL'II_IIII-Th “;;:1.':.I:;:I
|-|,r.-..| 1 h.l e b Slarmon 3 loier duie
Further. the settlement terms herein hould not be geed g0 an
CLAIM NO  : 19/20/20/VP05/022966 ik gt e raseey ovget
DATE - (4 MARCH 2020 whectmutorin Wisoction. L

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, LION NAWAWI confirmed acceplance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of SKB 9527Y the sum of Singapore Dollars Nine Thousand
Five Hundred Sixty Two Only (§9,.562.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation
and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or
hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident 1o

my vehicle, SKG 9061Y  on 25 JANUARY 2020 along CTE_TOWARDS YIO
CHU KANG ROAD.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (CHANDRAN SASIKANTH /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any cluims whatsoever made
by uny person/persons on our behall in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authonze you to pay the above settlement sum directly o M/S
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

I/'We herchy acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice 1o all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Lronl N@Jm’ ,f,r/_g/w

Namc nf 1n.ch:-::lt': OWnel .I’D.uc



TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice : 21684
Lonpac Insurance BHD

300 Beach Road Date 05.02.2020
#17-04/07 The Concourse Vehicle No  SKG9061Y
Singapore 199555 Make'Model PEUGEOT 5008 1.6
ChussisEng#
Attn : Motor Claim Department Accident Date  25.01.2020
Claim Mo 0120 -21684
Reference
Folicy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair b RO00.00
E.&0O.E. Total : S§% 8000.00
GST @ 7% : 58 560.00
Amount Due =SS 8560.00

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD




- Dynamic Car

Rental

! KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6. #01-464850 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. No. 52928467K

HENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

No. 21130
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DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520 / 6746 5786

Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: LION NAWAWI [nvoice : DCR-2020-02-01

Date : 13.02.2020
Agreement No : 21180
Payment Terms : LOD

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SIR 7314K ( 0120-21684 ) S 2,880.00
Rental Period from  28.01.2020 to 13.02.2020
E.&0.E. fotal S 2,880.00
SHI YING

for Dynamic Car Rental



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
§ Ralfles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
IHSIH’AHCE Fhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax +E5 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Oparating Hours: Monday 10 Friday 8am to Spm
GST Registration No; MA00017TT35

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Na: GR-20-015203

Date of Reguest; 2810172020 Your Rel No; Onlme Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pta Lid
1 Kaki Bukil Avenue B #01-38
AutoBayiDKakl Bukit

Singapore 417883

Deaar Sur/Madam,

Enquiry Dale 2Bi01/2020

Engquiry By Jason Tang Jun Zhong

TP Vehcie No. SHBASETY

Accident Daw 250172020
L

iche Na. Insurar Period af Insurance Irsurer Tel. Mo

SKBas2TY Lonpac Insurance Bhd AN 02016-30M 042020 +65 62507388
Thank Yo

This images proviced 10 you are mken from e onginal reports forwaraed 10 the centre by fhe member of the General insurence Assocalion of Singapors and we ke no
reapanaibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under o Bability whatsosver for any kass or damage arsing oul of or In connaction with the reports o thesr images

This is m computer generated docurnent and requires no signatura



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Singapore D4B580

B Raffles Quay #18-00,
mE Phome: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 B224 0030
ASSDCLATION Operating Hours: Monday (o Friday 8am 1o 5pm

GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref No: GR-20-015203
Dame of Request: ZRM1 2020 Your Ref No: Cnline Purmhase
Kirm Chwesa Aulo Fie Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #071-48
AutoBay@Kakl Bukil
Singapore 417883
Dear SirMadom,
Enquiry Date 2RI01/2020
Enguiry By diason Tang Jun Zhong
TP Vihicle No, SKBASZTY
Accident Dae 25012020
qgcmmnm AMOUNT (5%) .
17 Insurer Enguiry 1.87)
GST Amount 0.13]
Total Arnount Due (GST Inclusiva) 2.00|

Thank You.

This is & compuier generalad document and requirnes no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date
[¥] GIRC [] Cash [ | Cheque



