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+«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING el —

N ! p— signed | Adi et I . ™ —
| Tan Jan 2020 |
Main 30 Jan 2020 | 10149 | New Assignment

Clalm Datalls Documents

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by insurer]
linsured: B - =

Main 1 s -
| Clsimant: “HH#T BIN ISMAIL, [D: 511007738

|5Huﬁit4x Date of Loss:  21/01/2020 09:00 - -

Folicy/Cover
‘Note Ma.:

Palicy No.
| {(Clairmant)

| Excess: 550.00

Elite Automotive Ple Ltd {HQ) 280 Woadlands | Industrial Park E5, #01-17, Harvest@Woodiands, 757322 Woodiands - Tel: 9388
| 2BB5/B136 4741/63397378

OMPCSN14393319055

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. l.m. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 .., [Hondied by Chong Boon Sen)
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 10/02/2020]
Direst Settlement | Insured reversed and collided onto )

IAHUEIATED nm RECEIVED
Thumarnm mail for this case.

View All | l:nrruuc.mmull

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS ~
Due Dale Princity Task Geoawg Subsject
| No results.

Vigw All | Searcn Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |
By Campiated Dn Created On Done?




* Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotivel3@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March, 2020 9:41 AM

To: Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Pending Finalise For Vehicle No: SML 2684X
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Sun Pin,

Good day! We accept the offer. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy
On Mon, 9 Mar 2020 at 17:51. Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Christy,

Kindly refer the finalize amount is $1,550. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst).

If agree please update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Cansultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Emall- Sunpin@®@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
1



L

Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#

From: Cecilia Low <cecilialow@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 January 2020 10:34 AM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc Elite Automaotive; Claims Dept of CTl; Chong Boon Sen

Subject: RE: OUR REF- SNM20D200462/SFM9B69L/CBS & YOUR REF: SML26B4X -PRS -
Accident Involving Of Vehicle No: SML 2684X & SFM 98691

Attachments: 2901202013345 1.pdf

Dear Sirs

Please attend to the PRI request on Direct Settlement basis, with the number of days for Loss of Use/Rental to be
agreed.
Thank you.

Cecilia Low (Ms)
Senior Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: {65) 6382 6530 | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AW, Taiping SG

Disciaimer This s-mail and any filas fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information, Any
unautharizad disclosure. Lse or dissemination of thiz messags, pither in whole or partinl, is prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent, please
notify the sander immediately. Please deleto the e-mail and any copies of it therealter,

From: Elite Automotive [mallto:elite.automotive13@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 30 January 2020 10:24 AM

To: Cecilia Low <cecilia.low@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM20D200462/5FM9869L/CBS & YOUR REF: SML2684X -PRS -Accident Involving Of Vehicle
No: SML 26B4X & SFM 9B69L

Hi Cecilin.

Good day! We noted that your emailed and agreed to appoint Xing Quo Qiang, please advise liability on
this case. Thanks!

Regards,



Christy
‘Elite Automotive Pte Ltd

63397378

On Thu, 30 Jan 2020 at 10:18, Cecilia Low ([@sg.cnlaiping.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Christy

We refer to your email of 29 January 2020.

Kindly note the following;

1. We would like to conduct pre-repair survey of the vehicle at the appointed workshop.

2. We propose the following list of surveyors to be nominated as the Single Joint Expert to conduct
survey of the claimant’s vehicle:

1. Adrian Ling 6. Kenneth Kong
2. Kelvin Ang 7. Simon Ho

3. See Chew Seng 8. Chua Weijie
4. Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman 9. Marcus Chua
3. Xing Quo Qiang 10. Henry Ng

3. If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that
the surveyor appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

4. As per the NIMA Protocol, the survey by our appointed surveyor would include survey of your vehicle
pre-repair, after it is dismantled, and post repairs. Hence, you need to provide us/our surveyors with
the list of items that were damaged and required 1o be replaced or repaired to facilitate an effective
survey.

3. As stated above, please inform us and our surveyor after the claimant’s vehicle had been repaired so
that our surveyor can carry out post repair inspection before the vehicle is returned to your client.
Please co-ordinate with our surveyor immediately after the repair is completed.

2



Thank you.

Cecilia Low (Ms)
Senior Executive

Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 6389 6530 | F:(65) 6222 1033

W: www.so.cntaiping com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A F$idk Taiping
SG

Disclaimer. This e-manl and any files transmilled with it is intendad anly for the named reciplents and may contain confidential information, Any
unauthorized disciosure, use or dissemination of Hhis message, either in whole or partial, fs prohibited. If you are nat the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immedialely. Flsase delate the s-mail and any copies of if thoreafler

From: Elite Automotive <glite.automotivel 3@omail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 1:37 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdeptia sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Accident Involving Of Vehicle No: SML 2684X & SFM 98691

Hi,



Good day! Kindly refer to attached and please arrange PRI for vehicle no: SML 2684X. Please advise
liability on this case. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

Elite Automotive Pte L1d

63397378

Regards,



ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

280 Woodlands Indusirial Park E5 #01-17. Harvest@Woodiands §(757322)
TEL . 83367378/86606722 FAX '@ 63397475

Date : Pre-repair Inspection

M/s China Taiping Insurance (Singapore] Pte Ltd By Fax 6224 7478 Only
3 ANSON ROAD

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

Singapore 079909

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING _ SmbL 2688x |\ €fim ?EL‘?L“,\ 1l ll“‘“.oﬂ‘]ﬂi

We reler 1o the sbove matter
We are the appoinited repair workshiop ofvehicle ne SmlL }_‘8_”""‘
We understand thar you are the incures chicleno gF‘“‘iEL& N

Ihe owner of vehiicle no EMLEH"PK Has authorised ue to carry out the repairs 1o his
vehicle which was damaged by your insured’s vehicle. The owner mrends 1o make a elafin
againty you insured and/or insured'c 4y horised driver for the accident which is caused

wholly and/or cantributed by your insured and/or your msured's autharised driver's negligence.
We hL'I!:b'} gnve van nutice of the a il ol an i --l1..||;j1:, i mspect the danmgcd to the
vehicle priorto the commencement 1 11, YPaire

Kindly take note thJ: we hereby give yuu 2 davs notice 1o conduet 2 pre-repair fnspection of
vehicle no_ M 1’“ SV predmses

Vour faithiully




MEAMZDO 0T TE | Elte AM Pr Lid - MO
ENTRY DATE & TIVE- 21013020 181
SUBMITTED BY Zachary Lirn En Ml

&
IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

! Flsass report correclly the dstails of the acodent 1o speed LD tha claims process
2. This Form must be complated by the Palicyholder andior the Authorised Driver

3, information provided must be a3 trulhful and accurale as possible, Any willul misrepresantation or witholding of material 'acis may aliow nsurENCE companies 1o

repudiats poicy katulily

d The issuss and acceplance of this Farm by insurance companias 8 nol an admission of policy labiity on the part of the ingiiance companss

5 Any talse reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

& This report will be forwarded by the msurers of the GIA Recards Management Centre established by the Ganeral Insurancs Association of Sngapore (GIA] for
mrchiving and thal copses ol inia report will for a fea. be mace avalabie unon apphcation by interestied parties
T. By the lodgament gf Iris repor 1o Fie meurers. you hereby consent 1o The archiiving af This repor™ @l the centre Bnd 1o cop=es of the repon bamng made avalable

mforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Locatlon Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

21/01/2020 18:21
21/01/2020 09:25

ALONG TEMBELING ROAD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vahicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
MName Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Altermative Fhane No
Vehicle Particulars
Marnufacturer

Maodal

SML2E84 X

RAHMAT BIN ISMAIL
SXXXXTTIB

NURAISHAH ABDRAHMAN@DGMAIL.COM

[LOCAL) +65-B6669094
OFFICE-86662054

TOYOTA,
WISH-1.8 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was belng used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy

for repair to yaur vehicle?
If No, Please state action lo be laken
Vehicle Calegory
Insurance Company
MName of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Palicy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

Mame ol Dnver

MNRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupatian

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Expariance
Gender

Mobile Numbaear

Fax Number

Contacl Number

EMail Address

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NOD

GA4TOT13N

NURAISHAH BINTE ABDUL RAHMAN

SXXXXB3IF

0Ar11/198a

INDOOR

28/08/2013

B YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +B5-86669094

NURAISHAH ABDRAHMAN@GMAIL.COM

Pags 1 of 23



765 BEDOK RESERVOIR VIEW
Address #07-250

Postcode . 470765
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured RELATIVE

Vehicle Registration Number of Dnver's Own -
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface WET
Other Infermation

Was any foreign vehicla invalved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vahicla) 2
invalved in the accident

Was any body Injured in the Accident? ND
Was any injured conveyed 10 hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or properly damaged? NOD

| have been approached by unknown personis) ND
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance

Number of Passengars (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the palice? ND

If Yes,Plaase state which Police Statian

Was nolice of intended Prosecution given? ND

Il Yes, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

(PLEASE REFER TO THE RELEVANT DOCUMENTS ATTACHED)
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video capiured by Car Cameara? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NOD

Vehicle Registration Mumber SFMB8E9L

Vehicle MakeModel/Colour LEXUS RXZTD AUTO SPORT
Detalls Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Driver
MRIC/Passport Number
Contact Numbear

Address

Posticode

Insurance Company Nama
Nature Of Damage

MNo. Of Passanger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 23
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Accident Sketch Plan 2

vt

[ ES0UBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT {rasd Joe r...;-w-'-‘

I T I L S Tombetn Boad, Cow olatt number SEM| T Es
(Lot Wik cow  Jag © B o PR A LA WA er.a e
__e_-d'nq blﬂt'll'ﬁh-‘ H-'nq_ T4 wms = e m_;_i-nd r—

10 marve omt {-'{-.- Fringep Ve hidn d  nohre Werd oy
Q_Lii“‘l»' WE Dbt ks cme  PA e ewucew he W+ M,
it Srdde  bumpers YR mm f et e ger el
Siratches eoel dunt Cbalow e M*-_j_;*‘} bhe Ceab ek R Abe
O amd ﬂbk_g.c_hvl.i od dee J—m-r- Tre =“Muy car was furf{E
seaiches TED or bis @fF paskw veow whalg Alle. Mok ba

and porve off dowmedt  Jow (boar

o

Cinr

Prsca

DECLARATION

B g e L T o e o S -

1 _iltt"y , M
m&w_ l.‘lﬂll"; v ;.-r-.r‘tmmw

el e W Sevepr 4 Scil tha porparele e,
D, N “irna LU NS

Paged ot )



.
. » Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.

Vehicle to be Exported
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicie Malke:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
ttanufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis No..

Maximum Power Output:
Opon Market Value

Original Registration Date
First Registration Date:
Tranafer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibil lty Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category

COE Period(Years}

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

vehiclke reaches its statutory litespan (if applicablel, whichever s earfier

Tha infarmation contained herein is correct as at 21 Jan 2020

OK

Singapore NRIC
7738

SMLIGBAN

MNe

21 Jan 2020
TOYOTA

WISH 18 A
Silver

2004
1722637504
IME1003156856
970 kW (130 bhp)
£188238.00

22 Sep 2006

22 5ep 2006

1

$20.722.00

Forfelted

$0.00

215ep 2021

B-Car [18601cc & above)

5
52841800
$9.472.00
$9.472.00
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17,
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SML 2684X
Vehicle Model : TOYOTA WISH
Chassis Number : ZNE1003 16856

Estimated Repair Cost

S/N Parts Description Oty List Price
|  FRONT BUMPER / np 1 % 481.90
2 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS ¢ m™N2¢ . 10 % 55.00
3 FRONT BUMPER RETAINERRHS 7 CRA 1S 121.35
4  FRONT BUMPER SIDE COVER RHS . .~ (Rw. 1 8 131.40
5 FRONT RHS FENDER W &v< R T ¥ 571.45
6 FRONT RHS SPLASH SHIELD X fv€ . ¥ 231.35
7 FRONT RHS SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS x §fve 10 S 35.00
8  RHS HEADLAMP S, 1§ 971.70
9 RHS HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET 7 ¥ TV . * 121.10

$ 2740.25
Discount Less 25% § 685.07
List Prices Total 5 2.055.18

Page1lof 2



ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5, #01-17,
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SML 2684X
Vehicle Model : TOYOTA WISH
Chassis Number :ZNE1003 16856

SN Labour Descriptions Charges
1  LABOLUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & INSTALL FRONT & S 1500.00 5 o
FRONT RHS END ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO 206
ENABLE REPAIR; TO REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS AS
LISTED ABOVE.
2 TOSPRAY PAINTING ON FRONI BUMPER. FRONT RHS 3 1200.00 2.2
FENDER. foq

Tad

TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS & LIGHTS FUNCTION, S 150.00 3 ¢y
INCLUSIVE FOCUS HEADLIGHT.

4 CHECK & CLEAR FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY $ 280,00 X
ACCIDENT REPAIRS.

_’? Labour Total § 3130.00

:Q'\b\ Parts & Labour Total § 51R5.18

Repait” oy = 2, elay s

Lul"’]f’ Sum Rﬂ’lﬂ‘
Affor pui- d;l-uf'.H

g!.m Frn CL'F“l‘>
®4/or [2020
TF Lrthow! Pfij“d*""r- _

Page 2 0of 2
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5, #01-17,
Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SML 2684X
Vehicle Model : TOYOTA WISH

Chassis Number : ZNE100316856 Estimated Repair Cost
S'N Parts Description Oy List Price
|  FRONT BUMPER s np 1 $ 481.90 .7
3 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS ¢ N2¢C 0% 55.00 10
3 FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RHS na - 121.35 5.5
1 FRONT BUMPER SIDE COVER RHS | » / (R4 1S 131405 65,0
5 FRONT RHS FENDER ¥ sve N 371.45x
6 FRONT RHS SPLASH SHIELD X £~ 1 S 231354
7 FRONT RHS SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS x §fvc 8 55.00x
§  RHS HEADLAMP <~ S, 1% 971.70 $11. %
9 RHS HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET 7 X fvC. (Y 121.10%
Add
#. Front Bumpir gpille . \J 110,21 5 2740.25
Discount Less 25% § H85.07
List Prices Total 5 203518
ff‘r T1&.y7
e T P'_I‘ ll-b
P= lIn.32

Page 1of 2
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17,
Harvest @ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475
Vehicle Number : SML 2684X

Vehicle Model : TOYOTA WISH
Chassis Number :ZNE1003 168356

SN Labour Descriptions Charges

1 LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & INSTALL FRONT & 5 1500.00 %oT

FRONT RHS END ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO U0,

ENABLE REPAIR: TO REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS AS

LISTED ABOVE.
2 TOSPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT BUMPER. FRONT RHS S 120000 &

FENDER. Fue.
3 TOCHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS & LIGHTS FUNCTION. S 150.00 3 ¢

INCLUSIVE FOCUS HEADLIGHT.
4 CHECK & CLEAR FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY S 280.00 X

ACCIDENT REPAIRS

Labour Total § 313000 110
A  Parts & Labour Total 8 5185.18
-
Repair dley = 2, elays & X
!
J_uw S qunr 4 _,IIF]-}:I
! L= S50
After puid d:\wﬁ, ——
HIS 0k G108 -bb
- 207,
]
Sun Fl“ (L) —_—
wl/or 2020 J_,h?!.[{é_

B

T worthou! Frcj"d~"".

' f!ujl
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5, #01-17,

Harvest @ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SML 2684X
Vehicle Model : TOYOTA WISH
Chassis Number : ZNE100316856

Estimated Repair Cost

(Supplementary)
SIN Parts Description Quy List Price
| FRONT GRILLE 7 CRU I 15130 116,21
5 151.30
Discount Less 25% § 37.83
List Prices Total £ 113.48

Page 1of1



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Notified Est Submitted Ad) Assigned Adj Rot Ad] Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
30 Jan 2020 Pending for Survey
Main |30 Jan 2020 10:49 £$1,550.00 ul.ssu.nlli R
Bt Adj Rpe | | o Eatimates J | e a Cancel Cave |

Claim Details
CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS i[Crﬂhd by Insurer] |
Insured: =, Co.Reg. No.: -

Main .
Claimant: RAHMAT BIN ISMAIL, [D: 5110077308

Vehicle Reg. 21/01/2020 09:00 - :59
No.: SML2684X Date of LosE: |1y g Months and 30 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

Claim Type: | TP / SNM20D200462 Policy/Cover | pupecn 14393319055

Note Na.:
VEHCN -Red, Peilley Mo
No. SFHMIBE9L (Claimant):
{Insured):
Excess: 5%0.00

R . Elite Automotive Pte Ltd (HQ) 280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17, Harvest@'Woodlands, T57322 woodlands - Tal: 9388
ctlina 2BBS/8136 4741/63197378

;:T;.':'_“ China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd, (HQ) - Tel 6389 6111 .. [Handled by Chong Boon Sen)

A juster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (MQ) - Tei: 6256-3561 __ [Handled by OF SUN PIN] . [Final Rpt due 10/02/2020]

Ad) Asg.
B Direct Settlement (Insured reversed and collided onta TR)

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wimw Al I Compose Case Mail J
There are na mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— view Al | Swarcn Tasks | Create Wew Task | compiete |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
Mo resuits

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 25/3/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*SML2684X (SNM2I0D200462)
[SFM9B6IL]
TP

RAHMAT BIN ISMAIL
Jan 21 2020 9:00AM

Elite Automotive Pte Ltd

Upload Documments | upisad protos | Compose New Letter | View [View in Browser | v |
Photos/Images. - 3 per page__ V]|
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 |10/02/20 05:42 | Chassls Number D | oades | A
2 |10/02/2009:42 | Odometer Reading | leades | (A
3 10/02720 05:47 | Genersl View O | leaaws | A
4 |10/02/20 09:42 | Genersl View D | tmaws | A
5 |10/02/20 09:42 General View D | oeows | BF
& |10/02/20 09:42 | General View D | stws | 4
7 |10/02/20 09:42 | General View 0O | Load s
B |10/02/20 09:42 | General View 0| waws | A
5 |10/02/20 09:42 | General View D | tadies | A
10 [10/02/20 05:42 | General View 0| wears | B
11 [10/02/20 09:42 | General View O | wedws | A
12 |10/02/20 09:42 | General View O | todwrs | 4
13 [10/02/20 09:42 | General View 0 | lceawc | A
14 |10/02/20 09:42 General View 0| eaws | A
15 |10/02/20 09:42 Ganaral View g Load PG | BA
16 | 10/02/20 09:42 | General View 0| loadec | A
17 |10/02/20 09:42 | General View 0 | ivadiec | BA
18 |10/02/20 09:42 | General View 0| cadrs | A
19 |10/02/20 09:42 | General View D | s | 4
20 | 1y02/20 09:47 | General View D | Leadiec
21 |10/02/20 09:43 Reinspection Photo 0| oadies | 4
22 |10j02/20 09:43 | Relnspection Photo 0| reowc | B
23 |10/02/20 09:43 Relnspection Pheta 0| ladtec | A
24 |10/03/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo O ors | 2
25 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Phato @ | icawG | B
26 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Phato 0 | Load s
27 | 10y02/20 09:43 Reinspection Phota 0D | loadies
28 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo 0 | ladies | BB
20 |10/02/20 09:43 Relnspection Phato @ | toeaws | B
a0 |1o/02/20 09:43 Reinspection Photo 0| loadres | A
31 |10/02/20 09:43 | Relnspection Photo 0| teawrs | A
32 | 10/02/20 D343 Reinspection Photo 0| coaws | A
33 | 16/02/20 0943 | Relnspection Photo i Load 3G | A
34 |10/02/20 05:43 | Reinspection Photo O | oadiwc | A
35 |10/02/20 08:43 | Reinspection Photo 0| owaws | &
35 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Phota O | eears | A
37 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo D | cedwc | A

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 25/3/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2
Photos/Images dperpage  [v]| M
%o |Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
38 | 10/02/20 09:413 Reinspection Photo Load PG E
3% |10/02/20 09:43 Reinspection Photo | oadwe | A
40 [10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo O | adwc | A
41 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Phote O | cuwws | 4
47 |10/02/20 09:43 | Relnspection Photo © | oeds | B
43 |10/02/20 09:43 Reinspection Photo 0O | wws | A
44 [10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo ® | wasws | A
45 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo O | wows | @
46 | 10/02/20 09:43 | Relnspection Photo 0 | oadirs | A
47 |10/02/20 09:43 | Reinspection Photo 0 | s | A
48 |10/02/20 05:43 | Reinspection Photo © | taows |
49 |12/03/2009:58 | After Repalr Photo 0 s | B
50 [12/03/20 09:58 | After Repair Photo D | wadwc | A
51 |12/03/20 09:58 | After Repalr Photo 0 | tceaes | B
52 |12/03/2006:58 | After Repair Photo D | wowrs | A

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | save | prmt |

There are no document checklists configurad.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: O Handling Insurer
Motw: Barndrsd brd POvEDE uESE yOou EN0w it to oI parTe

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 25/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreq Mo 1ssso7108m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sunf@lkkauto com;assignments@@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CSICTI2Z0001589/0YD3E2

Date: 25032020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: mt;““’*“g Insurance (Singapare) p,. o DMPCSN14393318055
ﬁﬂ“""‘ Vehicle ;) 2884x "';:“"" Vehicle orpoasalL
Date of Loss:  21/01/2020 Nature of Claim: TP M SNM20D200462
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMLZ684X
Make & Model: TOYOTA WISH. 1.8 (A) Engine No; 1222637504
Reg. Date: 22/08/20068 (Man. Year: 2006) Chassis No: ZNE100316856
Colour: Silver Odometer: 183162 km
Engine Capacity: 1794 cc
Market ValuaM™ew Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured (S§): Markel Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification Na  Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/85 R15
Fronl Left Side: Linglong 5 mm Rear Left Side: Linglong 5 mm
Front Right Side: Linglong 5§ mm Rear Right Side Linglong 5 mm
The above vaiuses represant (he remaining fyre treads depth
|GDST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %)
Parts 2,168.66 1.183.81 984 85 45 41
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,130.00 730.00 2.400.00 76.68
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 5,298.66 1,913.81 3,384.85 63.88
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,550.00
(58) 5,298.66 1,550.00 3,748.88 70.75
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%5) 370.91 108.50 262 41 70.75
Nett Amount (5§) 5,669.57 1,658.50 4,011.07 T70.75
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 30/01/2020
Date Inspected: 04/02/2020 Inspected At Elite Automotive Pte Ltd (HQ)
2B0 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17,
Harvesti@Woodlands
Singapore 757322
Estimated Pericd of Repair; 3.0 days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 25/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: Ol SUN PIN Manager: YVONNE WONG YIN CHENG

NOTE: This report represents our findings ar Ma fime and place of inspection smied heren, Such inspechion s been camed out fo fhe bdest of our
Inowledge and abiity but sy other lishiity under any other circumstances 3 herby arprassly sroiuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 25/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 25 Mar 2020)

Parts: M1-MPV TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SML2684X)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker an the last estimate page

Further Infa: llemsivalues nol in reference catalogue are prefived with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Dented 481.00FL *48180FL
2 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 5500FL *30.00 FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER RETAINER RHS Cracked 121.35FL *58.50 FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE COVER RHS Cracked 131.40FL *80.00 FL
5 1 *FRONT RHS SPLASH SHIELD Serviceable 231.35FL “FL
B 10 *FRONT RHS SPLASH SHIELD CLIPS Serviceable 55.00 FL *-FL
7 1 "RHS HEADLAMP Scratched 871.70FL *817.80FL
B 1 *RHS HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET Serviceable 121.10FL *FL
g i *FRONT GRILLE Crumpled 151.30FL *110.22FL
0 1 *FRONT RHS FENDER Serviceable | Repair 571.45FL ~FL

F=Franchise part. LalistemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 2,891.55 1,578.42
= List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S%) 722.88 384 61

Total Parts (S§) 2,168.66 1,183.81

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 25/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & INSTALL FRONT & New 1.500.00 300.00

FRONT RHS END ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO ENABLE
REPAIR; TO REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS AS LISTED ABOVE

2 TOSPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT BUMPER, FRONT RHS MNew 1.200.00 400.00
FENDER

3  TOCHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS & LIGHTS FUNCTION, New 150.00 30.00
INCLUSIVE FOCUS HEADLIGHT

4 CHECK & CLEAR FAULT CODES AFTER NECESSARY New 28000 0.00

ACCIDENT REPAIRS

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 3,130.00 730.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out, ]

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 25/3/2020



