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S1UBIAVE |, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAR JRE 05933 TEL : (465: 62363561 FAX : (63] H2364 315

Your ref: CMTD2000392/AGC

Our ref: CS/SMO20001581/Dvd3

The Motor Claims Department

Date:31/1/2020

M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SHC 8028H

We thank you for your instruction on

29/1/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

30/1/2020 at the premises of M/s

and ahve the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" ltems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Yours faithfully,

Bryan Ang
Motor Surveyor / Investigator

BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

: 5521,418.41

: §513,990.59

1 8%

;8%

5%

5%




" Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 31 January 2020 4:58 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace”: SUR; ‘Chan, Shu Hui Agnes’

Cc 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; "Henry, Irene James'

Subject: RE: CMTD2000392/AGC - LKK/ YN4TB1R & SHC8028H ACC on 21.01.2020
Attachments: SHC 8028H PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Agnes,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHC 8028H
Date of survey: 30/1/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,

Vveron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 January 2020 3:36 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg=;
'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg=>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000392/AGC - LKK/ YN4761R & SHCB028H ACCon 21.01.2020

Dear Sirf/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

u Wiihjn! you a Happy ana Frosperous Lunar New Yegr -

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com SE]
sent: Wednesday, 29 January 2020 2:45 PM



To: Claims Dept; 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com’; 'assignments@lkka uto.com': sur@lkkauto.com
Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Regina; Assessment; Ms Lim: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene lames
Subject: CMTD2000392/AGC - LKK/ YN4761R & SHC8028H ACC on 21.01.2020

Our Reference: CMTD2000392/AGC
Your Reference: SHCB028H

Without Prejudice
Date: 29/01,/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ms Lee,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN4761R & SHC8028H ON 21.01.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SHC8028H on a without prejudice and any
admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 327/
agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg .

Please revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Agnes.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F; 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust
Y INSURANCE |



Eahpc Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

Download now @
LEar Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be uniawiul and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pta, Ltd. may callect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

Erom: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>

sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 2:24 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo(@sompo.cOM.sg>

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg=; Regina <assessment ltc@bifrostauto.com>; Assessment
<claims@bifrostauto.com>; Ms Lim <claims ltm@bifrostauto.com>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
<melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <jirene.henry@sompo.com.sg=

Subject: Re: CMTD2000392/AGC - PRI/ YN4761R & SHC8028H ACC on 21.01.2020

Without Prejudice
Dear Grace

We Selected LKK Auto Consultants.

Ms Lee

Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd

Accident Claims Department

+65 9792 1329 (Mobile)

On Wed, 29 Jan 2020 at 13:58, Teo, Grace <grace.leo(@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference: CMTD2000392/AGC
Your Reference: SHCB028H

Without Prejudice
Date: 25/01/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:



M/S BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ms Leeg,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN4761R & SHC8028H ON 21.01.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 29/01/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 127/
agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer's vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose 1o use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey
Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services limmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@s0mpo.com.sg



@ SOMPO A Century of Trust
P INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Cuick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase?® via Sompo 5G

& App Store

Download now @

1Egr Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Persanal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Claims Dept <claims _ltv@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 12:13 PM
To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg=

Cc: Regina <assessment _ltc@bifrostauto.com=; Assessment <claims@bifrostauto.com>; Ms Lim
<claims Itm@bifrostauto.com=>
Subject: RE: PRS FOR our client’s vehicle SHC 8028 H and your insured's vehicle YN 4761 Ron 21.01.2020

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

wWe refer to the above matter.

We represent our client, Ng Yong Ghee, to notify you of the aforesaid accident involving our client’s vehicle SHC
8028 H and your insured’s vehicle YN 4761 R on 21.01.2020.



please find enclose our client’s GIA report for your necessary action.

This serves as a NOTICE that we are claiming against YN 4761 R for damages, costs and disbursements.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today, your client’s and your intention to conduct a pre-repair survey
of our client's vehicle,

PLEASE LET US HAVE A LIST OF YOUR EXTERNAL SURVEYORS FOR OUR SELECTION AS A SINGLE JOINT EXPERT.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to appoint our own surveyor
and proceed with the necessary repair for our client’s vehicle without further reference to your insured or you.

Premises for the Pre-repair inspection: Blk 9 Sector C #01-42, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, Singapore 575644
Contact Person: Ms Lim / Ms Lee

Contact Email: claims_Itv@bifrostauto.com / claims Itm@bifrostaute.com

VEH IN (Date & Time) . 29/01/2020

PRS ARRANGEMENT (Date & Time] : AS SOON AS POSSIBLE

Kindly cc a copy of this letter to your insured for his/her acknowledgement.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.



To avoid incurrence of any unnecessary cost on both our end, kindly confirm liability status within 7 days
from this to minimize time wastage and incurrence of any unnecessary cost(s) on both our end, we seek
your kind advice, within 7 days working days, on liability status for subject claim, If we do not hear from
you within the stipulated period, we shall proceed with the purchase of your insured GIA report and this
cost or any other cost incurred for confirmation of liability status shall be included in our LOD for
reimbursement purpose.

Thank you.

You can protect our environment. Think before you print.

COMFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail [including any attachments] may contain information that is privileged or confidential,

The sending of this e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it

If wou are not the intended reciplent, please notify the sender immediataly, deleta the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.

Ms Lee

Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd
Accident Claims Department

+65 9792 1329 (Mobile)

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.aVE.Com



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#

From:
Sent:

To:
Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Wednesday, 29 January 2020 2:45 PM

Claims Dept; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com’
sur@lkkauto.com

Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Regina; Assessment; Ms Lim; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry,
Irene James

CMTD2000392/AGC - LKK/ YN4761R & SHC8028H ACC on 21.01.2020

SHC 8028H - GIA Report (1).pdf

Our Reference: CMTD2000392/AGC

Your Reference: SHCB028H

Date: 29/01/2020

Attention:
M/S BIFROST AUTO PTELTD

Dear Ms Lee,

Without Prejudice
EMAIL ONLY

QUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN4761R & SHCE028H ON 21.01.2020

We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,

Please refer to the email below and make the arrangement to survey for SHC8028H on a without prejudice and any

admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Ms. Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 327/

agnes.chan@sompo.Ccom.sg .

Please revert with your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Agnes.

Thank You.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6320 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust
P INSURANCE -

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place. #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Cluick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase’ via Sompo SG

tore Il P> Googee
Download now @ ﬂppﬁ or Goog Pla‘f
LEn

¢ Travel Personal Accident & Home Insurance | # For Travel, Personal Accldent, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the personis} or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unautharised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
if you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in gur Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 2:24 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; Regina <assessment_ltc@bifrostauto.com>; Assessment
<claims@bifrostauto.com>; Ms Lim <claims_ltm @bifrostauto.com>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

<melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg=
Subject: Re: CMTD2000392/AGC - PRI/ YN4761R & SHCB028H ACC on 21.01.2020

Without Prejudice
Dear Grace

We Selected LKK Auto Consultants.

Ms Lee
Bifrost Auto Pte L1d
Accident Claims Department

+63 9792 1329 (Mobile)

On Wed. 29 Jan 2020 at 13:58, Teo, Grace <grace.leo(@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference; CMTD2000392/AGC
Your Reference: SHCE028H



Without Prejudice
Date: 29/01/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Ermail: motorsurvey@sompo.Ccom.5g

Attention:
M/S BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Ms Lee,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN4761R & SHC8028H ON 21.01.2020
We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 29/01/2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Agnes Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 327/
agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng
leffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey(@sompo.coOm.sg

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust
P/ INSURANCE |

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

Download now @ App Store or Google Play

tFar Travel Persanal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure. copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

Erom: Claims Dept <claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 12:13 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Regina <assessment ltc@bifrostauto.com>; Assessment <claims@bifrostauto.com>; Ms Lim
<claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRS FOR our client’s vehicle SHC 8028 H and your insured’s vehicle YN 4761 R on 21.01.2020

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,



We refer to the above matter.

We represent our client, Ng Yong Ghee, to notify you of the aforesaid accident involving our client's vehicle SHC
8028 H and your insured’s vehicle YN 4761 R on 21.01.2020.

Please find enclose our client’s GIA report for your necessary action.

This serves as a NOTICE that we are claiming against YN 4761 R for damages, costs and disbursements.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today, your client’s and your intention to conduct a pre-repair survey
of our client’s vehicle.

PLEASE LET US HAVE A LIST OF YOUR EXTERNAL SURVEYORS FOR OUR SELECTION AS A SINGLE JOINT EXPERT.

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to appoint our own surveyor
and proceed with the necessary repair for our client’s vehicle without further reference to your insured or you.

Premises for the Pre-repair inspection: Blk 9 Sector C #01-42, 5in Ming Industrial Estate, Singapore 575644

Contact Person: Ms Lim / Ms Lee

Contact Email: claims Ity @bifrostauto.com / claims Itm@bifrostauto.com
VEH IN [Date & Time) : 29/01/2020
PRS ARRANGEMENT (Date & Time) - AS SOON AS POSSIBLE



Kindly cc a copy of this letter to your insured for his/her acknowledgement.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.

Ta avoid incurrence of any unnecessary cost on both our end, kindly confirm liability status within 7 days
from this to minimize time wastage and incurrence of any unnecessary cost(s) on both our end, we seek
your kind advice, within 7 days working days, on liability status for subject claim. If we do not hear from
you within the stipulated period, we shall proceed with the purchase of your insured GIA report and this
cost or any other cost incurred for confirmation of liability status shall be included in our LOD for
reimbursement purpose,

Thank you.

You can protect our environment. Think before you print.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail [including any attachments) may contain infermation that is privileged or confidential,
The sending of this e-mail to any persan other than the intended recipient is net a walver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it.
if you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclase its contents,

Ms Lee
Bifrost Auto Pfe Ltd
Accident Claims Department

+65 9792 1329 (Mobile)
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BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO SHC8028H DATE 21-Jan-20
MAKE MERCEDES
MODEL E220
Parts Description/ Labour | Qty | Unit Price Amount
Bumper Assy, Frt 1] $ 1.890.50 | $  1,890.50
Bumper Bracket. Frt/LH/RH 2| § 0500 | % 190.00
Bumper Absorber, Fri/LH/RH 2| 3 20500 | ¥ 590.00
Bumper Side Beam, Fri/LH/RH 2] % 2690 | % 53.80
Bumper Frame. Fri/Centre 1] % 389.00 | $ 389.00
Bumper Frame, FriyLH/RH 1| % 168.00 | % 168.00
Bumper Sponge, Frt/Centre 1| § 285.00 | $ 285.00
Bumper Sponge. Frt/LH/RH 1] § 250.00 | § 250.00
Bumper Sponge Extension . FrtLH/RH v 1] $ 105.00 | § 105.00
Bumper Inner Clip, Irt 1| $ 22.00 | $ 22.00
Headlamp (E6) 2] $ 395700 |8  7.914.00
Head Lamp Bracket (LH/RH) 2| 5 300.00 | $ 600.00
Radiator Top Panel. Frt 1| $ 33050 | § 330.50
Head Lamp Pancl (LH/RH) 2] % 480.00 | § 060.00
Radiator Grille (E6) 1) % 1.220.00 | $  1,220.00
Radiator Grille Star Logo 1 § 170.00 | $ 170.00
Radiator Grille Adjuster Bracket 1| $ 685.70 | § 685.70
Bonnet Assy : 1] § 285060 |5  2.850.60
Bonnet Mercedes Star Logo 1| % 112001 % 112.00
Bonnet Stopper Spring (LH/RE) 2l % IRS.00 | % 770,00
Bonnet Lock Sensor (LH/RH) V] Loy l{,c.“, 0 A 28550 [ § 57100
Bonnet Centre Lock Vb= W50 1 § 95.00 | $ 95.00
Bonnet Lock. Top T R NE 94.00 | § 94.00
Bonnet Lock Lower (2 Pes) Pl E 9200 [$§  184.00
Bonnet Lock Brace Panel 1| % 64.80 | § 64,80
SUB TOTAL 8§  20.564.90
LESS 10% 5 2.056.49
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 18,508.41
Labour Charge _
Panel Beating 1 $ 800.00 | §  -800.00 |-~
Spray Painting Charge 1| % 1.000.00 | §  _1.060.00
Wiring Charge 1| % 150.00 | % L0060
Towing Charges 1] § 50001 % 50.00
Tuff Kote I ST 1| § 120.00 | $ 12600
Remove/Refix Radiator 15hWHU UV HE 90.00 | § 90.00
Remove/Refix Aircon & Refill Gas 1] § 150.00 | 8 150.00
Re-set and Diagnosis 1] % 550,00 | § 550,00
TOTAL LABOUR S 291000 | 5 2,910.00




ESTIMATE TOTAL S 2141841

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appoinied by the insurance company.

N 1399059
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref :  CS/SMO20001581/Dvd3n2

[INAIMARN

50 RAFFLES PLACE

#05-01/06 Date : 16-03-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
iF Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, YN 4T61R Veh. Inspected SHC 8028H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD2000392/SGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEC Assign Date 29/01/2020
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E220 c.c 2143
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WDD2120012B174240 Colour WHITE
Odometer 752088 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/55 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/55 R18 WEST LAKE 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/55R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT OrS PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/01/2020 Inspection Date 30/01/2020
Survey held at BLK 8 SECTOR C #01-42
Repairer ~ BIFROST AUTO PTELTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATEEI NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

E1 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 190607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Moo of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 8028H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {g“ ©)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER ASSY FRT DISTORTED 1,800.50 1,880.50
2|BUMPER BRACKET FRT/LH/RH @$85.00 NOT NECESSARY 190.00 -
2|BUMPER ABSOREER, FRT/LH/RH m@5295.00 NOT NECESSARY 540,00 -
2| BUMPER SIDE BEAM FRT/LH/RH @%26.50 NOT NECESSARY 53.80 -
1|BUMPER FRAME FRT/ICENTRE NOT NECESSARY 389.00 -
1|BUMPER FRAME FRT/LH/RH NOT NECESSARY 168.00 -
1|BUMPER SPONGE, FRT/CENTRE MOT NECESSARY 285.00 -
1|BUMPER SPONGE,FRT/LH/RH NOT MECESSARY 250.00 -
1|BUMPER SPONGE EXTENSION FRT/LH/RH NOT NECESSARY 105.00 -
1|BUMPER INNER CLIP FRT MOT NECESSARY 22.00 -
2|HEADLAMP (EB) @$3957.00 BROKEN / 7.914.00 7.914.00
MOUNTING
BROKEN
5|HEAD LAMP BRACKET (LH/RH) @3%300.00 NOT NECESSARY 600.00
1|RADIATOR TOP PANEL.FRT NOT NECESSARY 330.50 -
2|HEAD LAMP PANEL (LH/RH) @%$480.00 NOT NECESSARY 960.00 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE (EE) CRACKED 1,220.00 1,220.00
1|RADIATOR GRILLE STAR LOGO DISLODGE / 170.00 170.00
BROKEM
1|RADIATOR GRILLE ADJUSTER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 685,70 5
1|BONNET ASSY DENTED 2.850.60 2,850.60
1|BONNET MERCEDES STAR LOGO SERVICEABLE 112.00 -
2|BONNET STOPPER SPRING (LH/RH) @$385.00 NOT NECESSARY 770.00 -
2|BONNET LOCK SENSOR (LH/RH) @$285.50 WOT NECESSARY 571.00 -
1|BONNET CENTRE LOCK NOT NECESSARY 95.00 -
1|BONMNET LOCK, TOP MOT MECESSARY 94.00 -
2|BONNET LOCK LOWER (2PCS) @$92.00 NOT NECESSARY 184.00 4
1|BONMET LOCK BRACE PANEL NOT MECESSARY G480 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,056.49 -1,404.51
18,508.41 12,640.59

Report Ref No. CS/ISMO20001581/Dvd3n2




y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.2 of 2

timate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Es
Qty Sl Workshop (§))|  (8)
LABOUR
PAMNEL BEATING. 800.00 500.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 1,000.00 500.00
WIRING CHARGE. 150.00 30.00
TOWING CHARGES. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TUFF KOTE. 120.00 40,00
REMOVE/REFIX RADIATOR, NOT NECESSARY 90,00 .
REMOVE/REFIX AIRCON & REFILL GAS, NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
RE-SET AND DIAGNOSIS, 550.00 280.00
2,910.00 1,350.00
GRAND TOTAL 21,418.41 13,090.59
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 10,000.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/SMO20001581/Dvd3n2
ANG BRYAN TANI ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor [ Investigator B.Eng,AHSDE.#.HIRTEAMSA.E-A,H,H&TAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapart i made solely for the use and berafit of the Cliant named an the front page of this Report.




